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Economic Developments and Policies

The international economy

The international stage has been dominated in
recent months by the economic and financial crisis in
South-East Asia. The situation gradually worsened in
the countries that had suffered currency and stock
exchange turbulence at the beginning of the summer
(Thailand, Malaysia, Indonesia and the Philippines).
In mid-November the tension spread to South Korea,
and the financial centres of Hong Kong, Singapore
and Taiwan were also affected.

The crisis exposed the fragile side of these
countries’ recent development: investment in sectors
with low profitability or high risk, largely financed
by bank loans, most of them in foreign currency;
rigid pegging of local currencies to the US dollar,
leading to a loss of competitiveness and substantial
balance-of-payments deficits; serious shortcomings
in the banking sector, unmasking the inadequacy of
banking supervision, and in the whole system of
corporate governance.

In January the situation in Indonesia worsened
dramatically, bringing the depreciation of the
currency against the dollar to more than 80 per cent
since the first half of 1997. The rescue packages for
South Korea, Indonesia and Thailand put together by
the International Monetary Fund with the assistance
of the World Bank, the Asian Development Bank and
several countries included plans for macroeconomic
adjustment and restructuring of the financial systems.
Enormous sums in excess of $100 billion were
promised. In order to reinforce these plans, the
cooperation of the international banks in temporarily
maintaining existing loans was sought and obtained;
this has helped to improve the situation in South

Korea, in particular, since mid-January. The fact
that the Hong Kong dollar and the Chinese currency
maintained their parities was decisive in preventing
the spread of the crisis.

The Japanese economy, which was already
shaken by signs of instability in the banking and
financial system, was adversely affected by the crisis
in South-East Asia, owing partly to its close
commercial and financial ties with the region. The
Tokyo stock exchange began to slide last summer and
more recently the yen depreciated sharply against the
dollar; in addition, the last quarter of 1997 saw a fall
in production. The sudden deterioration in economic
conditions and the large exposure towards the
crisis-stricken economies have exacerbated the
difficulties of Japanese banks, whose balance sheets
still show the effects of the bursting of the financial
bubble in the early nineties. The budget policy
pursued last year has proved to be excessively
restrictive. The Government’s programme to
stimulate the economy, which was launched in
mid-December but has not yet been wholly approved
by Parliament, currently envisages measures of the
order of half a percentage point of GDP, which
international organizations consider inadequate. A
plan to support the banking system has also been
approved; it provides for an injection of up to ¥30
trillion of public funds, equal to 6 per cent of GDP.
Monetary policy has remained expansionary against
a background of persistently weak domestic demand
and doubts about the adequacy of fiscal stimulus. The
worsening situation in Japan is of particular concern
on account of the size of the Japanese economy (the
second largest in the world), Japan’s creditor position
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with the rest of the world and the unusual length of the
present period of stagnation. Japan’s economic policy
strategy is a crucial factor in the development of the
crisis in the region. For that reason, it was at the centre
of discussions during the recent G-7 meeting. The
final communiqué expressed the conviction that
recovery from the critical economic situation called
for substantial fiscal stimulus.

The currency and financial markets of the leading
industrial countries were also affected by the Asian
crisis. The dollar has appreciated against all the
leading currencies since the end of October, thanks to
its status as a hedge currency. Fears that the crisis
would cause a slowdown in world growth and the
massive transfers of funds away from that area to the
bond markets of the leading industrial countries
prolonged the decline in nominal long-term yields.
After falling at the end of October, share prices have
recovered in all the leading industrial countries
except Japan.

In the United States and the United Kingdom
activity continued to expand briskly in the second half
of 1997. In continental Europe the recovery gained
strength and in France there were visible signs of a
pick-up in domestic demand.

The external imbalances of the two largest
economies increased further, mainly on account of
the pronounced disparity in the growth of domestic
demand. In the first three quarters of 1997 the current
account deficit of the United States amounted to $160
billion on an annual basis, or about 2.2 per cent of
GDP, while net external debt was close to 12 per cent
of GDP. Japan’s current account surplus for the year
as a whole was just under $95 billion (compared with
$66 billion in 1996), about 2.3 per cent of GDP, so that
the country’s net external creditor position increased
further to about 22.5 per cent of GDP. The current
account surplus of the EU is expected to be around
$90 billion, or about 1.1 per cent of GDP.

In the United States the budget was virtually
balanced for the first time since the beginning of the
seventies, thanks to particularly strong growth. The
majority of EU countries succeeded in reducing their
budget deficits to 3 per cent of GDP, as required for

membership of Economic and Monetary Union
(EMU).

Inflation was brought down further in the leading
industrial countries, reflecting the firm stance of
monetary and budgetary policies and the favourable
trend of labour costs and the international prices of
raw materials. The latter declined sharply in the last
quarter of 1997, partly on account of the Asian crisis;
the price of oil fell from $20 to $15 per barrel between
October and February. In the United States the
twelve-month rate of inflation slowed to 1.7 per cent
in December, giving an average rate of 2.3 per cent for
the year, compared with 2.9 per cent in 1996. In
Germany, Italy and Spain inflation stood at 1.3, 1.6
and 2.0 per cent respectively in January of this year.

Anxieties linked to the Asian crisis have affected
the monetary policies of some of the major industrial
countries, leading to a pause in the tightening of
conditions that had begun in early 1997. Only in the
United Kingdom did the central bank again raise the
base rate, in November, to bring inflation back in line
with the target. In the United States, where short-term
rates came down at the beginning of 1998, the
markets are expecting the present monetary stance to
be maintained in the coming months. As the launch of
EMU approaches, in Europe the convergence of
inflation rates is reflected in that of short and
long-term interest rates. In Italy, Spain and Portugal
the long-term yield differentials vis-à-vis Germany
have narrowed to less than one half of a percentage
point.

The development of the financial crisis in Asia

After the first speculative assaults on the Thai
currency between May and July last year the crisis
spread rapidly to the Philippines, Indonesia and
Malaysia, and also had repercussions on the more
solid newly industrialized economies in the region
(South Korea, Hong Kong, Singapore and Taiwan).
At this point the IMF coordinated the first financial
support measures, which did not, however, prevent
the crisis from deepening and spreading further.
By mid-October the Taiwanese authorities were
also obliged to allow the yuan to fluctuate,
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notwithstanding their substantial reserves of foreign
currency. In the next few days the speculation quickly
shifted to the Hong Kong dollar, causing interest rates
to rise sharply and share prices to plunge. Indonesia
and South Korea also requested assistance from the
international financial community. In mid-December
the situation in Indonesia deteriorated further, owing
partly to the news that the new budget law would not
comply with the objectives agreed with the IMF. At
the end of January the Indonesian Government
announced the establishment of a body to restructure
the banks and the introduction of a state guarantee to
protect depositors; it also ordered a de facto
moratorium on the servicing of the foreign debt of
national enterprises.

The crisis was exacerbated by the high incidence
of illiquidity or insolvency among firms and financial
institutions caused by currency depreciation and the
collapse of share and real estate prices. The fragility
of these countries’ financial systems was revealed.
The assets side of the banks’ balance sheets shows a
concentration of investments in securities and real
estate, often yielding low returns, and loans either to
buy real estate or with real estate as collateral; on the
liabilities side they are weighed down by substantial
short-term foreign debts. These capital structures
are the result of highly risky and rather opaque
operational strategies, which have led to an
inefficient allocation of credit.

In the middle of 1997 the overall gross debt owing
to banks and other non-resident investors amounted
to about 30 per cent of GDP in South Korea,
Indonesia and the Philippines and exceeded 40 per
cent of GDP in Malaysia and Thailand. In Indonesia
and Thailand 90 per cent of the debt was owed to
foreign banks; in South Korea and Malaysia the
proportion was about 70 per cent (Table 1).

At the end of February the exchange rates of the
Philippine peso and the Malaysian ringgit against the
US dollar were respectively 34 and 32 per cent lower
than the average for the first half of 1997; the Korean
won and the Thai baht had lost about 46 per cent and
the Indonesian rupiah 73 per cent. The currencies of
Singapore and Taiwan also depreciated, albeit less
markedly, by about 12 and 14 per cent. The Hong
Kong dollar maintained its parity against the US
dollar. The fall in share prices was equally
impressive, averaging 25 per cent over the same
period. The authorities of these countries increased
interest rates drastically in their attempts to staunch
the outflow of funds (Figure 1).

No reliable estimate of the effects of the crisis on
the area’s output last year is yet available. According
to the latest IMF estimates, which seem optimistic,
growth was less than 1 per cent in Thailand last year,
compared with 6.4 per cent in 1996, and probably
slowed down in Indonesia and the Philippines as well
(Table 2).

Table 1
External debt exposure of certain Asian countries

(billions of dollars, at end--June 1997)

7RZDUGV IRUHLJQ EDQNV ���
�$� ,Q VHFXULWLHV

7RWDO
�$���%�

7RWDO 3HUFHQWDJH FKDQJH 3HUFHQWDJH RI GHEW

,Q VHFXULWLHV
KHOG E\

QRQ�UHVLGHQWV $V D SHUFHQWDJH
,QWHUEDQN
PDUNHW

3HUFHQWDJH FKDQJH
EHWZHHQ HQG�����

DQG HQG�-XQH ���� ���

3HUFHQWDJH RI GHEW
PDWXULQJ

LQ � \HDU RU OHVV

QRQ�UHVLGHQWV
�%� $V D SHUFHQWDJH

RI *'3 ���

6RXWK .RUHD � � � � � ����� ���� ���� ���� ���� ����� ����

3KLOLSSLQHV � � � � � � ���� ��� ����� ���� ��� ���� ����

,QGRQHVLD � � � � � � � ���� ���� ���� ���� ��� ���� ����

0DOD\VLD � � � � � � � � ���� ���� ���� ���� ���� ���� ����

7KDLODQG � � � � � � � � ���� ���� ���� ���� ���� ���� ����

6RXUFHV� 1DWLRQDO EXOOHWLQV� ,0) DQG %,6�
��� %,6 UHSRUWLQJ EDQNV� �� ��� $GMXVWHG IRU H[FKDQJH UDWH FKDQJHV� �� ��� *'3 LQ �����



7+( ,17(51$7,21$/ (&2120<(&2120,& %8//(7,1 � 1R� ��� )(%58$5< ����

�

Table 2
Main economic indicators for certain Asian countries
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Figure 1
Exchange rates, share indices and interest rates

in certain Asian countries
(daily data)
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The substantial shifts in competitiveness
resulting from the depreciation of currencies and the
slowdown in growth have already affected trade
flows. According to IMF estimates, the current
account deficits of South Korea and Thailand already
declined considerably last year, as a result of both
faster growth in exports and a decline in imports.

The solution of the South-East Asian crisis hinges
on the implementation of the programmes agreed
with the IMF and on the debt-restructuring
agreements with foreign banks. The situation
confronting the IMF was uncharacteristic on account
of both the causes of the crisis, which were not strictly
attributable to macroeconomic imbalances, and the
number of countries and private businesses involved.
In these circumstances it was difficult not only to
prepare plans of action but also to set precisely
measurable criteria to be met as a condition for
benefiting from them. While progress in the
macroeconomic sphere is fairly easy to monitor,
albeit less crucial on this particular occasion, it is very
difficult to ensure the implementation and ascertain
the quality of measures to reform the financial
system, the effects of which are slower to emerge.

The programmes drawn up by the IMF envisage
first and foremost distinctly restrictive fiscal and
monetary policies to restore inflows of foreign capital
and strengthen exchange rates. Structural measures in
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the banking and financial sector are also
contemplated. In the immediate future some
insolvent financial institutions will inevitably fail or
be taken over by other resident or foreign
establishments. In the medium term it will be
necessary to ensure greater transparency and
competitiveness in the credit market and strengthen
supervisory systems. Radical reforms in the field of
corporate governance have also been agreed,
particularly with South Korea.

Exchange rates and the financial markets

Following several months of stability, the dollar
again began to appreciate against the German mark
and the yen at the end of October. An important factor
was the worsening of the crisis in South-East Asia and
increased political and military tensions concerning
Iraq, which triggered a massive shift of portfolio
capital towards the US market. At the end of February
the dollar was 3.4 per cent higher in nominal effective
terms than the average for October (Figure 2).

The depreciation of the yen that began in the
second half of 1995 has continued and become more
pronounced in recent months. The yen has been
severely affected by the deterioration of cyclical
conditions associated with the crisis in the region and
by the increasingly difficult situation of the banking
system. Notwithstanding the Bank of Japan’s
intervention to support the currency, in mid-January
it was 9 per cent lower against the dollar than last
October. It recovered slightly in the second half of the
month, following the announcement of additional
measures to support the economy. At the end of
February it showed a nominal effective depreciation
of 1.4 per cent vis-à-vis the currencies of the world’s
leading exporters of manufactures compared with
October. By contrast, on the basis of an effective
exchange rate indicator that also includes the
currencies of other Asian countries with which Japan
has close trading ties (accounting for about 25 per
cent of overall trade), the yen had appreciated by
about 3.5 per cent since October.

In December the German mark also lost ground
against the dollar, falling by up to 4.6 per cent

compared with October. In effective terms, however,
there was no significant change. The ERM currencies
continued to enjoy a period of stability; the Irish punt,
which had appreciated strongly last year, also joined
the general trend towards convergence (Figure 3).
Sterling appreciated against the mark until the end of
the year, emulating the dollar, but the waning of
expectations of a further tightening of monetary
conditions subsequently led to a slight weakening of
the British currency.

Figure 2
Nominal exchange rates of leading currencies

(monthly averages)
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Between the beginning of November and the end
of February long-term interest rates declined in all the
industrial countries except Japan, where they already
were, and still are, exceptionally low at around 1.6 per
cent. The fall amounted to 0.2 percentage points in the
United States, 0.6 points in the United Kingdom and
0.7 points in Germany (Figure 4); in the remaining
EU countries rates came down in line with those in
Germany. In Italy and Spain the reduction was more
marked, and the differentials vis-à-vis German rates
narrowed further to 0.4 and 0.2 percentage points
respectively at the end of February. As a result of
these developments, the average of real interest rates
in the leading industrial countries fell to less than 4
per cent.
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Figure 3

Exchange rates of the lira vis--à--vis other ERM currencies(1)
(percentage divergences from central parities)
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Figure 4
Long--term interest rates(1)

(monthly averages)
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Share prices in Germany, the United Kingdom
and France were affected by the fall in the Asian stock
exchanges at the end of October, but they

subsequently recovered strongly (by roughly 19, 15
and 19 per cent respectively) and exceeded the
historical peaks recorded in mid-October (Figure 5).
Share prices also showed a substantial recovery
of about 14 per cent in the United States, despite
the very considerable presence of US multinational
companies in South-East Asia. In Japan the downturn
in the market that began in the middle of last year
continued until mid-January, bringing the fall in share
prices since the beginning of 1997 to 16.6 per cent.

Figure 5

Indices of share prices on the main
international stock exchanges

(end--of--week data; indices, 29 December 1995=100)
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Economic activity and inflation in the leading
industrial countries

In Japan a partial recovery in activity in the third
quarter of last year was followed by a marked
worsening in economic conditions. Households’ real
spending fell and orders for machinery plummeted by
15 per cent between September and November.
Industrial output fell by 2.3 per cent between the third
and fourth quarters and consumer and business
confidence declined again.

The US economy continued to grow vigorously in
the second half of last year; output increased at an
annual rate of 3.4 per cent between the first and
second halves, accelerating in the final months of the
year (Table 3). Production was again fueled by
domestic demand, particularly investment, which
increased at an annual rate of more than 10 per cent.

Growth fostered a further decline in the
unemployment rate, which stood at 4.7 per cent in
January. Wage and salary increases nevertheless
remained moderate; thanks partly to productivity
gains, unit labour costs were only 1.5 per cent higher
in the second six months than in the same period of
1996. In January consumer price inflation fell to a
twelve-month rate of 1.6 per cent (compared with 3.0
per cent in January 1997; see Table a3), thanks to the
fall in the international prices of raw materials and the
appreciation of the dollar.

In continental Europe the recovery gained
strength. In the second half of the year Germany and
France recorded annual rates of growth of GDP of 2.3
and 2.6 per cent respectively, with net exports
continuing to make a large contribution, especially in
Germany, where they accounted for more than 70 per
cent of growth. The most recent surveys of German
businesses indicate an increase in domestic orders
and a further improvement in confidence. In France
all the components of domestic demand picked up in
the third quarter; investment, in particular, recorded
an annualized increase of 8 per cent over the
preceding period. Private consumption continued to
pick up in the final months of the year.

In the United Kingdom GDP grew at an annual
rate of 2.9 per cent in the second half of the year; the

contribution of the external sector was highly
negative, owing to the appreciation of sterling.
Domestic demand continued to expand briskly (5.3
per cent on an annual basis), thanks to private
consumption.

Table 3
GDP and domestic demand

in the major industrial countries
(annualized percentage changes

on preceding period, at constant prices)
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Differences in the performance of the labour
market in the leading industrial countries became
more marked. In the United States and the United
Kingdom the unemployment rates fell to the lowest
levels since 1980 (4.7 and 5.0 per cent respectively in
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January). Last year the US economy created almost 3
million new jobs. In continental Europe the situation
did not improve: the average unemployment rate
remained virtually unchanged at 11.6 per cent
between January and October. In Germany it reached
11.8 per cent in December, corresponding to more
than 4.5 million unemployed, with the figure close to
20 per cent in the eastern regions. In France the rate
came down slightly between October and December,
from 12.5 to 12.2 per cent.

Inflation remained low throughout the EU. Based
on the harmonized consumer price indices, only
Greece recorded a rate of inflation above the 2.7 per
cent convergence threshold for membership of EMU.

In Germany consumer price inflation recorded a
twelve-month peak of 2.1 per cent last August before
falling; in January it stood at 1.3 per cent. The
reduction was helped by the decline in oil prices that
began last October. Prices also slowed down in
France in the second half of last year, with inflation
falling from 1.5 per cent in August to 0.5 per cent in
January. In the United Kingdom the twelve-month
change in retail prices excluding mortgage interest
payments remained at around 2.8 per cent until
December, exceeding the 2.5 per cent target set by the
Government, despite the tightening of monetary
conditions from May onwards.

Economic policies

Last year Japanese budget policy proved
excessively restrictive; the general government
deficit, net of social security, appears to have fallen
from 6.6 to 5.9 per cent of GDP in the financial year
ending in March 1998. The measures recently
approved by Parliament to counter the adverse
cyclical conditions are of very modest proportions,
comprising reductions in income tax amounting to
about ¥1 trillion (0.2 per cent of GDP) and a
comparable increase in public sector investment. The
budget law for the financial year that begins in April
is currently before Parliament; it maintains a
restrictive stance which is in line with the objectives
of the medium-term adjustment plan but does not
appear consistent with the needs of the domestic or

international economy. Nor does the additional tax
relief amounting to about ¥2 trillion (0.4 per cent of
GDP), which was announced by the Government last
December but has not yet been approved by
Parliament, seem adequate to counteract the
weakness of the economy and the crisis in consumer
confidence.

Overnight rates in Japan have been very low since
the second half of 1995; since last July they have been
below the discount rate of 0.5 per cent. In the
three-year period 1995-97 monetary base expanded
by an average of more than 12 per cent per year;
nonetheless, the annual increase in the M2+CDs
aggregate, which the monetary authorities use as a
reference, was little more than 3 per cent (Figure 6).
The smallness of the growth in banks’ liabilities is
attributable primarily to the stagnation in lending; last
year the volume of loans to the private sector was
virtually unchanged.

Figure 6

Monetary base and monetary aggregates in Japan
(annual percentage changes)
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The stagnation in bank lending also reflects the
urgent need to write off the bad and doubtful debts
that have accumulated during the nineties in order to
restore profitability and efficiency. The accounts of
the 19 largest Japanese banks show that at the end of
last September doubtful debts, calculated in
accordance with national criteria, had declined
significantly to 4.5 per cent of total lending. Using a
broader definition that includes non-performing
assets, the Ministry of Finance estimates that the
percentage would be about 12 per cent, which is not
exceptionally high by international standards.
Nonetheless, these estimates are not entirely reliable
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and still take only limited account of the effects of the
Asian crisis on the quality of banks’ assets.

Short-term interest rates have risen to 1.7 per cent
since the beginning of December, following the
failure of a number of financial institutions (Figure
7); the increase in the differential in relation to the
corresponding Euroyen rate (of about 0.5 per cent)
indicates the inclusion of a substantial premium to
cover the risk of insolvency of Japanese banks. The
latest business survey carried out by the Bank of
Japan reveals a decline in banks’ willingness to grant
credit, particularly to small firms.

Figure 7
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Table a5.

In order to restore confidence, a broad-ranging
plan to bolster the financial system has been
launched. It has two objectives: to underwrite the
entire deposits of the insolvent financial institutions
up to March 2001 by increasing the funds available to
the Deposit Insurance Corporation (DIC) by ¥17
trillion (3.4 per cent of GDP); and to recapitalize the
banks by placing ¥13 trillion in a new account with
the DIC, to be used to buy preferred stock or
subordinated loans issued by these banks. To date,
however, neither the timetable nor the criteria for
allocating public funds have been decided.

In the United States the federal budget deficit was
almost eliminated in the fiscal year that ended last
September; it amounted to only $22 billion, or 0.3 per
cent of GDP. The objective of balancing the budget
envisaged in the medium-term plan approved last
August could be achieved in 1999, three years ahead
of schedule. The Administration has announced that

the budgetary savings deriving from the favourable
performance of the economy will be used to fund the
social security system until a structural reform of the
pensions system can be implemented.

The Federal Reserve has kept monetary
conditions unchanged. Although activity continued
to be brisk during the final months of 1997, concern
at the potential deflationary effects of the Asian crisis
and fears of a sudden large fall in share prices
remained dominant. In January short-term interest
rates declined from 5.8 to 5.5 per cent and in
mid-February futures contracts on the Euromarket
signalled expectations that monetary conditions
would remain unchanged until the end of this year
(Figure 8).

Figure 8
Yield curve for futures contracts
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In Germany the general government deficit is
estimated to have declined from 3.4 to 2.7 per cent of
GDP in 1997. After the restrictions imposed last year,
budgetary policy is aimed at maintaining the results
achieved. The 1998 budget law, which was approved
by Parliament in December, provides for an increase
of one percentage point in VAT in April (in place
of the increase in social security contributions
previously proposed by the Government) in order to
counter the deterioration of the social security
balance. The “solidarity tax” introduced in 1994 to
finance the cost of reunification was reduced at the
beginning of the year, bringing the surtax on all forms
of income down from 7.5 to 5.5 per cent. The impact
on revenue is supposed to be offset by reducing
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transfers to enterprises. Very preliminary estimates
put this year’s deficit at 2.8 per cent of GDP.

Monetary conditions also remained unchanged in
Germany, after the slight increase in the repo rate in
October. In January money market rates came down
from 3.7 to 3.5 per cent. In the final quarter of 1997

the growth in the M3 reference aggregate in relation
to the average for the corresponding period of 1996
was 4.8 per cent, thus remaining within the target
range of 3.5-6.5 per cent. The Bundesbank has set a
target of 3-6 per cent for this year, partly to forestall
any inflationary potential on the eve of the third stage
of EMU.
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The Italian economy and the balance of payments

GDP rose by 1.5 per cent in real terms in 1997.
Despite the restrictive stance of fiscal policy, the
recovery that started in the spring gradually
strengthened, benefiting from the continuance of low
inflation and the decline in interest rates. After stag-
nating in the first quarter, GDP picked up in the
following six months and grew briskly, rising by 1.7
per cent compared with the previous six months. The
growth was nonetheless slower than in the other
leading European countries (Figure 9); above all, it
was not sufficient to increase employment, which
remained basically unchanged year on year, although
it began to rise in the Centre and North from the
summer onwards. Since unemployment increased in
the South, the gap between the two halves of the
country widened further.

Figure 9

GDP in Italy and selected EU countries (1)
(six--monthly seasonally adjusted data at constant prices;

percentage changes on previous six months)
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The rise in production during the year was
sustained by purchases of transport equipment and
stockbuilding. Exports, weakened by the loss of price
competitiveness in 1996, benefited only in part from
the strong growth in world trade. Exports and imports
together made a sizable negative net contribution to

the expansion in economic activity owing to the sharp
rise in the latter.

The growth in private consumption was most
pronounced for durable goods. Owing in part to the
slowdown in inflation, purchasing power rose in
real terms and this encouraged households to make
the replacements of obsolete goods that they had
been postponing. The phenomenon was especially
pronounced for cars as a result of the tax incentives
introduced by the Government: domestic demand for
motor vehicles, including purchases by one person
businesses, contributed around 0.4 percentage points
to the increase in GDP. The growth in the other
components of private consumption, especially of
non-durables, was much less pronounced. Investment
in machinery, equipment and transport equipment
stagnated in the early part of the year but
subsequently picked up in line with the expansion in
economic activity and the improvement in the climate
of confidence. By contrast, investment in buildings
and public works failed to improve on the weak
performance of the last two years.

Turning to the balance of payments, a contraction
in the trade surplus was partly offset by an
improvement in the balance on invisibles. The current
account surplus consequently declined slightly, but
was still more than 3 per cent of GDP. The country’s
external position came into balance.

Consumption and disposable income

The sharp rise in purchases of durable goods in
the first nine months of last year contributed to an
increase of around 2 per cent in households’ con-
sumption compared with the corresponding period
in 1996 (Table 4). Households’ disposable income is
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Table 4
Resources and uses of income (1)

(seasonally adjusted data at constant prices; percentage changes on previous period except where otherwise indicated)

���� ����

4� 4� 4� 4� <HDU 4� 4� 4� � PRQWKV
��� <HDU

5HVRXUFHV

3UHOLPLQDU\ HVWLPDWH RI *'3 ��� � � � � � � � � � � � ��� ����� ��� ����� ��� � � ��� ��� ��� ���

*'3 � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ��� ����� ��� � � ��� ����� ��� ��� ��� ��

,PSRUWV � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ����� ����� ��� ��� ����� ����� ���� ��� ���� ��
*RRGV � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ����� ����� ��� ��� ����� ����� ���� ��� ���� ��
6HUYLFHV � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ����� ��� ��� ��� ��� ����� ���� ���� ���� ��

7RWDO UHVRXUFHV � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ��� ����� ��� ��� ��� ����� ��� ��� ��� ��

8VHV

*URVV IL[HG LQYHVWPHQW � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ����� ����� ����� ����� ��� ����� ��� ��� ����� ��
&RQVWUXFWLRQ � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ����� ����� � � ����� ��� ����� ��� ����� ����� ��
0DFKLQHU\� HTXLSPHQW DQG VXQGU\ SURGXFWV ����� ��� ����� ����� ��� ��� ��� ��� ����� ��
7UDQVSRUW HTXLSPHQW � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ����� ����� ��� ��� ��� ��� ��� ��� ���� ��

+RXVHKROGV· FRQVXPSWLRQ � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ��� � � ��� ��� ��� ��� ��� ��� ��� ��
1RQ�GXUDEOHV � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ��� ��� � � ��� ��� � � ����� ����� ����� ��
6HPL�GXUDEOHV � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ����� ��� ����� ��� ����� � � ����� ��� ��� ��
'XUDEOHV � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ����� ����� ��� ��� ����� ��� ��� ��� ���� ��
6HUYLFHV � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ��� ����� ��� ��� ��� ��� ��� ����� ��� ��

2WKHU GRPHVWLF XVHV � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ����� ������ ��� ��� ����� ����� ���� ����� ��� ��

7RWDO GRPHVWLF GHPDQG � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ����� ��� ��� ��� ��� ��� � � ��� ��

([SRUWV � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ��� ��� ��� � � ����� ����� ��� ��� ��� ��
*RRGV � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ��� ��� ��� ��� ����� ����� ��� ��� ��� ��
6HUYLFHV � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ��� ����� ��� ����� ��� ��� ��� ���� ���� ��

� � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � �

0HPRUDQGXP LWHP�

$JJUHJDWH GHPDQG ��� � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ��� ����� ��� ��� ����� ����� ��� ��� ��� ��

6RXUFH� %DVHG RQ ,VWDW GDWD�
��� 3URYLVLRQDO QDWLRQDO DFFRXQWV GDWD XS WR WKH WKLUG TXDUWHU RI ����� UHOHDVHG RQ �� 'HFHPEHU ����� �� ��� 3HUFHQWDJH FKDQJH RQ WKH FRUUHVSRQGLQJ SHULRG RI ����� �� ��� 6HH WKH

,VWDW SUHVV FRPPXQLTXp RI ���������� �� ��� ([SRUWV RI JRRGV DQG VHUYLFHV DQG FRPSRQHQWV RI GRPHVWLF GHPDQG ZHLJKWHG DFFRUGLQJ WR LPSRUW FRQWHQW FDOFXODWHG IURP WKH ����
LQSXW�RXWSXW WDEOHV�

estimated to haven risen by around one per cent in real
terms, owing in part to the increase of around 5 per
cent in employees’ pretax earnings at current prices.
Since employment was unchanged, the increase in
unit earnings was on the same order. The income of
the self-employed and that from capital rose less.
Households’ income was sustained by the rapid fall
in the inflation rate during the year, which had the
effect of limiting the loss of purchasing power of the

sector’s net financial assets. The reduction in net
interest payments to households and the increase in
taxation had the opposite effect.

The increase in consumption of durable goods,
which had begun in the second half of 1996, was not
restricted to motor vehicle purchases, which were
boosted by tax incentives, but extended to other
durables, spending on which rose by around 5 per cent
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at constant prices in the first nine months compared
with the corresponding period of 1996. With interest
rates lower in both nominal and real terms and
households more optimistic (Isco’s index of the
climate of confidence rose to a cyclical peak last
September; Figure 10), it is plausible to assume that
the latter were encouraged by their increased
spending power to make the replacements of both
motor vehicles and other types of durable good that
they had postponed in the preceding years.
Consumption of non-durable and semi-durable goods
was stagnant, dipping 0.1 per cent in the first nine
months, while that of services rose by 1.6 per cent.

Figure 10
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calculated as simple averages of adjacent data. From January 1995 onwards interviews
have been conducted by telephone and the interviewee is no longer necessarily the head
olof household but any adult member who contributes to the income of the househd. -
(2) Index, 1980=100. - (3) Percentage of those interviewed who expected an
improvement in the economic situation of the country in the subsequent 12 months. -
(4) Percentage of those interviewed who expected an increase in unemployment in the
subsequent 12 months. - (5) Three-month moving average ending in the reference
month.

Investment and stocks

Gross fixed investment showed a small decline of
0.2 per cent in the first nine months compared with the
corresponding period of 1996 (Table 4); purchases of
machinery, equipment and transport equipment rose
by 0.9 per cent, while investment in buildings and
public works fell by 1.4 per cent. Capital spending on
transport equipment benefited to some extent from
the tax incentives introduced by the Government and
rose by 10.4 per cent at constant prices, with an
acceleration during the year. The weak performance
of investment in machinery and equipment was not
sufficient to make good the decline that had occurred
in the second half of 1996. In the first six months of
last year firms responded to the upturn in economic
activity by exploiting existing capacity, and the
capacity utilization rate rose to its highest level in this
cycle (Figure 11). In the following months the
consolidation of the recovery, the less uncertain
outlook for demand, good earnings prospects and the
fall in interest rates created the conditions for a
recovery in capital formation, as is confirmed by the
rise in the indicator of orders for machine tools
compiled by the machine tool manufacturers’
association (UCIMU).

Figure 11
Composite indicator

of capacity utilization in industry (1)
(indices, 1989 = 100)
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(1) Arithmetic mean of the Bank of Italy (Wharton) and Isco indicators.

Apart from a temporary upturn in the second half
of 1997, investment in buildings and public works
continued to follow the downward trend registered
since the beginning of 1996. According to estimates
prepared by the Centre for economic and sociological
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research on the building market (Cresme), the fall
was due to the weakness in the construction of new
buildings, since spending on the refurbishing and
restructuring of residential buildings increased.
Activity in the latter field may be boosted by the
incentives provided for in the budget for 1998.

Figure 12

Industrial output, demand and stocks
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At the beginning of 1997 the recovery in
economic activity, expectations of its continuing and
the favourable exchange rate of the lira against the
dollar led firms to start rebuilding their stocks. Istat
data show that the growth in demand apart from
stockbuilding was less pronounced than that in
supply; stockbuilding contributed 0.9 percentage
points to the growth in GDP in the first nine months

of last year, in line with the movements in the
indicators compiled by Isco for finished products
(Figure 12) and raw materials.

Exports and imports

Exports and especially imports accelerated
sharply in real terms from the second quarter
onwards. Exports benefited from the expansion of
Italy’s main markets and imports from the
strengthening of domestic demand. The services
sector, as defined in the national accounts, recorded
substantial increases in trade in both directions:
exports rose by 13.4 per cent and imports by 21.8 per
cent (Table 4).

The overall increase in exports of goods and
services in the first nine months amounted to 5.8 per
cent. The fall that occurred in the first quarter was
followed by a sharp rise of 10.6 per cent in the six
months ending in September compared with the
preceding six months. The outcome was due to the
exceptional growth in world demand, the effect of
which was partly offset by the loss of price
competitiveness registered in 1996.

The recovery in domestic economic activity,
which extended to many sectors, the increase in
purchases of foreign motor vehicles and the
rebuilding of stocks were the main reasons for the
surge in imports of goods and services in the first nine
months of last year, when they rose by 11.5 per cent,
or twice as much as exports. Over the year the pattern
was similar to that of exports, with a slowdown in the
first quarter followed by a very sharp spurt in the
following months (Table 4).

Industrial production and value added by
economic sector

The acceleration in GDP growth during the year
was largely attributable to manufacturing industry,
where production rose sharply from the spring
onwards. Value added in industry excluding
construction rose by 1.3 per cent in the first nine
months of 1997, while that of construction showed a
small decline of 0.4 per cent.
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The year-on-year increase in industrial produc-
tion in 1997 amounted to 2.2 per cent (2.8 per cent on
the basis of the same number of working days),
confirming the indications provided by monthly
surveys of firms’ domestic and foreign orders (Figure
12). The downward trend of industrial production
adjusted for seasonal factors and the number of
working days that had set in roughly a year earlier was
reversed in February and gave way to a slow but
steady rise in the index. The effect of the
Government’s incentives on the output of motor
vehicles, bodies, components and tyres was to boost
industrial production; the overall effect, including the
spillover on other branches, is estimated to have
contributed around one third of the total rise in the
index. Estimates based on cyclical indicators and
electricity consumption show that production
continued to increase in January and February, in line
with forecasts made by businessmen at the end of
1997.

The value added of market services grew by 1.6
per cent in real terms in the first nine months of last
year. In the distribution sector, retail sales rose by 2.4
per cent at current prices in the first eleven months,
with fairly uniform increases for all the various
product categories. The expansion in sales of
large-scale distribution was twice that of shops with
a surface area of less than 400 square metres,
respectively 4.4 and 2.1 per cent.

In the transport sector, freight traffic rose in line
with the recovery in manufacturing industry. Air
passenger traffic continued to grow, buoyed by the
expansion in supply following the increase in
competition between carriers, while railway
passenger traffic declined slightly.

Employment

Average employment in 1997, as measured by the
quarterly labour force survey, remained essentially
unchanged with respect to 1996 (Figure 13). In
industry and in the regions of the Centre and North,
following the decline that lasted from mid-1996 to the
early part of last year, the number of persons in
employment resumed growth, thanks to the

consolidation of the economic recovery (Table 5).
The composition of the overall work force continued
to shift, albeit less rapidly, in favour of women,
workers younger than 55 and the central and northern
regions. Unemployment increased further from an
annual average rate of 12.1 per cent in 1996 to 12.3
per cent last year; the rate in the South rose from 21.7
to 22.2 per cent, while that in the rest of the country
held constant at 7.6 per cent.

Figure 13

Employment
(seasonally adjusted; thousands of persons)
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Source: Estimated on the basis of Istat data (labour force survey).
(1) Surveys are taken in January, April, July and October. Since October 1992 the

survey has been conducted on the basis of a new questionnaire; data up to July 1992
have been adjusted to take account of the changes.

The expansion of activity during the first half of
the year produced an increase in the number of hours
worked in industry. This did not affect employment,
which remained basically unchanged at the low level
of October 1996. The number of persons employed in
industry began to grow again in the summer (Table 5),
with a seasonally adjusted gain of 100,000 between
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Table 5
Employment by branch of activity and geographical area in 1997 (1)

(percentage changes on year--earlier period)

1RUWK�(DVW 1RUWK�:HVW 7RWDO 1RUWK &HQWUH 6RXWK DQG ,VODQGV 7RWDO ,WDO\

$QQXDO
DYHUDJH 2FWREHU $QQXDO

DYHUDJH 2FWREHU $QQXDO
DYHUDJH 2FWREHU $QQXDO

DYHUDJH 2FWREHU $QQXDO
DYHUDJH 2FWREHU $QQXDO

DYHUDJH $SULO -XO\ 2FWREHU

$JULFXOWXUH � � � � � � � � � � � � ����� ����� ����� ��� ����� ����� ����� ��� ����� ����� ����� ����� ����� �����
,QGXVWU\ H[FO� FRQVWUXFWLRQ ��� ��� ����� ��� ����� ��� ����� ����� ��� ����� ����� ����� ��� ���
&RQVWUXFWLRQ � � � � � � � � � � � ����� ����� ����� ��� ����� ����� ��� ��� ����� ��� ����� ��� ��� ���
7RWDO VHUYLFH DFWLYLWLHV � � � ��� ����� ��� ����� ��� ����� ����� ����� ��� ����� ��� ��� ����� �����
GLVWULEXWLRQ � � � � � � � � � � ����� ����� ����� ����� ����� ����� ����� ����� ����� ��� ����� ����� ����� �����

7RWDO HFRQRP\ � � � � � � � � ��� ��� ����� ��� ��� ��� ����� � � ����� ����� � � � � � � � �
8QHPSOR\PHQW UDWH ��� � ��� ��� ��� ��� ��� ��� ���� ���� ���� ���� ���� ���� ���� ����

6RXUFH� ,VWDW ODERXU IRUFH VXUYH\�
��� 1RW DGMXVWHG IRU ZRUNHUV UHFHLYLQJ ZDJH VXSSOHPHQWDWLRQ� $QQXDO DYHUDJH RI VXUYH\V WDNHQ LQ -DQXDU\� $SULO� -XO\ DQG 2FWREHU� �� ��� 3HUFHQWDJHV�

April and October. The number of hours compensated
by ordinary Wage Supplementation, which is more
cyclically sensitive than extraordinary benefits,
declined further to the equivalent of fewer than
30,000 full time workers in the fourth quarter. This
represents less than 1 per cent of total industrial
employment, near the all-time low (Figure 14). Istat’s
survey of industrial enterprises with more than 500
workers continues to report a high level of effective
hours worked per capita (the latest available data are
for November).

The growth of employment in the services, which
had underpinned overall employment growth in 1995
and 1996, halted in mid-1997. There was a reduction
of some 100,000 jobs between April and October,
unequally distributed among the various branches.

In the distributive trades the employment
contraction that began in the second half of 1996
continued until July. There was a seasonally adjusted
drop of 130,000 (3.9 per cent) between April 1996
and July 1997, made good only to a very small extent
by a gain of 13,000 between July and October. The
decline was entirely accounted for by self-employed
workers, who still make up 59 per cent of the work
force in this branch. Salaried employment was an
average of 1.1 per cent higher in 1997 than in 1996,
thanks to the contribution of large firms, whose
payrolls expanded by 1.9 per cent over the first eleven

months, according to an Istat survey of firms
employing more than 500 persons.

In banking and insurance employment fell by 1.8
per cent on average for the year. In the large
enterprises in this segment, Istat recorded a
contraction of 2.4 per cent in the first eleven months
compared with the same period of 1996. Employment
at large transport firms declined by 3.5 per cent in this
period and the reduction appears likely to continue
given the planned streamlining at the State Railways.

Figure 14

Employment in manufacturing firms
(seasonally adjusted)
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Sources: Based on Isco and INPS data.

(1) Percentage difference between positive replies (“increasing”) and negative
replies (“decreasing”) concerning employment in the reference month. Moving average
for the three months ending in the reference month. Right-hand scale. - (2) Percentage
difference between positive replies (“increasing”) and negative replies (“decreasing”)
concerning employment in the quarter subsequent to the reference quarter. Moving
average for the three quarters ending in the reference quarter. Right-hand scale. -
(3) Thousands of workers equivalent to the number of hours of ordinary wage
supplementation, calculated with reference to contractual working hours. Left-hand
scale.
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Table 6
Balance of payments

(balances in billions of lire)

���� ���� ���

<HDU +� +� <HDU +� +� ���

&XUUHQW DFFRXQW � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ������ ������ ������ ������ ������ ������

*RRGV � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ������ ������ ������ ������ ������ ������

,QYLVLEOHV � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � �������� �������� �������� �������� �������� �������

6HUYLFHV � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ����� ����� ����� ����� ����� �����
)RUHLJQ WUDYHO � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ������ ������ ������ ������ ������ ������
7UDQVSRUW � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � �������� ������� ������� �������� ������� �������
2WKHU � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ������� ������� ������� ������� ������� �������

,QFRPH � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � �������� �������� ������� �������� �������� �������
(PSOR\PHQW LQFRPH � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ��� ��� ��� ��� ��� ���
,QYHVWPHQW LQFRPH � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � �������� �������� �������� �������� �������� �������

7UDQVIHUV � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � �������� ������� ������� ������� ��� �������
(8 � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ������� ������� ������� ����� ����� �����

&DSLWDO PRYHPHQWV � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ������� ����� �������� �������� �������� �������

%DQN FDSLWDO � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � �������� ����� �������� ������ �������� ������

1RQ�EDQN FDSLWDO � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ������ ����� ������ �������� ����� ��������

(UURUV DQG RPLVVLRQV � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � �������� �������� �������� �������� �������� �������

&KDQJH LQ RIILFLDO UHVHUYHV ��� � � � � � � � � � � � � � � �������� �������� ����� �������� ����� ��������

��� 3URYLVLRQDO� � ��� $W FRQVWDQW H[FKDQJH UDWHV DQG JROG SULFHV� $ PLQXV VLJQ LQGLFDWHV DQ LQFUHDVH LQ WKH UHVHUYHV�

The labour force participation rate held steady at
an average of 47.6 per cent for the year, the female
rate rising from 34.6 to 34.8 per cent and the male rate
dipping from 61.5 to 61.3 per cent. The expansion of
the female labour force offset the contraction of the
male force, which itself reflected the exit of workers
older than 55, presumably due to retirement.

The increase in unemployment was concentrated
in the South, where the number of job-seekers rose by
80,000 between January and October on a seasonally
adjusted basis. Joblessness in the South worsened for
all labour force components, including young people;
the unemployment rate for those under age 24
reached 57.4 per cent in October, two points higher
than a year earlier. In the Centre and North, this youth
unemployment rate came down by more than two

points, from 24.5 to 22.0 per cent, thanks to a pickup
in generational turnover.

The current account of the balance of payments

Provisional data indicate that Italy registered a
surplus of 61.9 trillion lire on the current account of
the balance of payments in 1997, 1.4 trillion less than
in 1996 (Table 6). A reduction of 13.6 trillion lire in
the trade surplus (fob-fob) was essentially offset by a
contraction of 12.2 trillion in the deficit on invisibles.
Current account transactions with EU countries and
institutions generated a surplus of 16 trillion lire,
compared with 15.7 trillion in 1996. The surplus with
the rest of the world diminished from 47.1 to 45.9
trillion.
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Table 7
Exports and imports of manufactures in 1997, by sector

(at constant prices)

([SRUWV ,PSRUWV

3HUFHQWDJH RI 3HUFHQWDJH FKDQJHV 3HUFHQWDJH 3HUFHQWDJH FKDQJHV3HUFHQWDJH RI
WRWDO LQ ����

��� 4� ��� 4� ��� 4� ��� -DQ��1RY�
���

3HUFHQWDJH
RI WRWDO LQ
���� ��� 4� ��� 4� ��� 4� ��� -DQ��1RY�

���

)HUURXV DQG QRQ�IHUURXV RUHV
DQG PHWDOV � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ��� ����� ��� ��� ��� ��� ��� ���� ��� ���

1RQ�PHWDOOLF PLQHUDOV � � � � � � � ��� ����� ���� ��� ��� ��� ����� ���� ��� ���

&KHPLFDO SURGXFWV � � � � � � � � � � ��� ����� ���� ��� ��� ���� ����� ���� ��� ����

0HWDO SURGXFWV � � � � � � � � � � � � � ��� ����� ��� ���� ��� ��� ����� ���� ���� ����

$JULFXOWXUDO DQG LQGXVWULDO
PDFKLQHU\ � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ���� ����� ���� ��� ��� ��� ����� ���� ��� ���

2IILFH PDFKLQHV � � � � � � � � � � � � ��� ������ ��� ���� ����� ��� ����� ���� ����� ���

(OHFWULFDO HTXLSPHQW � � � � � � � � ��� ����� ��� ���� ��� ��� ����� ���� ��� ����

0RWRU YHKLFOHV � � � � � � � � � � � � � ��� ����� ��� ���� ����� ��� ��� ���� ��� ����

2WKHU WUDQVSRUW HTXLSPHQW � � � ��� ��� ��� ������ ����� ��� ���� ���� ����� ����

)RRG� EHYHUDJHV DQG WREDFFR
SURGXFWV � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ��� ����� ��� ��� ��� ��� ����� ���� ����� �����

7H[WLOHV DQG FORWKLQJ � � � � � � � � ���� ����� ��� ��� ��� ��� ��� ���� ��� ����

/HDWKHU DQG IRRWZHDU � � � � � � � ��� ����� ��� ��� ����� ��� ����� ��� ��� ���

:RRG DQG IXUQLWXUH � � � � � � � � � ��� ����� ��� ��� ��� ��� ����� ��� ��� ����

3DSHU DQG SULQWLQJ � � � � � � � � � � ��� ����� ��� ����� ��� ��� ����� ���� ����� ����

5XEEHU DQG SODVWLF SURGXFWV � ��� ����� ���� ���� ��� ��� ����� ���� ��� ���

7RWDO � � � ���� ����� ���� ��� ��� ���� ����� ���� ��� ����

6RXUFH� %DVHG RQ ,VWDW GDWD�
��� 3HUFHQWDJH RI WRWDO IRE PHUFKDQGLVH H[SRUWV� �� ��� 3HUFHQWDJH FKDQJH RQ SUHYLRXV SHULRG� VHDVRQDOO\ DGMXVWHG� �� ��� 3HUFHQWDJH FKDQJH RQ \HDU�HDUOLHU SHULRG� ��

��� 3HUFHQWDJH RI WRWDO FLI PHUFKDQGLVH LPSRUWV�

The trade surplus at current prices shrank by 16.1
trillion lire for the year, on a cif-fob basis, as the
growth of exports (4.4 per cent) was far outweighed
by a 10.3 per cent expansion of imports. By volume,
exports of manufactures expanded by 4.4 per cent in
the first eleven months, the growth being accounted
for mainly by intermediate and consumer goods.
Export sales of office machinery and transport
equipment declined, while imports of the latter rose
exceptionally fast (Table 7).

Most of the reduction in the trade surplus came in
respect of EU member countries (12.1 trillion lire in

the first eleven months; Table 8). The surplus
diminished significantly vis-à-vis France (2.4
trillion) and especially Germany (5.3 trillion); Italian
export sales to Germany declined by 2.9 per cent, not
least because of that country’s sluggish domestic
demand.

Merchandise trade with Japan, China and the new
industrial economies of Asia also evolved
unfavourably. The overall surplus with these
countries fell by 4.0 trillion lire, as imports rose
sharply (17.6 per cent) while exports diminished
(-4.5 per cent). The export contraction was especially
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pronounced vis-à-vis Japan (-6.4 per cent). An
increase of 1.6 trillion lire was registered in the trade
surplus with the United States, thanks to the
continuing US economic expansion and the
appreciation of the dollar, and one of 600 billion with
the countries of Latin America.

The improvement on invisibles reflects the
performance of transfers to and from the European
Union, which shifted from a deficit of 7.2 trillion lire
in 1996 to a surplus of 1.2 trillion last year. A major
factor in the turnaround was a substantial increase in

disbursements to Italy by the Regional Development
Fund, which rose from 1.0 trillion to 5.2 trillion lire,
ending a decline that had lasted for three years. The
deficit on investment income also narrowed, by 3.4
trillion lire, reflecting the further diminution in Italy’s
foreign debt and the narrowing of interest rate
differentials between the lira and other currencies.
The contribution of “other services” and “foreign
travel” decreased, though these items still recorded
surpluses of 2.2 trillion and 400 billion lire
respectively.

Table 8
Merchandise trade cif--fob by country and area at current prices

(January--November)

([SRUWV ,PSRUWV %DODQFH

3HUFHQWDJH 3HUFHQWDJH 3HUFHQWDJH 3HUFHQWDJH
%LOOLRQV RI OLUH

3HUFHQWDJH
FKDQJH

3HUFHQWDJH
RI WRWDO

3HUFHQWDJH
FKDQJH

3HUFHQWDJH
RI WRWDO ���� ����

(8 FRXQWULHV ��� � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ��� ���� ��� ���� ������ �����

$XVWULD � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ����� ��� ��� ��� ����� �����

%HOJLXP�/X[HPERXUJ � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ��� ��� ��� ��� ������� �������

'HQPDUN � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ��� ��� ��� ��� ��� ���

)LQODQG � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ��� ��� ���� ��� ��� ����

)UDQFH � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ��� ���� ��� ���� ����� �����

*HUPDQ\ � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ����� ���� ��� ���� ����� �����

*UHHFH � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ��� ��� ����� ��� ����� �����

,UHODQG � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ����� ��� ��� ��� ������� �������

1HWKHUODQGV � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ����� ��� ���� ��� ������� �������

3RUWXJDO � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ��� ��� ��� ��� ����� �����

6SDLQ � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ��� ��� ���� ��� ����� �����

6ZHGHQ � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ��� ��� ��� ��� ����� �����

8QLWHG .LQJGRP � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ���� ��� ���� ��� ����� �����

1RQ�(8 FRXQWULHV � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ��� ���� ���� ���� ������ ������

8QLWHG 6WDWHV � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ���� ��� ���� ��� ������ ������

-DSDQ � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ����� ��� ���� ��� ����� ���

()7$ ��� � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ����� ��� ��� ��� ����� ���

(DVWHUQ (XURSHDQ FRXQWULHV ��� � � � � � � � � � � ���� ��� ���� ��� ����� �����

&KLQD � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ����� ��� ���� ��� ������� �������

$VLDQ 1,(V ��� � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ����� ��� ���� ��� ������ �����

23(& ��� � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ��� ��� ���� ��� ������� �������

/DWLQ $PHULFD � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ��� ��� ��� ��� ����� �����

2WKHU FRXQWULHV � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ��� ���� ��� ��� ������ ������

7RWDO � � � ��� ����� ��� ����� ������ ������

��� 7KH ILJXUHV RQ WUDGH ZLWK (8 FRXQWULHV UHIHU RQO\ WR ILUPV ZLWK LQWUD�&RPPXQLW\ SXUFKDVHV DQG VDOHV LQ H[FHVV RI �� PLOOLRQ OLUH LQ WKH WZR SHULRGV FRQVLGHUHG� 7KH\ WKXV FRYHU
RQO\ D SDUW RI WKH WRWDO WUDGHRI ,WDOLDQ H[SRUWLQJ DQG LPSRUWLQJ ILUPV� �� ��� ,FHODQG� 1RUZD\ DQG6ZLW]HUODQG� �� ��� $OEDQLD� %XOJDULD� &]HFK5HSXEOLF� +XQJDU\� 3RODQG� 5RPDQLD� 6ORYDNLD�
UHSXEOLFV RI WKH IRUPHU 8665 DQG WKH IRUPHU <XJRVODYLD� �� ��� +RQJ .RQJ� 6LQJDSRUH� 6RXWK .RUHD DQG 7DLZDQ� �� ��� $OJHULD� (FXDGRU� *DERQ� ,QGRQHVLD� ,UDQ� ,UDT� .XZDLW� /LE\D�
1LJHULD� 4DWDU� 6DXGL $UDELD� 8QLWHG $UDE (PLUDWHV DQG 9HQH]XHOD�
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Capital movements and Italy’s external position

Overall, capital transactions generated net
outflows of 11.5 trillion lire in 1997, compared with
9.8 trillion in 1996 (Table 9). The official reserves
increased by 26.9 trillion lire at average prices and
exchange rates.

The achievement, for the fifth consecutive year,
of a substantial current account surplus brought the
country’s net external position close to balance
(Figure 15). According to initial estimates Italy’s net
external debtor position was reduced last year by
about 50 trillion lire to 9.3 trillion (0.5 per cent of
GDP) on 31 December (Table 10). The net position
fluctuated markedly in the second half of the year,
primarily because of changes in the lira’s exchange
rate with the dollar.

Improvement in the net external positions of
non-bank residents and of the central bank, by 47.2

trillion and 26.9 trillion lire, respectively, more than
offset an increase in the net external liabilities of the
banking system of 23.4 trillion, including 3.7 trillion
in foreign currency liabilities (Table 11). Counting
domestic spot and forward positions, domestic
currency swaps and lira lending indexed to foreign
currencies, the banks’ overall foreign currency
position remained in balance. At the end of the year
the official reserves amounted to 133.6 trillion lire,
including 37.6 trillion worth of gold. Virtually all of
the improvement since December 1996 was
accounted for by foreign currency assets, holdings of
which grew by 24.9 trillion lire. The increase was
curbed during the year by profitable early liquidation
of long-term debtor positions in foreign currency.
Reclassifying the data according to the origin of the
demand for foreign exchange, the banking system
turns out to have held a net external creditor position
of 3 trillion lire in October, compared with a net
debtor position of 135.1 trillion for non-bank
residents.

Table 9
Capital movements

(net flows in billions of lire)

���� ���� ���

4� 4� 4� 4� <HDU 4� 4� 4� 4� ��� <HDU ���

1RQ�EDQN FDSLWDO IORZV � �������� ������ ��� ������ ������ �������� ������ ������� �������� ��������

)RUHLJQ � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ����� ������ ������ ������ ������� ������ ������ ������ ����� �������

,QYHVWPHQW � � � � � � � � � ����� ������ ������ ������ ������� ������ ������ ������ ����� �������
SRUWIROLR � � � � � � � � � ����� ������ ������ ������ ������� ������ ������ ������ ����� �������

/RDQV � � � � � � � � � � � � � ����� ������� ������� ������� ������� ����� ����� ����� ����� �����

7UDGH FUHGLW � � � � � � � � ��� ������� ������� ��� ������� ����� ����� ������� ����� �����

,WDOLDQ � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � �������� �������� �������� �������� �������� �������� �������� �������� �������� ���������

,QYHVWPHQW � � � � � � � � � �������� �������� �������� �������� �������� �������� �������� �������� �������� ���������
SRUWIROLR � � � � � � � � � � �������� �������� �������� �������� �������� �������� �������� �������� �������� ���������

/RDQV � � � � � � � � � � � � � ������� ������� ������� ������� �������� ������� ������� ������� ������� ��������

7UDGH FUHGLW � � � � � � � � ������� ������� ����� ������� ������� ������� ������� ����� ����� �������

%DQN FDSLWDO IORZV � � � � � � ������ �������� �������� �������� �������� ������ �������� ������ ������ ������

,Q OLUH � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ����� ������� ������� �������� �������� ����� �������� ������ ������ ������

,Q IRUHLJQ FXUUHQF\ � � � � ������ ������� ������� �������� �������� ������ �������� ��� ������� �������

7RWDO � � � � ����� ����� �������� ������� ������� ������ �������� ����� �������� ��������

��� 3URYLVLRQDO� �� ��� )RU WUDGH FUHGLW� GDWD WKURXJK 2FWREHU RQO\�
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Table 10
Italy’s net external position

(billions of lire)

6WRFNV LQ -DQXDU\�'HFHPEHU ���� 6WRFNV LQ6WRFNV LQ
'HFHPEHU ���� ���

� �
)ORZV ��� $GMXVWPHQWV ��� &KDQJH LQ VWRFNV

6WRFNV LQ
'HFHPEHU ���� ���

� � � � �G�
� �

�D� )ORZV ���
�E�

$GMXVWPHQWV ���
�F�

&KDQJH LQ VWRFNV
�G� �E���F�

� �
�H� �D���G��D� �E� �F� �G� �E���F� �H� �D���G�

$JHQWV RWKHU WKDQ UHVLGHQW EDQNV

$VVHWV � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ������� ������� ������ ������� �������

'LUHFW LQYHVWPHQW � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ������� ������ ������ ������ �������

3RUWIROLR LQYHVWPHQW � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ������� ������� ������ ������� �������

/RDQV DQG WUDGH FUHGLW ��� � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ������� ������ ����� ������ �������

/LDELOLWLHV � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ������� ������� ������ ������� �������

'LUHFW LQYHVWPHQW � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ������� ����� ������ ������ �������

3RUWIROLR LQYHVWPHQW � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ������� ������� ������ ������� �������

*RYHUQPHQW VHFXULWLHV � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ������� ������� ������ ������� �������

%27V � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ������ ������ ��� ������ ������

%73V � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ������� ������ ����� ������ �������

&7(V � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ������ ������� ��� ������� ������

2WKHU JRYHUQPHQW VHFXULWLHV � � � � � � � � � � ������ ������ ����� ������ ������

5HSXEOLF RI ,WDO\ LVVXHV � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ������ ����� ����� ����� ������

/RDQV DQG WUDGH FUHGLW ��� � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ������� ����� ����� ������ �������

1HW QRQ�EDQN SRVLWLRQ � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ��������� ������ ������ ������ ��������

5HVLGHQW EDQNV

$VVHWV � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ������� ����� ������ ������ �������

/LDELOLWLHV � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ������� ������ ������ ������ �������

1HW SRVLWLRQ � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � �������� �������� �������� �������� ��������

%DQN RI ,WDO\�8,&

1HW SRVLWLRQ �LQFOXGLQJ JROG� � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ������� ������ ����� ������ �������

,WDO\

1(7 29(5$// 326,7,21 � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � �������� ������ ������ ������ �������

��� $W HQG�RI�SHULRG SULFHV DQG H[FKDQJH UDWHV� �� ��� $W WKH VHFXULWLHV SULFHV DQG H[FKDQJH UDWHV SUHYDLOLQJ RQ WKH GDWH RI WKH WUDQVDFWLRQ� $ PLQXV VLJQ LQGLFDWHV D GHFUHDVH LQ
WKH UHOHYDQW DVVHWV RU OLDELOLWLHV� �� ��� &DOFXODWHG RQ WKH EDVLV RI WKH FRPSRVLWLRQ DFFRUGLQJ WR FXUUHQF\ DQG ILQDQFLDO LQVWUXPHQW� �� ��� )RU ����� GDWD RQ WUDGH FUHGLW DUH IRU
-DQXDU\�2FWREHU�
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Table 11

Stocks at current exchange rates and changes at constant exchange rates in the external position,
domestic foreign currency position and total foreign currency position of Italian banks (1)

(billions of lire)

���� ����
����

���� ����
4� 4� 4� 4� ���

6WRFNV ���

([WHUQDO SRVLWLRQ � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � �  ��������  ��������  ��������  ��������  ��������  ��������

,Q OLUH � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � �  ������  ������  ������  ������  ������  ������

,Q IRUHLJQ FXUUHQF\ � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � �  ���������  ���������  ���������  ���������  ���������  ���������

'RPHVWLF SRVLWLRQ LQ IRUHLJQ FXUUHQF\ � � ������ ������ ������ ������ ������ ������

2YHUDOO SRVLWLRQ LQ IRUHLJQ FXUUHQF\ ��� � ��� ����� ������� ����� ��� �����

&KDQJHV ���

([WHUQDO SRVLWLRQ � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � �  ������  �������� �������� ������ �������� ��������

,Q OLUH � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � �  ������  ��������  �������  ������  ��������  ��������

,Q IRUHLJQ FXUUHQF\ � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � �  ������  �����  ��������  ������  �����  �����

'RPHVWLF SRVLWLRQ LQ IRUHLJQ FXUUHQF\ � � ����� ������� ����� ������� ������� �����

2YHUDOO SRVLWLRQ LQ IRUHLJQ FXUUHQF\ ��� � ������ ����� ��� ����� ����� �����

��� ,QFOXGLQJ WKH ,WDOLDQ EUDQFKHV RI IRUHLJQ EDQNV� �� ��� 3URYLVLRQDO� �� ��� $W FXUUHQW H[FKDQJH UDWHV� (QG�RI�SHULRG GDWD� �� ��� 6SRW DQG IRUZDUG WUDQVDFWLRQV �LQFOXGLQJ GRPHVWLF
FXUUHQF\ VZDSV DQG FRPPLWPHQWV WR EH VHWWOHG ZLWKLQ � GD\V� DQG ORDQV LQGH[HG WR IRUHLJQ FXUUHQFLHV� �� ��� $W PRQWKO\ DYHUDJH H[FKDQJH UDWHV� $ PLQXV VLJQ LQGLFDWHV DQ LQIORZ RI
EDQN FDSLWDO� �� ��� 6SRW DQG IRUZDUG WUDQVDFWLRQV� LQFOXGLQJ GRPHVWLF FXUUHQF\ VZDSV� DQG FRPPLWPHQWV WR EH VHWWOHG ZLWKLQ � GD\V�

The diversification of Italian investors’ portfolios
into foreign assets intensified in the course of 1997,
owing in part to the declining yields on domestic
financial instruments. Outward portfolio investment
amounted to 108 trillio n lire, twice the figure
recorded in 1996. In the first ten months, financial
companies, households and investment funds made
net purchases of 68.2 trillio n lire worth of foreign
shares, bonds and government securities, compared
with 26.8 trillio n in 1996. Investment in shorter-term
foreign assets, such as bank deposits, declined by
nearly two thirds, from 18.5 trillio n in 1996 to 7
trillio n last year.

Attracted by thegreater stability of theexchange
rateand by expectationsof interest ratereductionsin
Italy, foreignoperatorscontinuedtoeffect substantial

net inward portfolio investment (117.9 trillio n lire,
following an inflow of 125.4 trillio n in 1996).

Figure 15
Italy’sbalanceof payments

on current account and net external position
(as a percentage of GDP)
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Source: For GDP, Istat; 1997 figures are estimated.

(1) Seasonally adjusted; left-hand scale. - (2) Right-hand scale.
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In the first ten months, foreign investors
purchased Italian government securities worth 104.4
trillion lire and shares worth 15.8 trillion, compared
with 69.6 trillion and 10.4 trillion in the same period
of 1996. Fixed rate government paper drew a net
inflow of 74.4 trillion lire, as against 43.3 trillion in
the same months of 1996. Investment in shares was
encouraged by the decline in long-term bond yields.
Thanks to improved confidence in the prospects for
the Italian economy, non-resident investors were less
inclined than in the past to hedge their exchange rate
risk. Initial data indicate that the reverse repurchase
agreements on Italian securities contracted by
resident intermediaries (including non-banks)
amounted to 22.9 per cent of non- residents’ portfolio
investment, compared with 33.4 per cent in the
year-earlier period. Loan activity generated net
capital outflows of almost 21 trillion lire in 1997,
consisting mostly of private residents’ payments to
foreign counterparties, which totaled 28.8 trillion in
the first ten months, much of it in connection with

repurchase agreements. Net repayment of publicly
contracted loans continued, giving rise to an outflow
of 2.6 trillion lire over the period.

Direct outward investment doubled from 10
trillion lire in 1996 to 20.2 trillion, rising from 3.2 to
6.1 per cent of Italian gross fixed capital formation.
This investment was effected mainly by financial
companies and other private Italian corporations.
Most of these funds continued to be directed to the
industrial countries; the remainder went to increase
equity stakes in Latin American corporations.
Foreign direct investment in Italy resulted in a net
capital inflow of 6.8 trillion lire, 33 per cent more than
in 1996. Two thirds of this investment was in Italian
non-financial firms.

The increase in imports resulted in the resumption
of growth in trade credits granted by foreign
suppliers, which produced net inflows of 2.5 trillion
lire over the first ten months, while credits granted by
residents generated outflows of nearly 1.2 trillion.



35,&(6(&2120,& %8//(7,1 � 1R� ��� )(%58$5< ����

��

Prices

In 1997 the average rate of inflation in Italy was
virtually in line with that for the European Union
countries. The differential in relation to France and
Germany narrowed markedly. Since July 1997 the
average variation in the harmonized consumer price
index has been below the convergence “threshold”
established by the Maastricht Treaty (Figure 16).
Consumer price expectations improved steadily;
those for 1998 have recently fallen to 2 per cent.

Figure 16

Harmonized consumer price index:
convergence criterion
(percentage changes)
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plus 1.5 percentage points.

During the year, the upwards pressure on costs
exerted by the strengthening of the dollar and the
pick-up in economic activity caused first producer
prices and then consumer prices in the leading
continental European countries to accelerate
moderately from the especially low levels recorded in
1996.

In Italy, the lag in the beginning of the recovery,
the related uncertainty and the persistence of the
effects of the strengthening of the exchange rate the
previous year delayed the impact of inflationary
pressures until the spring for producer prices and the
summer for retail prices. In addition to the
inflationary factors present in all the European

economies, the large wage increases agreed to within
the framework of contract renewals and the effects of
the increase in VAT rates, although small so far, also
contributed to the upwards pressure on prices.

The annualized, seasonally adjusted three-month
percentage change in the producer prices of non-
energy manufactures gradually increased, peaking
at 2.7 per cent in October and November; that in
the consumer price index for worker and employee
households (the so-called cost-of-living index) rose,
on the basis of the survey results for sample cities,
from slightly less than 1.5 per cent in the first half of
1997 to 2.8 per cent in February 1998.

The available information appears to support the
assessment expressed in theEconomic Bulletin last
October of the temporary nature of the moderate
inflationary impulses. In the rest of Europe inflation
has already begun to slow down, while in Italy the
upwards pressure on prices should ease during 1998
as a result of the continued rigour of monetary policy,
the significant fall in the rate of wage growth in the
private sector, large productivity gains and the fall in
the prices of raw materials, partly in connection with
the crisis in Asia. For producer price inflation, the
results of the Isco business surveys suggest an
inversion in the trend since November 1997; this
appears to be confirmed by the slowdown in the index
last December. For consumer prices, which tend to
adjust to changes in producer prices with a lag,
upwards pressure could persist longer, owing in part
to the possible residual effects of the pass-through of
higher VAT rates. In any case, achieving a positive
inflation situation depends on ensuring that any
legislative changes in working hours do not raise
firms’ unit costs.

Consumer prices

The average annual rise in the index of consumer
prices for worker and employee households,
excluding tobacco products, declined from 3.9 per
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cent in 1996 to 1.7 per cent last year, the lowest figure
since 1968 (Table a16); the rise in the broader general
index of consumer prices, which is a more repre-
sentative measure as it refers to consumption for the
whole population and includes tobacco products, was
slightly larger at 2.0 per cent, compared with 4.0 per
cent in 1996. The harmonized consumer price index
used for European comparisons rose by 1.9 per cent,
as against 4.0 per cent the previous year.

Figure 17

Harmonized consumer price index
in Italy, France, Germany and the EU (1)
(percentage changes on 12 months earlier)
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of the geometric mean of the harmonized indices of the EU countries, weighted using
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The slowdown in the average rate of inflation in
the EU, calculated on the basis of the weighted
average of the member countries’ harmonized
consumer price indices, was much less pronounced,
with the rate falling from 2.4 to 1.7 per cent.
Accordingly, the differential between Italian inflation
and the EU average, which had been 1.6 percentage
points in 1996, narrowed to 0.2 points; the
differentials vis-à-vis France and Germany remain
wider at 0.6 and 0.4 points respectively.

The average inflation rate in the EU and the other
leading countries of continental Europe, calculated
on the basis of the twelve-month changes in the
harmonized indices, reached a low in the spring of
1997 but then accelerated moderately owing to
pressures on producer prices (Figure 17). These
minor pressures subsided during the fourth quarter of
1997 and the early part of this year.

As mentioned, the inflationary pressures
emerged in Italy with a lag of several months. On the
basis of the survey results for sample cities, the
annualized, seasonally adjusted three-month rise in
the consumer price index for worker and employee
households gradually increased, reaching 2.8 per cent
in February this year (Figure 18). The acceleration
was in part due to the effects of the changes in indirect
taxes that were adopted in September 1997. These
effects have been limited so far (they are estimated to
have contributed slightly more than 0.2 percentage
points to the rise in the index) and further
pass-through of the tax increases may occur in the
coming months with the seasonal repricing of
clothing, which bears about half of the burden of the
tax revision, and the revival in consumption.

Figure 18

Consumer price index for worker
and employee households (1)
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(1) The so-called “cost-of-living” index; excluding tobacco products but including

changes in indirect taxes. The index is rounded to two decimal places and is calculated
from data on the component items rounded to one decimal place. - (2) Annualized and
seasonally adjusted.

The twelve-month changes in the index, which
only reflect trend changes with a lag, hit a low of 1.4
per cent last September; since then they have risen
slowly, reaching 1.8 per cent in February.

The acceleration in consumer prices reflects
that in the prices of all goods and services not subject
to controls. The annualized, seasonally adjusted
three-month increase in the prices of goods other than
food and energy products rose from about 1 per cent
to above 2 per cent in the last part of the year (Figure
19). Their behaviour reflected, with the usual lag, the
acceleration in the corresponding producer prices
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(Figure 20) and the effects of the changes in VAT
rates. The annualized, seasonally adjusted rate of
increase in the prices of services not subject to
controls also appear to have accelerated from the
autumn onwards. The prices of food products started
to rise again owing to an increase first in the producer
prices of processed foods and then a sharp rise in the
prices of fresh products.

Figure 19
Consumer price index for worker

and employee households:
components not subject to official price controls (1)

(seasonally adjusted;
annualized percentage changes on 3 months earlier)
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Figure 20
Consumer and producer prices

not subject to official control
of non--food and non--energy products

(seasonally adjusted;
annualized percentage changes on 3 months earlier)
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producer prices of manufactures for the domestic market.

Looking ahead, the consolidation of the low rate
of inflation that has been achieved will be assisted by
the further deregulation of several public services, the

recent measure reorganizing the fuel distribution
network and the steps taken to liberalize shop licences
and reform a number of professional associations.

Producer prices and the import and export prices
of manufactures

The producer prices of manufactures for the
domestic market rose on average by 1.3 per cent in
1997 (1.9 per cent in 1996; Table a17) - the smallest
increase since 1986 - as a result of a rise of 0.8 per cent
in non-energy prices and of 4.3 per cent in energy
prices (respectively 1.7 and 3.4 per cent in 1996).

Figure 21

Index of the producer prices of manufactures
for the domestic market in Italy and Germany
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The outcome for the year primarily reflected the
sharp deceleration in producer price inflation in 1996
and the early months of 1997 associated with the
recovery of the lira and the stagnation of domestic
demand. From the spring onwards the restraining
force of these factors diminished and the pressure
exerted on prices by the strengthening of the dollar
and the one-off effects of new wage agreements
caused producer prices to accelerate slightly; the
figures for December suggest that producer prices
may have reversed their trend. The pattern corre-
sponds, with a lag of some months, to that registered
in the other leading continental European countries:
an acceleration from the beginning of the year until
the summer, followed by a slowdown. The producer
price inflation differential with respect to Germany,
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which had been around one percentage point in the
second half of 1996, disappeared in the second and
third quarters of 1997; it reappeared towards the end
of the year with values of around 0.5 percentage
points, or slightly more than the consumer price
differential (Figure 21).

The annualized three-month changes in the
seasonally adjusted index excluding energy products
increased from small negative values at the beginning
of the year to a maximum of 2.7 per cent in October
and November; the figure for December was
significantly lower, 2.2 per cent (Figure 22).

Figure 22

Index of the producer prices of manufactures
for the domestic market, excluding energy products

(percentage changes)

19971996199519941993
-2

0

2

4

6

8

10

12

14

-2

0

2

4

6

8

10

12

14

on preceding month (1)
on 3 months earlier (1)
on 12 months earlier

Source: Based on Istat data.
(1) Annualized and seasonally adjusted.

The gradual easing of the pressures on industrial
firms’ costs in recent months should help to attenuate
the effects of the expansion in economic activity. This
is suggested by the Isco survey of industrial firms,
the results of which at the beginning of 1997 had
correctly anticipated the acceleration in output prices
(Figure 23). The survey shows that, despite the sharp
improvement in expectations concerning orders, the
difference between the number of firms intending
respectively to raise and lower their prices in the short
term has declined on a seasonally adjusted basis since
November 1997 after increasing almost continuously
for ten months. In addition, the present level of
producer price inflation is lower than in comparable
phases of earlier cycles: the capacity utilization rate
is at its maximum level since 1990 (Figure 24) and
profit margins are historically high. The structural
nature of Italy’s disinflation is thus confirmed.

Figure 23

Intended changes in producer prices and firms’
expectations for orders in the following 3--4 months

(seasonally adjusted; percentages) (1)
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negative replies (“reduction”). - (2) Moving averages of the three months ending in the
month indicated.

At the sectoral level, the rise in the prices of
intermediate products, which had been the first to
accelerate, appears to have come to a halt; the
indications provided by the Isco survey mentioned
earlier corroborate this view. Turning to consumer
goods, the annualized three-month changes in the
seasonally adjusted index excluding food and energy
products, which is less affected by short-term
fluctuations in the prices of basic commodities and
provides a more accurate picture of the underlying
trend of inflation, gradually increased over the year,

Figure 24

Capacity utilization, producer prices
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from nearly zero to more than 1.5 per cent, and then
declined to just over 1 per cent in December. The
prices of food products show a similar pattern to those
of the relevant commodities in international markets:
an acceleration until the summer, followed by a
slowdown.

The average unit value in lire of exports of
manufactures excluding energy products declined by
1.3 per cent in the first eleven months compared with
the corresponding period of 1996 (Table a18). Since
there was virtually no change in the export-weighted
exchange rate of the lira in this period, this reflects the
intention of Italian manufacturers to make good the
previous year’s loss of competitiveness by accepting
a narrowing of their profit margins in foreign
markets. Examination of the behaviour of the index
over the year shows that export unit values bottomed
in the summer (Figure 25) and that in November the
twelve-month rise amounted to 1.4 per cent.

Figure 25

Export and import unit values in lire of manufactures,
excluding energy products, and the exchange rate of the lira

(indices, 1992=100)
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The average unit value in lire of imports of
manufactures excluding energy products declined by
1.3 per cent overall in the first eleven months
compared with the corresponding period of 1996

(Table a19). This result was due entirely to the sharp
fall registered in 1996 in connection with the strong
recovery of the lira. Average unit values of imports
rose in the first three quarters of the year, but the
increase subsequently came to a halt, in line with the
behaviour of the producer prices of Italy’s main
trading partners. The twelve-month rate of growth in
the index increased steadily and reached 3.2 per cent
in November, 1.6 percentage points more than the rise
in the domestic producer prices of the corresponding
aggregate.

Manufacturing firms’ costs and profit margins

On the basis of provisional estimates,
manufacturing industry’s unit variable costs in-
creased at an average rate of 2.1 per cent in 1997,
compared with 3.3 per cent the previous year (Table
12). Unlike 1996, the deceleration is attributable to

Table 12

Unit variable costs and final prices
in manufacturing (1)
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the behaviour of domestic costs. Costs behaved
differently in the two halves of the year, accelerating
in the first before slowing down in the second, mainly
owing to the sharp slowdown in unit labour costs.

Changes in the share of profits in the value added
of the manufacturing sector were negatively
correlated with those in costs (Figure 26). Given the
uncertainty of the recovery in output, in the first half
of last year firms absorbed the rise in costs by
allowing margins to narrow, leaving output prices
unchanged overall; they subsequently widened unit
margins as the recovery strengthened, although the
increase was modest, partly in view of their already
high level. The average share of profits in value added
fell slightly in 1997 as a whole, although it remains at
a historically high level.

Figure 26
Share of profits in value added

and real wages in manufacturing
(percentage points and percentage changes) (1)
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(1) Moving averages of the reference quarter and the preceding quarter. - (2) Share

of gross operating profits in the value added of manufacturing industry, calculated by
attributing the same unit incomes to the self-employed as those earned by employees.
Right-hand scale. - (3) Gross earnings per employee deflated using the consumer price
index for worker and employee households. Percentage changes on year-earlier quarter.
Left-hand scale.

The prices of imported inputs fell by an average
of 1.1 per cent in 1997, owing to the progressive
decline recorded in 1996. A small decline in the first
half of the year was followed by sharp rise in the
second, reflecting with a lag the appreciation of the
dollar, which until the third quarter more than offset
the fall in the dollar prices of raw materials (Figure
27); the values in lire also declined, but not until the
final months of the year.

The dollar and lira prices of oil fell sharply from
their levels at the end of 1996. The excess supply

underlying the decline increased further in the last
few months of the year and is expected to persist in the
first half of 1998, as OPEC raised its production
ceiling at its December meeting in Djakarta, while
demand has fallen off in the countries of Southeast
Asia. The dollar prices of non-energy raw materials
(especially those of food products, beverages and
metals) increased in the first half of 1997 but
subsequently declined, partly owing to the worsening
of the Asian crisis.

Figure 27

Dollar prices of primary commodities
and the lira/dollar exchange rate

(indices, 1990=100)
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The prices of domestic inputs rose by an average
of 2.5 per cent last year, compared with 4.9 per cent
in 1996. Unit labour costs increased by 2.3 per cent,
compared with 4.9 per cent the previous year; in the
second half of the year the slowdown in the rate of
wage growth, which fell to an annualized, seasonally
adjusted 3.1 per cent from 5.2 per cent in the first half,
and the consolidation of the recovery in productivity
allowed labour costs to move towards the level of
those in the other leading European countries, from
which they had diverged at the beginning of 1996
(Figure 28). In the last few months unit labour costs
have slowed nearly to a halt.
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Figure 28

Unit labour costs in manufacturing
in Italy, France, Germany and the EU

(percentage changes on year--earlier period) (1)
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(1) Moving averages of the reference quarter and the preceding quarter. - (2) Calculated

on the basis of the geometric mean of unit labour costs in the following countries: Belgium,
Denmark, France, Germany, Italy, the Netherlands, Spain and the United Kingdom;
weighted using average GDP translated into the same currency in the period 1993-95.

Nearly 80 per cent of labour contracts in
manufacturing industry and 50 per cent in market
services were renewed last year. After the agreement
reached with metal and engineering workers in
February 1997, contract renewals in the
manufacturing sector (construction, food products,
textiles and footwear, leather and leather products)
fully incorporated the decline in inflation
expectations, significantly reducing wage increases.
In addition, the dispute over the difference between
actual and planned inflation in 1995 and 1996 was
resolved without introducing automatic mechanisms
to recoup lost purchasing power. Real wages in manu-
facturing began to rise again in the second half of
1996, increasing by an average of 2.4 per cent over the
first three quarters of 1997 compared with the same
period a year earlier; before taxes, the rise offset the
decline in previous years. The bargaining round had
a markedly different outcome in the main public
utilities, where wage increases appear large,
especially in consideration of the sector’s need to
restructure and contain unit costs.

Inflation expectations

Inflation expectations improved steadily over all
time-spans throughout 1997 and into early 1998,
converging towards the level in the other leading
European countries.

The various indicators available continued to
signal expectations of a slight increase in consumer
price inflation for the firstpartof1998.TheDecember
surveys carried out byConsensus Forecasts and
Forum-Mondo Economico showed expectations of a
small rise in the twelve-month rate of consumer price
inflation in the first two quarters of 1998 from its level
in the last quarterof 1997 (Figure 29).The Iscosurvey
of households pointed to a slight increase in the
second half of 1997 in the proportion of those
expecting an increase in inflation in the subsequent
twelve months (Figure 30), especially following the
increase in VAT at the beginning of October last year;
the survey at the beginning of 1998 showed
expectations improving again.

Figure 29
Forum--ME expectations of consumer price inflation

in the next two quarters (1)
(percentage changes on year--earlier period)
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Figure 30
Households’ expectations of the behaviour

of consumer prices in the next twelve months
(percentages of total replies) (1)
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Figure 31

Expectations of professional forecasters concerning
average consumer price inflation in 1998 and 1999

in Italy, France, Germany and the EU
(percentage changes)
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(1) Average of the forecasts for the national consumer price indices (for Italy, the

consumer price index for worker and employee households) for the EU, excluding
Luxembourg; weighted using average final consumption translated into the same
currency in the period 1993-95.

The surveys of professional forecasters made by
Consensus Forecasts reveal expectations of a gradual
reduction in consumer price inflation in Italy in 1998.
The February survey, conducted in the first half of the
month, showed expected inflation at 2 per cent, lower
than the average rate forecast for the European Union
and slightly higher than that for Germany and France
(Figure 31). Initial expectations for 1999, contained

in the January survey, are for inflation in Italy to
remain broadly stable at the levels expected for this
year.

The behaviour of the one-year forward rate nine
years ahead provides an indication of investors’
assessment of the durability of the disinflationary
process. In February, the indicator fell to a new low
in both absolute terms (6.3 per cent) and in terms of
the differential with corresponding German yields,
which is now nil (Figure 32).

Figure 32
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basis of the rates on Eurolira and Euromark interest rate swaps. Monthly averages of daily
data; for February, the average of the first two ten-day periods. - (2) Left-hand scale. -
(3) Percentage points. Right-hand scale.
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The public finances

Results in 1997

The adjustment of Italy’s public finances made
considerable progress in 1997 notwithstanding the
limited growth of the economy. According to the
official figures released by Istat, general government
net borrowing was 52.2 trillion lire, or 2.7 per cent
of GDP, which is within the limit of 3 per cent
established by the Maastricht Treaty; compared with
1996, it fell by 4 percentage points. The reduction of
the public debt in relation to GDP gathered pace; the
ratio declined from 124 per cent in 1996 to 121.6 per
cent (Table 13).

Table 13

General government net borrowing and debt
(billions of lire)
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The figure for net borrowing, which does not
include the tax revenue arising on UIC’s sale of gold
to the Bank of Italy, was achieved through an increase
in the primary surplus and a reduction in interest
payments. The large budget correction resulted in the
primary surplus rising from 77.2 to 132.9 trillion lire
and from 4.1 to 6.8 per cent of GDP. The fall in lira

yields brought a reduction in interest payments from
10.8 to 9.5 per cent of GDP (Figure 33).

Figure 33
General government net borrowing,

primary balance and interest payments
(as a percentage of GDP)
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Source: Based on Istat data.

The effects of the budget are estimated at around
three percentage points of GDP, or only a little less
than planned. The measures mainly concerned
revenue, which rose from 46.5 per cent of GDP in
1996 to 48.8 per cent, a value close to the peak
registered in 1993 and about 2 percentage points
above the EU average. The contribution of spending
cuts to the increase in the primary surplus was small:
expenditure excluding interest payments declined by
0.3 percentage points to 42 per cent of GDP. Capital
expenditure fell from 4 to 3.5 per cent of GDP, while
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current expenditure excluding interest payments rose
from 38.3 to 38.5 per cent.

The reduction in net borrowing produced by
temporary measures is estimated to have been about
1 percentage point of GDP.

The fall of 2.4 percentage points in the ratio of the
public debt to GDP followed that of nearly one point
in the two preceding years taken together (Figure 34).
Privatization receipts contributed to the result, while
the limited growth in GDP and the increase in the lira
equivalent of the debt denominated in foreign
currency, primarily owing to the appreciation of the
dollar, acted in the opposite direction.

Figure 34

Change in the ratio of general
government debt to GDP

and its components (1)
(percentage points)
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(1) The change in the debt-to-GDP ratio can be decomposed in: primary net
borrowing in relation to GDP, where a minus sign indicates a surplus; interest payments
in relation to GDP; the “growth” factor, obtained by multiplying the debt-to-GDP ratio of
the previous year by the rate of increase in nominal GDP; a residual item, expressed as
a ratio to GDP and comprising primarily the issue discounts on government securities, the
effects of exchange rate changes on the debt denominated in foreign currencies,
privatization receips, settlements of past debts and financial items.

Receipts of direct taxes, which do not include the
personal income surtax or the levy on severance pay
provisions introduced in the budget and accounted for
as capital revenue, rose by 9 per cent, or more than
twice as much as nominal GDP (4.2 per cent). The
increase reflected the rapid growth in earnings
following the implementation of new wage
agreements and the effects of the budget for 1997 (see
Economic Bulletin no. 24, 1997). Receipts of indirect
taxes rose by 7.7 per cent and social security
contributions by 6.8 per cent as a result of the budget,
the recovery in economic activity and the increase in
VAT rates introduced in October.

Taken together, direct and indirect taxes, social
security contributions and capital taxes rose from
42.4 per cent of GDP in 1996 to 44.3 per cent in 1997.

The adjustment on the expenditure side consisted
primarily of reductions in transfer payments to
non-state public bodies and public utilities and
measures to curb outlays on health services and public
employment. The latest data available suggest that the
reductions in expenditure achieved were basically in
line with the objectives embodied in the Relazione
trimestrale di cassa published in April 1997, the first
official document to incorporate the accounting
changes approved by Eurostat (see Economic Bulletin
no. 24, 1997) and the estimated effects of the budget.

The restrictions on appropriations and spending
authorizations, certain types of local authority
expenditure and withdrawals by non-state public
bodies from their centralized Treasury accounts
helped to curb expenditure. In addition, it was
decided to block budget transfers to these accounts if
the balances exceeded given thresholds, thereby
sharply reducing the amounts immediately spendable
(see Economic Bulletin no. 25, 1997). The firm action
with regard to cash outlays led, notwithstanding the
aforementioned limits on appropriations, to an
expansion in expenditure arrears in the accounts of
the state sector and presumably in those of non-state
public bodies. The Government has recently adopted
measures aimed at reducing such arrears and
modifying the mechanisms governing both their
formation and their transferability from one financial
year to another.

General government expenditure excluding
interest payments rose by 3.4 per cent, which was less
than in 1966 (6 per cent) and below the growth in
nominal GDP. The result was nonetheless influenced
by the contraction of around 9 per cent in capital
expenditure in connection with the fall in investment
grants and the drying up of tax refunds. Current
expenditure excluding interest payments rose by 4.7
per cent.

General government intermediate consumption
rose moderately and production subsidies declined,
but spending on social security benefits grew faster
than GDP. Notwithstanding the curb imposed by the
reforms introduced since 1992, this item increased by
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The main items of the general government accounts

Expenditure

According to Istat’s preliminary estimates, general
government expenditureamountedto just under 1,005trillion
li re, an increaseof 1 per cent on 1996. Interest payments fell
by 8.5 per cent, while primary expenditure rose by 3.4 per
cent,asagainst 6per cent in1996; thisaggregate nonetheless
declined slightly in relation to GDP, from42.3 to 42 per cent.

The large reduction of 17.2 trillio n li re in interest
payments, which had remained virtually unchanged between
1995 and 1996, does not reflect the full effect of the fall in
yields at issue in 1996 and was only marginally due to their
further fall in 1997 (the average gross yield on the three
maturities of Treasury bills fell from 10.5 per cent in
December 1995 to 6.7 per cent in December 1996 and to 4.9
per cent in December 1997). A contribution to thereduction
in interest payments was made by the large volume of net
redemptions of Treasury bill s (around 83 trillio n li re), the
interest on which is recorded at issue.

As regards primary expenditure, the fall of 10 per cent
in investment grants and production subsidies was coupled
with relatively large increases in social security benefits
(6.2 per cent), compensation of employees(5.3 per cent) and
investment (7.4 per cent). Other capital expendituredeclined
significantly, from 8.6 to 1.8 trillio n li re, as a result of the
drying up of tax refunds in securities.

Social securitybenefitsrosefrom19.2 to19.6per cent of
GDP. The increase of 6.2 per cent in disbursements, down
from 7.5 per cent in 1996, was due to the rise in pension
outlays, while unemployment benefits and severance pay-
ments are estimated to have remained basically unchanged.
Pensionoutlayswereboostednot onlyby theannual inflation
adjustment but alsobythelargenumber of personsretiringon
length-of servicepensionsandtheincreaseinbenefitspaidby
thepension fundsof public employeesand theself-employed.

The rise in compensation of employees dropped from
8.4 to 5.3 per cent. The growth in this item reflected the
substantial rise (12 per cent) in the social security
contributions paid by general government owing to the
harmonization of contribution rates as part of the reform of
the pension system and the large increase in the payment
madeto financethedeficit of theSocial Security Institutefor
Public Employees (INPDAP). Gross per capita earnings in
general government grew by around 2.8 per cent. This result
was influenced by the contributions referring to prior years
paid by central government departments in 1996. Excluding
theseone-off payments, thegrowthinper capitaearningswas
about 4.3 per cent. The number of employees is estimated to
have fallen further, by around 1 per cent; compared with the
peak in 1992, public employment has declined by 4.5
percentage points.

General government revenue and expenditure
(billions of lire; percentage changes)
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The fall in production subsidies and investment grants
and the virtual stability of intermediate consumption reflect
the nature of the corrective action taken in 1997. The
restrictions introduced on budget disbursements are likely to
have had a particularly pronounced effect on central
government intermediate consumption, while the first two
items were curbed by the decrease in transfer payments to
public enterprises, especially the former autonomous
government agencies and the Government Agency for
Intervention on the Agricultural Market (AIMA). In order to
make good the shortfall, public enterprises substantially
reduced the balances they held with the system of centralized
Treasury accounts and the banking system. The fall in
production subsidies was partly offset by the sum paid to the
State Railways to bolster its pension fund. This disbursement
did not affect general government net borrowing since the
State Railways transferred the entire amount to the pension
fund.

The increase in investment (7.4 per cent, as against 9.7
in 1996) was the result of a rise in disbursements by local
authorities and a fall in those by central government. The
increase was smaller than in 1996 and left investment almost
unchanged in relation to GDP.

Revenue

General government revenue grew by 9.5 per cent
compared with 1996. Current revenue expanded by 8.5 per
cent or more than 73 trillion lire and capital revenue by nearly
9 trillion lire, primarily in connection with the large receipts
of one-off taxes. The ratio of current revenue to GDP rose by
nearly 2 percentage points, with all the main items
contributing to the increase. Compared with nominal GDP
growth of 4.2 per cent, direct taxes grew by 9 per cent, indirect
taxes by 7.7 per cent and social security contributions by 6.8
per cent. Other current revenue grew by 16.1 per cent, of
which around two thirds was due to the payment made to the
pension fund of the State Railways discussed above.

Direct tax revenue rose from 15.2 to 15.9 per cent of GDP.
The increase of nearly 9 per cent in Irpef receipts reflected the
growth in the tax base, the incomplete offsetting of fiscal drag
and the reduction in tax relief for medical expenses and
mortgage interest. Irpeg and Ilor receipts were boosted by the
increase in the base in 1996 as a consequence of changes in
the deductibility of certain expenses and the large profits
banks earned on securities as a result of the fall in interest
rates. Another positive factor was the increase in the size of

the payment on account when the taxation of the bond income
of legal persons was revised. Receipts of the flat-rate tax on
interest income fell by more than 11 per cent owing to the
exclusion from the base of the bond income of legal persons
and the fall in interest rates.

Indirect tax revenue rose from 11.8 to 12.2 per cent of
GDP, with business taxes increasing by 7.3 per cent. VAT
receipts rose by more than 5 per cent, as a consequence of
the recovery in economic activity and the rate changes
introduced on 1 October 1997. Receipts of other business
taxes rose as a result of the introduction during the year of a
requirement for tax farmers to make payments on account.
Excise duties and sales taxes rose by just over 2 per cent,
notwithstanding the fall in the yield from mineral oil products
in the first half of the year owing to the decline in con-
sumption. Gaming taxes yielded an additional 21 per cent
following the increase in the frequency of closing dates.
Revenue from products subject to state monopoly remained
virtually unchanged.

Social security contributions rose from 15.1 to 15.5 per
centofGDP.Since thebaseexpanded in line withGDP, the rise
was due to the increase in rates for public and private sector
employees and the self-employed. The receipts produced by
the contributions condonation scheme declined from more
than 3.5 trillion lire to just over 2 trillion. The increase of a
little more than 5 per cent in contributions for private sector
employees benefited from the reduction of 4.6 percentage
points in the social security contributions relief granted to
firms in the South and the diminution in health contributions
relief, which differed by region and sector of production. The
factors underlying the large rise in thecontributions forpublic
employees (12 per cent) have been analyzed above in the
comment on compensation of employees. The contributions of
the self-employed are estimated to have risen by slightly less
than 8 per cent as a result of the increase in the rates payable
by artisans and wholesalers and retailers and the full-year
receipts of contributions to the new fund run by INPS for
quasi-employee free-lance workers.

Capital revenue virtually doubled, rising from 9 to 18.2
trillion lire owing to the attribution of the receipts of the
so-called Europe tax. These were less than had been expected
but nonetheless amounted to 11.4 trillion lire, of which 6.6
trillion generated by the levy on severance pay provisions and
4.8 trillion by the personal income surtax.

The fiscal ratio, defined as the ratio to GDP of direct
taxes, indirect taxes, social security contributions and capital
taxes, rose by 1.9 percentage points, from 42.4 to 44.3 per
cent.
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6.2percentandrose from19.2 to19.6percent ofGDP.
Public sector wages and salaries grew by 5.3 per cent;
part of the increase was due to the raising of the social
security contribution rates paid by public employers.
When the data are adjusted to exclude some purely
accounting items, the increase in per capita earnings
in the public sector was 4.3 per cent (see box).

Table 14
State sector balances

(billions of lire)
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The state sector borrowing requirement, ex-
cluding settlements of past debts and privatization
receipts, amounted to 52.7 trillion lire, or around 76
trillion less than in 1996 (Table 14). The Treasury was
able to drastically curtail its financing through the
issue of securities in the domestic market. Issue
policy aimed at further lengthening the average
maturity of the debt. Sales of Treasury bills were cut
back substantially and the share of Treasury credit
certificates in net issues of longer-term securities was
reduced (see the Chapter on Monetary Policy,
Banking and the Financial Markets). The success in
increasing the proportion of the debt consisting of
Treasury bonds in recent years has reduced the
sensitiveness of interest payments to movements in
lira yields. Today, a one percentage point change in
interest rates results in a change in the cost of the debt
over one year of around 0.3 per cent of GDP.

Budgetary policy in 1997

The objective of keeping the ratio of net
borrowing to GDP within the limit of 3 per cent was
pursued by providing in the Finance Law and the
accompanying measures for an adjustment of 46.5
trillion lire, of which 28 trillion in the form of
additional revenue.

The fiscal adjustment was completed by the
introduction of supplementary measures amounting
to around 16 trillion lire at the end of March in
response to the poorer-than expected performance of
the economy and a more cautious assessment of the
effects of the measures contained in the budget. The
total planned adjustment thus amounted to 62.5
trillion lire and comprised 38 trillion of additional
revenue and 24 trillion of expenditure cuts.
Accounting changes led to a further reduction in net
borrowing of around 16 trillion lire.

According to the information currently available,
the overall effect of the adjustment measures was
slightly less than predicted. Most of the difference
concerned revenue, notably receipts of the personal
income surtax and the levy on severance pay
provisions.

The results for 1997 benefited from around 1.4
trillion lire of extra revenue as a result of the increase
in VAT rates introduced in the last quarter. Although
this measure had originally been planned as part of
the budget for 1998, the date for its entry into force
was brought forward to 1 October 1997 in order to
bolster revenue. A further boost was provided by the
faster-than-expected growth in economic activity in
the last few months of the year.

The accounts also reflect the effects of temporary
measures, which, taken together, are estimated to
have reduced the budget deficit by around 1
percentage point of GDP, as mentioned earlier. The
temporary measures in the budget for 1997 reduced
net borrowing by around 1.1 percentage points. Some
two thirds of the reduction was attributable to
measures that will not have any effect in subsequent
years (primarily the personal income surtax), while
the others will have a negative effect (notably the levy
on severance pay provisions). On the other hand,
around 0.1 percentage points of the 1997 deficit can
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be attributed to prior-year measures that reduced
revenue last year but whose effects will wane in the
coming years (part of the social security contributions
relief granted to firms in the South and investment
subsidies).

The public finances of the leading EU countries (1)

In 1991, the year in which the convergence
criteria were established at Maastricht, net borrowing
in Italy exceeded 10 per cent of GDP. In France and
the United Kingdom the budget deficit was less than
3 per cent of GDP, in Germany it was 3.3 per cent
(Table 15). The trend in Italy was nonetheless
different from that of the other three countries.

In Italy, while net borrowing remained basically
stable, from the mid-eighties onwards there was a
progressive improvement in the balance excluding
interest payments as a result of the rise in revenue;
primary expenditure remained virtually unchanged.
In the other three countries the situation deteriorated
to a varying degree from a position of near balance at
the end of the eighties (Figure 35). The deterioration
was largely determined by the slowdown in economic
activity, which took place earlier in the United
Kingdom, and in Germany’scasealso by thecost of
the country’s reunification. In all three countries
primary expenditure rose (Figure 36), while in the
United Kingdom revenue continued to decline
(Figure37). Interest paymentsincreasedeverywhere.

In 1993 Italy intensified its adjustment effort.
Faced with severe tensions in the foreign exchange
and financial markets, measures were adopted to
bring the budget deficit under control and impose
curbs of a structural nature on the expansion of the
main expenditure items. In the other leading
European countries the worsening of the budget
balancescontinued.

(1) The discussion of the budget balances in this section
refers throughout to their values in relation to GDP.

Table 15

General government accounts
of the leading EU countries (1)

(as percentage of GDP)
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��� ,Q RUGHU WR HQKDQFH LQWHUQDWLRQDO FRPSDUDELOLW\� WKH RIILFLDO GDWD KDYH EHHQ
PRGLILHG� ,Q SDUWLFXODU� UHYHQXH GRHV QRW LQFOXGH FDSLWDO UHYHQXH RWKHU WKDQ FDSLWDO
WD[HV� ZKLFK DUH GHGXFWHG IURP SULPDU\ H[SHQGLWXUH� )RU WKH GHEW ILJXUHV DPLQXV VLJQ
LQGLFDWHV D VXUSOXV� �� ��� 8QWLO ���� WKH ILJXUHV UHIHU WR :HVW *HUPDQ\� )RU ���� WKH
ILJXUHV IRU WKH ZHVWHUQ UHJLRQV DUH JLYHQ LQ EUDFNHWV�
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Figure 35

Net borrowing and primary net borrowing
in the leading EU countries

(as a percentage of GDP)
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Sources: Based on Istat data (for Italy) and European Commission data.
(1) Western regions until 1990.

In the years that followed, the rigorous measures
adopted and the more favourable economic con-
ditions enabled Italy to reduce the relative size of its
budget deficit, even though progress was irregular.
The situation also improved in the other three
countries.

In the United Kingdom the deterioration in the
public finances came to a halt in 1994 and the budget
deficit subsequently returned to its level at the
beginning of the nineties, close to 2 per cent of GDP.
The improvement reflected an increase in revenue
coupled with a reduction in expenditure from the peak
registered in 1993. The budget deficit also declined in
France from 1994 onwards as a result of an increase
in revenue and a reduction in expenditure. In 1997 it
came into line with the convergence criterion. In
Germany net borrowing was close to 3 per cent of

Figure 36
Primary expenditure, interest payments and
total expenditure in the leading EU countries

(as a percentage of GDP)
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Figure 37
Fiscal revenue in the leading EU countries (1)

(as a percentage of GDP)
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GDP in 1993; in view of the subsequent fall in
revenue and increase in interest payments, the
achievement of a ratio of 2.7 per cent in 1997 was
accompanied by a fall of about 2 percentage points in
primary expenditure.

In Italy the efforts made to consolidate the budget
radically modified the size of the main aggregates of
the public finances. In 1997 the ratio of revenue to
GDP was some 10 percentage points higher than in
the mid-eighties and exceeded the EU average by
around 2 points. Over the same period primary
expenditure fell by 1.4 percentage points to below the
EU average. Despite the sharp fall in interest

payments since 1993, in 1997 they were 1.7 points
higher than in 1985 and some 4 points above the EU
average.

In Germany and France, by contrast, the changes
in revenue and primary expenditure were relatively
small, apart from short-term fluctuations; interest
payments nonetheless increased in both countries.

The United Kingdom was the only country of the
four considered to reduce the size of the budget.
Between 1985 and 1997 revenue fell by more than
3 percentage points of GDP to 38 per cent, some
8 points below the EU average.
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Monetary policy, banking and the financial markets

As the improvement in expectations confirmed
the curbing of inflation and the public finances
proved to be in line with the Government’s
objectives, monetary conditions were made less
restrictive in 1997 against the background of a
recovery in economic activity.

The caution with which monetary policy was
eased helped contain the inflationary pressures
stemming from the appreciation of the dollar, the
sustained rise in labour costs and the increase in
indirect taxes; it also curbed the excessive growth in
the monetary aggregates and fostered a further
narrowing of the long-term interest rate differential
between Italy and the leading European countries.
The Italian financial and foreign exchange markets
were only marginally affected by the turbulence
emanating from the Asian crisis and by political
events at home and abroad. The lira remained
slightly above its central exchange rate against the
German mark.

Growing confidence in the improvement in
Italian economic fundamentals on the part of the
international financial markets, fosteredinter alia by
the prudent monetary policy stance, stimulated
foreign demand for government securities,
especially Treasury bonds. In February 1997 the
yield on 10-year bonds fell below the convergence
threshold set in the Maastricht Treaty, and by the end
of the year it was almost one percentage point below
that level. The yield differential in relation to
corresponding German securities declined from 1.8
to 0.3 percentage points in the course of the year; at
the end of February 1998 it amounted to 0.4 points.
Towards the end of last year the forward differential
between Italian and German interest rates became
negligible for periods after 1 January 1999 and the
forward lira/DM exchange rate for that date
approached the central EMS rate. In January
renewed uncertainty about EMU led to a modest

increase in the forward differentials and a slight
depreciation of the lira.

Bank interest rates continued to fall throughout
the year. The average rate on short-term lira loans
came down by almost 4 percentage points in real
terms and by 1.8 points in nominal terms; the
nominal deposit rate decreased by a comparable
amount.

The M2 money supply increased by 9.8 per cent
in 1997, a rate of growth in line with the provisional
figures prepared at the end of the summer but well
above both the forecasts made in 1996 and the
increase in nominal GDP. In the last four months of
the year the growth in the aggregate came to a halt,
owing partly to the easing of the uncertainty that had
favoured the earlier acceleration (seeEconomic
Bulletin no. 25, October 1997).

Italian households further increased their
recourse to institutions specializing in asset
management in 1997. Investment funds and portfolio
management services recorded a net inflow of about
230 trillion lire, more than twice the figure for 1996,
which had itself been substantial. The international
diversification of Italian portfolios also continued
and intensified. In the first three quarters of 1997
direct investment abroad by households amounted to
24.5 trillion lire and investment funds purchased
foreign assets worth 42.8 trillion. Foreign financial
assets rose from 4.7 per cent of households’
portfolios at the end of 1996 to 5.6 per cent in
September, owing partly to the appreciation of the
dollar and the strong performance of international
stock markets; in the case of investment funds the
ratio rose from 15.7 to 25.1 per cent.

Total credit to the non-state sector increased by
5.2 per cent, a rate broadly in line with the forecasts
(Table 16); lending accelerated towards the end of
the year in connection with the recovery in economic
activity and investment and the reduction in real
bank lending rates; demand for short-term loans to
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finance the purchase of financial assets was also a
contributory factor.

Preliminary data suggest that bank profitability
remained very low in 1997. The decrease in net
interest income appears to have been offset by an
increase in income from services; the indications are
that operating costs rose slightly. As operating profit
appears to have been virtually unchanged, net profit
may have been lower than in 1996, given the
substantial charges some banks made against asset
items.

Monetary policy and the exchange rate of the lira

The easing of monetary policy became more
pronounced towards the end of the year. The cut of
0.75 percentage points in the discount rate and the
rate on fixed-term advances on 23 December brought
the overall reduction in official rates in 1997 to 2
points (Figure 38). Real 3-month interest rates
continued to decline, falling by 0.4 percentage points
in the final quarter of the year (Figure 39).

Table 16
Credit and financial assets

(percentages; end--of--period data)

���PRQWK UDWHV
RI FKDQJH

6KDUH RI
RXWVWDQGLQJ

VWRFNV

'HF�
����

'HF�
���� ���

'HF�
����

'HF�
���� ���

7RWDO FUHGLW � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ��� ��� ����� �����
)LQDQFH WR WKH QRQ�VWDWH VHFWRU ��� ��� ���� ����

IURP EDQNV � � � � � � ��� ��� ���� ����
ERQGV � � � � � � � � � � � ����� ������ ��� ���
IRUHLJQ ILQDQFH � � � ����� ��� ��� ���

)LQDQFLDO DVVHWV RI WKH
QRQ�VWDWH VHFWRU ��� � � � � � � � ��� ��� ����� �����

'RPHVWLF � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ��� ��� ���� ����
OLTXLG DVVHWV � � � � � � � � � ����� ����� ���� ����

0� ��� � � � � � � � � � � � ��� ��� ���� ����
PHGLXP DQG ORQJ�WHUP
JRYHUQPHQW VHFXULWLHV ��� ��� ���� ����
LQYHVWPHQW IXQG XQLWV
DQG RWKHU ��� � � � � � � � ���� ���� ��� ����

)RUHLJQ � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ���� ���� ��� ����

��� 3URYLVLRQDO� �� ��� 1HW RI VKDUHV� �� ��� *URZWK UDWHV DUH FDOFXODWHG IURPPRQWKO\
DYHUDJHV� �� ��� ,QYHVWPHQW IXQG XQLWV� QRQ�VWDWH VHFWRU DVVHWV ZLWK EDQNV� VXUHW\
GHSRVLWV RI ILUPV� DW\SLFDO VHFXULWLHV DQG 5HSXEOLF RI ,WDO\ ERQGV KHOG E\ WKH QRQ�VWDWH
VHFWRU�

Figure 38

Official interest rates and money and financial market rates
(percentages)
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Figure 39
Real interest rate on 3--month funds

and the real effective exchange rate of the lira
(percentages and index numbers)
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(1) Right-hand scale. Index, 1993=100. An increase indicates an appreciation.
Moving averages for the three months ending in the month indicated. For the
methodology, see the article “Nuovi indicatori di tasso di cambio effettivo nominale e
reale”, in Banca d’Italia, Bollettino Economico, no. 30, 1998. - (2) Left-hand scale. Interest
rate on 3-month Eurolira deposits, deflated using the annualized change over the
preceding three months in the seasonally adjusted cost-of-living index net of indirect
taxes. Moving average for the three months ending in the month indicated.

The differential between Italian and German
3-month interbank rates narrowed by 1.8 percentage
points during the year to 2.3 points as a result of a
modest increase in DM rates and a substantial
decrease of 1.2 points in lira rates. In October the
Bundesbank raised its repo rate by 0.3 percentage
points, whereas lira rates remained broadly
unchanged. At the end of November Italian repo
rates fell by about half a point to 6.2 per cent; they
currently stand at around 6 per cent.

Figure 40

Long--term interest rates:
EU convergence criterion (1)

(daily data; percentages)
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(1) The data for the last two months are provisional. - (2) Average yield for the 12
months ending on the day indicated. - (3) Simple average of the 10-year yield in the three
EU countries with lowest inflation in the period indicated (measured as the change in the
average of the harmonized consumer price index with respect to the average of the 12
preceding months).

Long-term rates declined further. Between the
end of September 1997 and the end of February 1998

the yield on 10-year benchmark Treasury bonds fell
by 0.9 percentage points to 5.3 per cent; a
contributory factor was the downward trend in
international interest rates, influenced from October
onwards by the worsening of the financial crisis in
South-East Asia. Since February 1997 the yield on
10-year benchmark Treasury bonds, calculated as a
12-month moving average, has been below the
threshold value set in the Maastricht Treaty (Figure
40). In the final quarter of the year, as expectations
of Italian participation in EMU from January 1999
onwards strengthened, forward interest rate
differentials in relation to the German mark became
negligible for periods after 1998 (Figure 41).

Figure 41
Yield curve of 1--year forward rates

implied by swap rates (1)
(percentages and percentage points)
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(1) The horizontal axis shows the period to which the yield refers, expressed in years
from the contract date indicated. The first value of each curve is the 1-year spot rate on
the contract date.

The effective exchange rate of the lira against the
ERM currencies remained broadly stable in 1997,
while that in relation to the currencies of all our
trading partners declined by 2.1 per cent owing to the
appreciation of the dollar (Figure 42). On an annual
average basis, the lira appreciated by 3.9 per cent
against the ERM currencies and by 0.3 per cent
against the trade-weighted basket. In the second half
of the year the lira depreciated by 0.6 per cent against
both the mark and the ERM currencies as a whole,
although remaining above its central rate against the
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mark; this development was accompanied by a
narrowing of the differential between short-term lira
and DM interest rates (Figure 43).

Figure 42
Exchange rates of the lira

(indices, 1993=100)
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(1) The ERM countries are Austria, Belgium, Denmark, Finland, France, Germany,
Ireland, Italy, the Netherlands, Portugal and Spain. - (2) Left-hand scale. A rise in the
index corresponds to an appreciation of the lira. For the methodology, see the article
“Nuovi indicatori di tasso di cambio effettivo nominale e reale”, in Banca d’Italia, Bollettino
Economico, no. 30, 1998. - (3) Dollars per DM. Right-hand scale. - (4) Standard deviation
of the rate of change in the nominal effective exchange rate of the lira in the previous 60
working days.

Figure 43
Interest rate differentials vis--à--vis Germany

and the lira/DM exchange rate
(percentage points and lire per DM)
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(1) Left-hand scale. - (2) Difference between 3-month Libor in lire and in marks.
Right-hand scale. - (3) Difference between the yield on benchmark 10-year BTPs and the
corresponding German yield. Right-hand scale.

The forward lira/DM exchange rate for
settlement at the end of 1998 implied by the spot rate
and the interest rate differential was still above 1,050
lire to the mark in March 1997. It came down steadily

in later months, reaching about 990 lire in December
(Figure 44); it then rose slightly, to 997 lire at the end
of February, in response to doubts expressed in some
countries about Italy’s participation in EMU from the
outset.

Figure 44
Implied forward lira/DM exchange rate

at 1 January 1999 (1)
(lire per DM)
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(1) Assumes that the depreciation of the exchange rate over the period is equal to
the differential between lira and DM interest rates, calculated on the basis of Libor and
swap rates and Euromarket futures.

In 1997 monetary base increased at a sustained
rate of 8.9 per cent (Table 17). The growth occurred
both in bank reserves and in notes and coin, which
rose by 7.1 per cent (compared with 3.4 per cent in
1996) in conjunction with the fall in bank deposit
rates and a modest revival in consumption. The

Table 17
Monetary variables (1)

(percentage changes)

���� ���� ���

2FW��'HF�
��� <HDU 2FW��'HF�

��� <HDU

0RQHWDU\ EDVH ��� � � � ��� ��� ��� ���
&XUUHQF\ � � � � � � � � � ��� ��� ��� ���
%DQN UHVHUYHV ��� � ����� ��� ��� ����

6KRUW�WHUP EDQN
GHSRVLWV � � � � � � � � � � ���� ��� ��� ���

0RQH\ VXSSO\ �0��
PRQWKO\ DYHUDJH � � ��� ��� ��� ���
TXDUWHUO\ DYHUDJH ��� ��� ��� ��� ���

��� &XUUHQF\� EDQN UHVHUYHV DQGPRQHWDU\ EDVH FDOFXODWHG DV DYHUDJHV RI GDLO\
GDWD IRU WKH PLG�PRQWK WR PLG�PRQWK UHVHUYH PDLQWHQDQFH SHULRG� EDQN GHSRVLWV
DQG WKH PRQH\ VXSSO\ DV DYHUDJHV LQ WKH FDOHQGDU PRQWK� �� ��� 3URYLVLRQDO� ��
���$QQXDOL]HGDQG VHDVRQDOO\ DGMXVWHG� �� ���$GMXVWHG IRU WKH FKDQJH LQ WKHDYHUDJH
FRPSXOVRU\ UHVHUYH UDWLR� �� ��� $YHUDJH IRU WKH TXDUWHU HQGLQJ LQ WKH ODVW PRQWK RI
WKH UHIHUHQFH SHULRG�



021(7$5< 32/,&<� %$1.,1* $1' 7+( ),1$1&,$/ 0$5.(76(&2120,& %8//(7,1 � 1R� ��� )(%58$5< ����

��

Bank of Italy operations in the money market

The allotment rate for securities repurchase
agreements and the overnight rate continued to decline in
the final part of 1997; both came down by approximately
0.6 percentage points to stand at about 6.2 per cent at the
end of November. The differential between 3--month rates
in lire and in German marks narrowed from around 3 to
2.3 percentage points between the end of October and the
end of December.

The curve of 3--month rates implied by Eurolira
futures contracts recorded a significant downward
shift following the Ecofin Council meeting of 13--14
September, where the decision was made to bring forward
the irrevocable locking of exchange rates for monetary
union to May 1998. The curve continued to move
downwards, albeit with fluctuations, for the rest of the
year: in December the rate implied by the contract
maturing in March 1998 was equal to around 5.3 per cent
and the differential with the corresponding rate in marks
amounted to 1.5 percentage points. In January the curve
started to record a gradual upward movement for periods
up to June 1998 and a more marked shift in the opposite
direction for subsequent ones (Figure 1); the differential
between lira and mark rates for contracts maturing in
March consequently widened to 2.5 points at the end of
the month. These developments have had a smaller
impact on the differentials for contracts with settlement
after June: that for December 1998 contracts remains
close to its end--1997 level of around 0.2 percentage
points. The expected yield on 3--month funds in lire next
December has steadily diminished, reflecting the trend of
money market rates in the other European countries, and
now stands at about 4.2 per cent.

The volatility of 3--month interest rates in lire,
calculated from the prices of options on 3--month futures,
remains broadly in line with that of the corresponding
rate in marks (Figure 2).

Figure 1
Yield curve for futures contracts
on 3-month Eurolira deposits (1)

(percentages and percentage points)
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(1) The horizontal axis shows the settlement dates for the futures contracts to which
the yields refer.

The Bank of Italy continued to manage liquidity
principally through securities repurchase agreements
(Figure 3) and, for smaller amounts, using outright
purchases of Treasury bills by means of multiple price

cont.

external sector again made a large contribution to
monetary base creation (22.8 trillion lire, compared
with 20.4 trillion in 1996; Table 18), reflecting the
good performance of the balance of payments on
current account. In addition, the Bank of Italy created
32 trillion by means of open market operations. The
substantial destruction of monetary base by the
Treasury (49.5 trillion), which was due mainly to

the reduction in the borrowing requirement and
substantial privatization proceeds, was thus offset.

The M2 money supply grew by 9.8 per cent in
1997, reflecting primarily the expansion in bank
current accounts. It increased rapidly until August
(Figure 45), when the twelve-month growth rate
reached 12.4 per cent; in the last few months of the
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auctions open to the primary dealers on MTS. Between
November and January there were eleven repo operations
totaling around 113 trillion lire and one reverse repo of
4.5 trillion. Demand for funds at these auctions was
consistently strong; the negative slope of the yield curve
was reflected in the allotment rates, which were lower for
the operations with longer maturities. Foreign currency
swaps, which have only been transacted in dollars since
July 1997, were managed with a view to renewing
maturing operations.

Figure 2

Implied volatility of
3-month Eurolira and Euromark rates (1)

(percentage points on an annual basis)
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(1) Standard deviaton of the probability distribution of the changes in the futures
rate, implied by price of the at-thr money option closest to expiry. The trend lines were
generated using the Hodrick and Prescott method.

In the last two months of 1997 receipts from the
privatization of Telecom resulted in the Treasury
absorbing a very large amount of monetary base (around
19 trillion lire); almost 13 trillion of liquidity was

supplied to the system through open market operations.
The banks’ debtor position vis--à--vis the central bank,
which had averaged around 30 trillio n in November,
increased by about 10 trillio n in December (Figure 3).
In the first few days of January the banks’ position
temporarily turned positive in thewakeof theoperations
theBank of Italy carried out with aview to absorbing the
liquidity created by Treasury disbursements.

Figure 3
Central bank financing
(stocks, in billions of lire)
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In November the Treasury payments fund was
credited with receipts of 1.6 trillio n li re from the
privatization of SEAT and 19.9 trillio n from that of
Telecom; a further 2.5 trillio n from the privatization of
Telecomwasreceived in January. TheTreasury used the
sinking fund in order to buy back government securities
(6.8 trillio n in November and 2.8 trillio n in December),
redeem maturing Treasury bonds (15 trillio n in
December) and pay for thepurchaseof STET shares(7.6
trillio n between December and January).

year the seasonally adjusted growth came to a halt in
conjunction with a pronounced lessening of uncer-
tainty about the prospects for long-term interest rates.

Total financial assets increased at a slightly faster
rate than in 1996, rising by 5.5 per cent compared
with 5.1 per cent, as a net result of a modest
slowdown in the growth of domestic assets and a

pronounced expansion of 33.8 per cent in the foreign
component. There was a sharp contraction of 7.4 per
cent in liquid assets, chiefly on account of a
reduction in holdings of medium and long-term bank
CDs; the counterpart to this was a marked shift
towards managed savings (holdings of investment
fund units increased by 143.3 trillion lire) and
medium and long-term assets, especially bank bonds.
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Credit to the non-state sector increased by 5.2 per
cent during the year (compared with 2.8 per cent in
1996), mainly reflecting an increase in finance from
abroad in the form of bank loans and purchases of
bonds and, especially in the final quarter, a marked
acceleration in domestic bank loans. Total credit
grew more slowly than in 1996, however, owing to
the considerable reduction in the state sector
borrowing requirement.

Table 18
Monetary base (1)

(changes in billions of lire)

���� ���� ���

2FW��'HF� <HDU 2FW��'HF� <HDU

6RXUFHV

)RUHLJQ VHFWRU � � � � � �  ������� ������ ����� ������

IRUHLJQ FXUUHQF\
VZDSV � � � � � � � � �  �������� �������� � � �������

7UHDVXU\ � � � � � � � � � � �  ����� ������� �������� ��������

7UHDVXU\ SD\PHQWV
DFFRXQW � � � � � � � �  ����� ����� ����� �����

6LQNLQJ IXQG IRU UH�
GHPSWLRQ RI JRY�
HUQPHQW VHFXULWLHV ������ ����� ������� �������

2WKHU %,�8,& RSHUD�
WLRQV ZLWK WKH 7UHD�
VXU\ ��� � � � � � � � �  �������� �������� �������� ��������

2SHQ PDUNHW � � � � � � � �  ������ ����� ������ ������

5HSRV ��� � � � � � � � �  ������ ������  ��� ��������

2XWULJKW 7UHDVXU\ ELOO
RSHUDWLRQV � � � � � �  ������� ����� ����� ������

2WKHU RXWULJKW
WUDQVDFWLRQV � � � �  �������� �������� ����� �����

5HILQDQFLQJ � � � � � � � �  ���� ������� ����� ���

2WKHU VHFWRUV � � � � � � �  ������� �������� ����� �����

7RWDO � � � �  ������ ����� ����� ������

8VHV

&XUUHQF\ LQ FLUFXODWLRQ ����� ����� ����� �����

%DQN UHVHUYHV � � � � � �  ����� ����� ����� �����

FRPSXOVRU\
UHVHUYHV ��� � � � �  ����� ������� ����� ������

��� 5RXQGLQJ PD\ FDXVH GLVFUHSDQFLHV LQ WRWDOV� �� ��� 3URYLVLRQDO� �� ��� 1HW
UHGHPSWLRQV RI JRYHUQPHQW VHFXULWLHV LQ WKH %,�8,& SRUWIROLR DQG RWKHU LWHPV �VHH 1RWHV
WR 6WDWLVWLFDO 7DEOH D���� �� ��� $W ERRN YDOXH� �� ��� $YHUDJH UHVHUYH UHTXLUHPHQW GXULQJ
WKH PLG�PRQWK WR PLG�PRQWK UHVHUYH PDLQWHQDQFH SHULRG�

Figure 45

M2 money supply (1)
(target and outturn;

billions of lire; seasonally adjusted data)

19971996
740,000

780,000

820,000

860,000

740,000

780,000

820,000

860,000
quarterly average (2)
monthly average
target

5%

(1) Does not include CDs for terms of 18 months or more. - (2) Average for the three
months ending in the reference month.

Banking

Bank lending rose by 5.4 per cent in 1997,
compared with 2.4 per cent in 1996 (Table 19), and
grew in real terms for the first time since 1992. The
banks accommodated the revival in credit demand
that accompanied the pick-up in productive activity
and investment by further reducing their lending
rates in both real and nominal terms and substantially
increasing the volume of credit granted, which
expanded more than that actually drawn. Lending to
industrial firms (Table 20), mortgage loans to
consumer households and credit granted to consumer
finance companies and leasing companies, the latter
fueled by higher spending on durable consumer
goods and investment, rose more rapidly than the
loan portfolio as a whole.

Medium and long-term lira lending grew by
7.2 per cent, expanding steadily in the course of
the year. Short-term lira lending increased by
5.7 per cent, with a significant acceleration in
the fourth quarter, when the aggregate grew at an
annualized seasonally adjusted rate of 13.7 per cent.
The acceleration, which mainly involved loans
other than current account overdrafts, was partly
attributable to demand for credit to finance purchases
of financial assets.



021(7$5< 32/,&<� %$1.,1* $1' 7+( ),1$1&,$/ 0$5.(76(&2120,& %8//(7,1 � 1R� ��� )(%58$5< ����

��

Table 19
Main items in the banks’ balance sheets(1)

(percentage changes on corresponding period of previous year; billions of lire)

���� ����
���� 6WRFNV

'HFHPEHU���� ����
0DUFK -XQH 6HSWHPEHU 'HFHPEHU

'HFHPEHU
����

$VVHWV

6HFXULWLHV ��� � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ����� ��� ��� ��� ����� ������ �������
JRYHUQPHQW VHFXULWLHV ��� � � � � � ����� ���� ��� ��� ����� ������ �������

/RDQV ��� ��� ��� � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ��� ��� ��� ��� ��� ��� ���������
VKRUW�WHUP ��� � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ��� ��� ��� ��� ��� ��� �������
PHGLXP DQG ORQJ�WHUP ��� � � � � ��� ��� ��� ��� ��� ��� �������

%DG GHEWV � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ���� ���� ��� ��� ����� ����� �������

([WHUQDO DVVHWV LQ OLUH ��� � � � � � � � ���� ���� ���� ���� ���� ��� �������

([WHUQDO DVVHWV LQ IRUHLJQ
FXUUHQF\ ��� ��� � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ����� ���� ��� ��� ��� ��� �������

/LDELOLWLHV

'RPHVWLF GHSRVLWV DQG ERQGV
�DYHUDJHV� ��� � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ��� ��� ��� ��� ��� ��� ���������
GHSRVLWV � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ��� ��� ��� ����� ����� ����� �������
FXUUHQW DFFRXQWV � � � � � � � � � � � ��� ��� ���� ���� ���� ��� �������
VKRUW�WHUP &'V � � � � � � � � � � � � ������ ���� ���� ���� ���� ���� ������
PHGLXP DQG ORQJ�WHUP &'V � ���� ����� ������ ������ ������ ������ �������

ERQGV � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ����� ���� ���� ���� ���� ���� �������

([WHUQDO OLDELOLWLHV LQ OLUH ��� � � � � � ���� ���� ���� ���� ���� ���� �������

([WHUQDO OLDELOLWLHV LQ IRUHLJQ
FXUUHQF\ ��� ��� � � � � � � � � � � � � � ������ ����� ����� ����� ����� ����� �������

5HSRV ZLWK UHVLGHQW QRQ�EDQNV � � ���� ����� ����� ��� ��� ���� �������

��� 7KH ILJXUHV IRU 'HFHPEHU ���� DUH SURYLVLRQDO� 7KH DGMXVWPHQWV GHVFULEHG LQ QRWHV ��� UHODWH RQO\ WR WKH SHUFHQWDJH FKDQJHV� �� ��� 1HW RI ORDQ FRQYHUVLRQ VHFXULWLHV� �� ��� 7KH
IRUHLJQ FXUUHQF\ FRPSRQHQW LV QHW RI H[FKDQJH UDWH DGMXVWPHQWV� �� ��� ,QFOXGLQJ ORDQV FRQYHUWHG LQWR VHFXULWLHV DQG VHWWOHPHQWV RI VWRUDJH DJHQF\ ELOOV� �� ��� $GMXVWHG IRU WKH HIIHFWV
RI WKH WUDQVDFWLRQV LQ -DQXDU\ ���� EHWZHHQ %DQFR GL 1DSROL DQG WKH QRQ�EDQN FRPSDQ\ 6*$� �� ��� 6RXUFH� 8,&� �� ��� )RU GHSRVLWV� PRQWKO\ DYHUDJHV RI GDLO\ GDWD� IRU ERQGV�
HQG�RI�SHULRG GDWD� IRU PHGLXP DQG ORQJ�WHUP &'V XQWLO ����� DYHUDJH RI HQG�PRQWK GDWD IRU WKH UHIHUHQFH PRQWK DQG WKH SUHYLRXV PRQWK�

Net of exchange rate adjustments, total foreign
currency lending diminished. However, the short-
term component increased in view of the substantial
stability of the lira and, especially in the first half
of the year, the existence of a wide differential
between short-term rates in lire and in the main
foreign currencies.

The banks’ bad debts, which had grown by 11.7
per cent in 1996, contracted by 2.9 per cent. The
aggregate increased by 6.7 per cent if the bad debts
transferred by Banco di Napoli to the non-bank
company SGA and those retained on the books of

Sicilcassa in liquidation are included. The decline in
bad debts from 10.1 to 9.3 per cent of total loans was
entirely due to these two operations.

The volume of loans newly marked down as
bad debts was about 20 per cent smaller than
in 1996. There was an improvement in loan quality
with regard to financial companies and industry
excluding construction; credit risk remains high
on loans to the construction sector, consumer
households and sole traders. The banks’ exposure
to the Asian countries involved in the financial crisis
is limited.
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The exposure of Italian banks towards countries in South--East Asia

The total loans and lending commitments of Italian
banks towards Asian countries affected by the financial
crisis (South Korea, the Philippines, Indonesia, Malaysia
and Thailand) amounted to about 3.55 trillion lire in
December 1997, of which 160 billion was guaranteed by
residents of OECD countries, for the most part banks
(Table 1). Three--quarters of the positions were at short
term; the counterparties to 60 per cent of the total were
banks, while private sector companies accounted for 30
per cent and public debtors for an extremely limited
proportion. The loans were concentrated in the portfolios
of the very small number of Italian institutions with
international operations; five banks accounted for almost
70 per cent of the total. The overall exposure towards the
countries in question was equal to 0.3 per cent of the total
lending of Italian banks and 0.9 per cent of that of the five
largest Italian creditors. The exposure decreased in the
second half of the year, after having reached a peak in
June 1997.

In that month the Italian banks’ share of total foreign
lending to the five countries amounted to 0.9 per cent,
substantially less than their share of claims on LDCs as
a whole, which was itself low (Table 2). At the same date
German, French and British banks accounted for
respectively 11.5, 8.9 and 5.9 per cent of foreign lending
to the five countries. Japanese banks had the largest
exposure, with a share of 35.4 per cent.

Lending by BIS reporting banks to Asian developing
countries increased at an annual rate of 23 per cent from
1993 to June 1997, compared with a rise of 13 per cent a

year in lending to LDCs as a whole; over the same period
the market share of European banks rose from 36 to 44 per
cent (and from 48 to 52 per cent in the case of lending to
all LDCs), while that of Italian banks remained more or
less unchanged. The exposure of US banks decreased
from 9 to 8 per cent of the total and the share held by
Japanese banks fell from 38 to 32 per cent.

Table 1

Exposure of the Italian banking system towards Asian
countries in financial difficulty

(loans and lending commitments; billions of lire,
at end--December 1997)

7RWDO

8QVHFXUHG

6HFXUHG
��� VKRUW�

WHUP

PHGLXP
DQG
ORQJ�
WHUP

6RXWK .RUHD � � � ����� �� ����� ����� ���

3KLOLSSLQHV � � � � ��� � ��� �� ���

,QGRQHVLD � � � � � ��� �� ��� ��� ���

0DOD\VLD � � � � � � ��� �� ��� ��� ��

7KDLODQG � � � � � � ��� �� ��� ��� ���

7RWDO � � � � ����� ��� ����� ����� ���

6RXUFH� %DQNLQJ VXSHUYLVLRQ UHWXUQV RQ FRXQWU\ ULVN H[SRVXUH�
��� $PRXQW RI H[SRVXUH JXDUDQWHHG E\ UHVLGHQWV RI 2(&' FRXQWULHV DQG

LQWHUQDWLRQDO RUJDQL]DWLRQV�

cont.

Bank interest rates fell along with money market
rates throughout the year; the decline in bank rates
accelerated moderately following the reductions in
official rates (Figure 46). The average rate on
short-term lira loans came down by 1.8 percentage
points to 9 per cent in 1997; deflated with the
quarterly changes in producer prices, the average
lending rate fell by nearly 4 percentage points. The
average deposit rate declined by 1.6 points to 4.2 per
cent; that on current accounts ended the year at 3.4

per cent. The yield on bank bonds fell by 1.4 points
to 5.4 per cent.

Banks’ deposits and borrowed funds expanded
by 2.4 per cent, compared with 8.3 per cent in 1996.
The slowdown was accompanied by pronounced
changes in the composition of liabilities by maturity
and type of instrument. Short-term deposits rose by
10 per cent thanks to the rapid growth in short-term
CDs (27.5 per cent) and current accounts (9.4 per
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The reduction in the role of US banks by comparison
with their European counterparts can be attributed to
their more cautious lending policies, induced partly by
past debt crises in Latin America, and to the structural

decline in the banks’ position among US financial
institutions. The decrease in Japan’s relative exposure
was due partly to the difficulties being experienced by the
domestic banking system.

Table 2

Distribution of international bank lending to Asian
countries in financial difficulty according to the nationality of the reporting bank (1)

(millions of dollars and percentage shares, at end--June 1997)

6RXWK 3KLOLS� ,QGRQHVLD 0DOD\VLD 7KDLODQG 7RWDO
0HPRUDQGXP LWHP�6RXWK

.RUHD
3KLOLS�
SLQHV ,QGRQHVLD 0DOD\VLD 7KDLODQG 7RWDO

$VLDQ /'&V 7RWDO /'&V
6KDUH 6KDUH 6KDUH

,WDO\ � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ����� �� ��� ��� ��� ����� ��� ����� ��� ������ ���

-DSDQ � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ������ ����� ������ ������ ������ ������ ���� ������� ���� ������� ����

8QLWHG 6WDWHV � � � � � � � � ����� ����� ����� ����� ����� ������ ��� ������ ��� ������� ����

*HUPDQ\ � � � � � � � � � � � � ������ ����� ����� ����� ����� ������ ���� ������ ���� ������ ����

)UDQFH � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ������ ����� ����� ����� ����� ������ ��� ������ ���� ������ ����

8QLWHG .LQJGRP � � � � � � ����� ����� ����� ����� ����� ������ ��� ������ ��� ������ ���

1HWKHUODQGV � � � � � � � � � ����� ����� ����� ����� ����� ����� ��� ������ ��� ������ ���

6SDLQ � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ��� ��� ��� � ��� ����� ��� ����� ��� ������ ���

2WKHU ��� � � � � � � � � � � � � ������ ����� ������ ����� ����� ������ ���� ������ ���� ������� ����

7RWDO ��� � � � � ������� ������ ������ ������ ������ ������� ����� ������� ����� ������� �����

6RXUFH� %,6� 7KH PDWXULW\� VHFWRUDO DQG QDWLRQDOLW\ GLVWULEXWLRQ RI LQWHUQDWLRQDO EDQN OHQGLQJ�

��� 7KH %,6 UHSRUWLQJ EDQNV DUH WKRVH LQ WKH *URXS RI 7HQ FRXQWULHV SOXV $XVWULD� 'HQPDUN� )LQODQG� ,UHODQG� /X[HPERXUJ� 1RUZD\ DQG 6SDLQ DQG WKHLU IRUHLJQ DIILOLDWHV� ��
��� /RDQV E\ EDQNV UHVLGHQW LQ UHSRUWLQJ FRXQWULHV EXW ZLWK WKHLU KHDG RIILFH RXWVLGH WKH UHSRUWLQJ DUHD�

cent), whereas medium and long-term borrowed
funds contracted by 6.2 per cent owing to the fall in
CDs for terms of 18 months or more, which was only
partly offset by net issues of bonds.

The banks’ net foreign liabilities increased by
11.6 trillion lire net of exchange rate variations; there
was a large rise of 24.2 trillion in interbank deposits
in lire, to which the banks had recourse in order to
compensate for the slowdown in fund-raising in the
domestic market. Italian banks financed a much

smaller portion than in the past of non-residents’
massive net purchases of lira-denominated
government securities, which totaled 100.1 trillion
lire; repos with foreign investors amounted to 9.5
trillion lire, compared with 30 trillion in 1996. As a
whole, the banks’ lira-denominated foreign assets
grew by 4.4 trillion.

The banks’ aggregate securities portfolio
contracted by 39.3 trillion lire in 1997. Treasury bills
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accounted for more than half of the decline. Large
purchases of Treasury bonds in the first quarter,
when prices dipped temporarily, gave way in the

following months to net disposals of more than 26.8
trillion; the overall balance was negative by 13.1
trillion.

Table 20
Bank lending and bad debts by branch of economic activity (1)

(percentages)

*HQHUDO

)LQDQFH DQG
LQVXUDQFH ��� 1RQ�ILQDQFLDO HQWHUSULVHV +RXVHKROGV

0HPR�
UDQGXP
LWHP�*HQHUDO

JRYHUQ�
PHQW
��� +ROGLQJ

FRPSDQLHV

,QGXVWU\
H[FO�

FRQVWUXF�
WLRQ

&RQVWUXF�
WLRQ 6HUYLFHV &RQVXPHU

���
6ROH

WUDGHUV

LWHP�

6WDWH�
FRQWUROOHG
HQWHUSUL�
VHV ���

7RWDO
��� ���

���PRQWK SHUFHQWDJH FKDQJHV LQ OHQGLQJ

���� �� -XQH � � � � � � � � ����� ��� ������ ��� ��� ����� ��� ��� ��� ����� ���
���� �� 6HSWHPEHU � � ����� ��� ����� ��� ��� ����� ��� ��� ��� ����� ���
���� �� 'HFHPEHU � � � ����� ��� ����� ��� ��� ����� ��� ��� ��� ������ ���
���� �� -XQH � � � � � � � � ��� ���� ����� ��� ��� ����� ��� ��� ��� ������ ���
���� �� 6HSWHPEHU � � ����� ���� ����� ��� ��� ����� ��� ��� ��� ������ ���
���� �� 'HFHPEHU � � � ��� ���� ��� ��� ��� ����� ��� ��� ��� ������ ���

���PRQWK SHUFHQWDJH FKDQJHV LQ EDG GHEWV

���� �� -XQH � � � � � � � � ���� ��� ��� ���� ��� ���� ���� ���� ���� ����� ����
���� �� 6HSWHPEHU � � ���� ���� ���� ���� ��� ���� ���� ���� ���� ������ ����
���� �� 'HFHPEHU � � � ������ ���� ���� ���� ��� ���� ��� ���� ���� ������ ����
���� �� -XQH ��� � � � � � ������ ����� ����� ����� ����� ��� ����� ���� ����� ������ ���

�������� ����� ����� ����� ����� ������ ����� ������ ����� �������� �����
���� �� 6HSWHPEHU ��� ������ ������ ������ ����� ����� ����� ����� ���� ����� ������ �����

�������� ������� �������� ����� ������� ������ ����� ������ ����� �������� �����
���� �� 'HFHPEHU ��� ������ ������ ������ ����� ����� ����� ����� ���� ����� ������ �����

������� ������� ������� ����� ����� ������ ����� ������ ����� �������� �����

5DWLR RI EDG GHEWV WR WRWDO OHQGLQJ ���

���� �� -XQH � � � � � � � � ��� ��� ��� ���� ��� ���� ���� ���� ���� ��� ���
���� �� 6HSWHPEHU � � ��� ��� ��� ���� ��� ���� ���� ���� ���� ��� ����
���� �� 'HFHPEHU � � � ��� ��� ��� ���� ��� ���� ���� ���� ���� ��� ����
���� �� -XQH ��� � � � � � ��� ��� ��� ���� ��� ���� ��� ���� ���� ��� ���

����� ����� ����� ������ ����� ������ ������ ������ ������ ����� ������
���� �� 6HSWHPEHU ��� ��� ��� ��� ���� ��� ���� ��� ���� ���� ��� ���

����� ����� ����� ������ ����� ������ ������ ������ ������ ����� ������
���� �� 'HFHPEHU ��� ��� ��� ��� ���� ��� ���� ��� ���� ���� ��� ���

����� ����� ����� ������ ����� ������ ������ ������ ������ ����� ������

3HUFHQWDJH FRPSRVLWLRQ RI OHQGLQJ

���� �� 'HFHPEHU � � � ��� ���� ��� ���� ���� ��� ���� ���� ���� ��� ���

���� �� 'HFHPEHU � � � ��� ���� ��� ���� ���� ��� ���� ���� ���� ��� ���

��� /HQGLQJ WR UHVLGHQW QRQ�EDQNV� &KDQJHV LQ WKH IRUHLJQ FXUUHQF\ FRPSRQHQW DUH QHW RI H[FKDQJH UDWH DGMXVWPHQWV� 7KH ILJXUHV IRU 'HFHPEHU ���� DUH SURYLVLRQDO� �� ��� ,QFOXGHV
ORDQV UDLVHG E\ WKH 6WDWH 5DLOZD\V ZLWK WKH FRVWV ERUQH E\ WKH JRYHUQPHQW� DV DJUHHG ZLWK (XURVWDW� �� ��� 3HUFHQWDJH FKDQJHV LQ OHQGLQJ DUH DGMXVWHG IRU WKH HIIHFWV RI WKH WUDQVDFWLRQV
LQ -DQXDU\ ���� EHWZHHQ %DQFR GL 1DSROL DQG WKH QRQ�EDQN FRPSDQ\ 6*$� �� ��� ,QFOXGHV SULYDWH VRFLDO LQVWLWXWLRQV� �� ��� &RPSULVHV VWDWH KROGLQJ FRPSDQLHV DQG VWDWH�FRQWUROOHG
FRPSDQLHV FODVVLILHG LQ WKH WDEOH DPRQJ KROGLQJ FRPSDQLHV DQG QRQ�ILQDQFLDO HQWHUSULVHV UHVSHFWLYHO\� �� ��� $Q\ GLVSDULWLHV EHWZHHQ WKH GDWD UHSRUWHG LQ WKLV WDEOH DQG WKRVH LQ 7DEOH
�� DUH GXH WR GLVFUHSDQFLHV EHWZHHQ WKH ´'DWL VHWWRUL]]DWLµ DQG WKH ´'DWL SDWULPRQLDOLµ LQ EDQNV· DXWRPDWHG SUXGHQWLDO UHWXUQV� �� ��� 7KH ILJXUHV LQ SDUHQWKHVHV JLYH WKH LQGLFDWRUV REWDLQHG
DIWHU UHDWWULEXWLQJ WKH EDG GHEWV WUDQVIHUUHG IURP %DQFR GL 1DSROL WR 6*$ DQG WKRVH UHWDLQHG RQ WKH ERRNV RI 6LFLOFDVVD LQ OLTXLGDWLRQ� �� ��� 7KH GHQRPLQDWRU LQFOXGHV EDG GHEWV�
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Figure 46
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Daily turnover on the screen-based interbank
deposit market averaged 31.1 trillion lire, 3.6 trillion
more than in 1996. The gross settlement system
for interbank payments became fully operative on
26 January of this year.

According to preliminary data on the banks’
profit and loss accounts for 1997, net interest income
appears to have fallen by around 4 per cent, despite
the pick-up in lira lending, owing to the decline in the
spread between the average return on assets and the
average cost of funds. Other income rose, especially
that from managed savings services, offsetting the
decrease in net interest income. Operating costs
appear to have increased slightly. Staff costs,
including the extraordinary charges arising from
early severance incentives, are estimated to have
remained basically unchanged, despite the number of
staff declining by 2.3 per cent.

The bond and Eurolira market

Net issues of government securities fell sharply
to 27.2 trillion lire in 1997; taking account of early

redemptions by the Treasury using privatization
receipts, the net increase in the amount outstanding
came to 17.8 trillion lire, compared with 112.1
trillion in 1996 (Table 21).

The contraction mainly involved Treasury bills,
with net redemptions totaling 82.3 trillion lire,
whereas Treasury bonds and zero-coupon Treasury
certificates recorded net issues of respectively 68.6
and 41.5 trillion. During the year the average residual
maturity of the public debt lengthened from 52 to 56
months (Figure 47); in 1993 it had been equal to 33
months. The duration of listed issues increased from
20 to 24 months. The Treasury also significantly
reduced its fund-raising in the international markets,
concentrating its net issues of 6.3 trillion in the early
part of the year.

The Eurolira bond market was extremely active
in 1997: gross issues rose by 45 per cent to 54.3
trillion lire. Activity was fostered by the stability of
the lira and the substantial decrease in net issues of
government securities. In particular, there was an
increase in placements by public and private sector
issuers from the emerging-market countries and
further diversification of the characteristics of the
securities offered.

Figure 47
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The improvement in the prospects of monetary
stability fueled non-residents’ demand for Italian
government securities, most notably for medium and
long-term fixed rate paper (Table 22); a contributory
factor was the abolition of withholding tax for
foreign investors. The share of government securities
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held by non-residents rose from 20 per cent at the end
of 1996 to around 25 per cent. Among Italian
investors, the decline of 102.5 trillion lire in the
government securities held by firms, insurance
companies and households was accompanied by net

purchases by investment funds amounting to 68
trillion and consisting mostly of Treasury bonds and
zero-coupon certificates. The banks, which had
made net purchases in 1996, reduced their holdings
by 38.4 trillion.

Table 21
Issues of government securities and composition of stocks (1)

���� ���� ���� ����
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�ELOOLRQV RI OLUH�
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��� *URVV LVVXHV DQG VWRFNV DW IDFH YDOXH� QHW LVVXHV DW LVVXH SULFH� )RU &&7V� IORDWLQJ UDWH LVVXHV RQO\� 7RWDO LQFOXGHV 5HSXEOLF RI ,WDO\ LVVXHV� 5RXQGLQJ PD\ FDXVH GLVFUHSDQFLHV
LQ WRWDOV� �� ��� ([FOXGHV WKH VHFXULWLHV LVVXHG LQ 1RYHPEHU ���� WR FRQVROLGDWH WKH 7UHDVXU\·V RYHUGUDIW RQ LWV FXUUHQW DFFRXQW ZLWK WKH %DQN RI ,WDO\ ������� ELOOLRQ OLUH�� �� ��� 'LIIHUHQFH
EHWZHHQ JURVV LVVXHV DQG UHGHPSWLRQV� ZKLFK LQFOXGH EX\�EDFN RSHUDWLRQV E\ WKH 7UHDVXU\� �� ��� ([FOXGHV WKH VHFXULWLHV LVVXHG LQ 'HFHPEHU ���� WR ILQDQFH WKH 7UHDVXU\ SD\PHQWV
DFFRXQW ������� ELOOLRQ OLUH��
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The implied volatility of Treasury bonds nearly
touched 10 per cent at the beginning of the year but
diminished steadily thereafter and fell below that of
Bunds in December (Figure 48). The sharp increase
in the implied volatility of German yields recorded
in October in connection with the raising of
short-term rates by the Bundesbank did not spread to
Italian yields.

Turnover on the screen-based market in
government securities (MTS) grew by 16.3 per

cent in 1997 (Figure 49). There was a further
reduction in the concentration of trading by
type of security. Turnover was up most sharply
for Treasury bills and zero-coupon Treasury
certificates (by 35 and 19 per cent respectively),
and more modestly for Treasury credit certificates
(by 5.5 per cent). On 12 December trading in
repos on government securities began on MTS:
these transactions involve contracts with a matu-
rity ranging from two days to three months and

Table 22
Stocks and net purchases of securities (1)
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HQWHUSULVHV� WKH 7UHDVXU\� VRFLDO VHFXULW\ LQVWLWXWLRQV� WKH 'HSRVLWV DQG /RDQV )XQG� VHFXULWLHV LQYHVWPHQW ILUPV DQG LQVXUDQFH FRPSDQLHV� VKDUHV DUH SDUWO\ HVWLPDWHG�
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The Bank of Italy’s real time gross settlement system: launch of the second stage

The real time gross interbank settlement system
instituted by the Bank of Italy, designated BI--REL,
reached full operating status on 26 January. BI--REL is
the Italian segment of the comparable EU--wide TARGET
system. All large--value interbank transactions are now
settled directly in real time via the banks’ accounts with
the Bank of Italy. Low--value and securities transac--
tions continue to be handled by the clearing system
(BI--COMP). The full phasing--in of BI--REL was com--
pleted with the transfer to it of settlement of liabilities on
the screen--based interbank deposit market (MID) and
wholesale interbank transactions with non--residents --
the procedure for interbank external payments and the
lira portion of foreign exchange transactions (GEC) --
which together account for 95 per cent of the value of
interbank payments (Economic Bulletin no. 25, October
1997, insert on “Bank of Italy intervention in the money
market”). Since 26 January the average daily value
handled by the clearing system has fallen from 281 trillion
lire to 49 trillion, 30 per cent of it in connection with
securities settlement.

In its first four weeks of full--scale operation, BI--REL
has handled more than 40,000 payments a day, for an
average volume of over 250 trillion lire. More than half
of these payments involve the larger banks. The GEC
procedure accounted for the lion’s share of transaction
volume, an average of 160 trillion lire a day, followed by
MID at 50 trillion, the large--value domestic payment
order procedure (BIR) at 11 trillion and the cross--border
payment order procedure (BOE) at 1 trillion.

To ensure proper functioning of BI--REL, the Bank of
Italy supplies intraday liquidity via mobilization of up to
10 per cent of banks’ compulsory reserves, in addition to
the 12.5 per cent that they may already mobilize on a daily
basis, and via intraday advances on current account
consisting in a tacitly renewable credit line that is fully
collateralized by elilgible securities and authorized for a
maximum of four months. Ordinarily these funds are not
rationed.

The system provides for queuing of payments
temporarily lacking financial cover. The queued pay--
ments are released into the system according to a set
of priorities (high, medium, ordinary) depending on their
nature. Within each priority class, the criterion is first
in, first out.

As of 26 January, of the 785 participants in BI--REL,
140 banks were eligible for intraday advances. If the
funds are not repaid at the end of the day, the Bank of Italy
charges a penalty rate equal to the top overnight rate on
MID for that day plus 10 percentage points.

In the first four weeks, average drawings of intraday
liquidity amounted to 5.4 trillion lire a day, or 17.5 per
cent of the funds available and just over 2 per cent
of the value of all payments made. The larger banks
and Italian branches of foreign banks made the greatest
recourse to intraday liquidity in relative terms, drawing
respectively 19 and 25 per cent of the funds at their
disposal.

cont.

delivery of either generic securities (general
collateral) or specific securities (special repo).

Despite a slight let-up in the final months of the
year, trading in Treasury bond futures on LIFFE
increased by 23.1 per cent with respect to 1996,
thanks in part to expectations of lower interest rates;
trading on MIF grew to a smaller extent (by 7.2 per
cent). The share of total transactions effected on the
Italian market declined from 18.6 to 16.4 per cent.
On both markets the nominal yield on the notional

Treasury bond underlying the futures contract was
reset at 8 per cent.

Average daily turnover in 3-month Eurolira
futures on LIFFE amounted to 48.3 trillion lire,
almost double the figure for 1996. In Italy, trading in
the new futures contract on the 1-month interbank
rate got off to a good start in June; activity began to
slacken at the end of October, but the new contract
helped to increase the liquidity of the underlying
market.
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The system’ssettlement capacity, definedastheratio
between the payments settled and those entered,
measured at five--minute intervals throughout the day,
hasaveraged 98 per cent. Thevalueof queued payments
has averaged 1.55 trillio n li re a day, or less than 1 per
cent of total payment volume. Average stay in the queue
hasbeen just over 3 minutes.

The peak value of payments in the queue coincides
with the start of the business day at 8.00 a.m., when the
MID payments falling due are automatically entered.
On some days there have also been queuing peaks
corresponding to the settlement of clearing balances at
1.00 p.m. (see figure).

Queuing has been concentrated at the larger banks
and the Italian branches of foreign banks, which
respectively accounted for 19 and 53 per cent of the
total queued payment volume. This pattern, together
with the small utilization of intraday liquidity by other
bank categories, suggests that so far no mechanism of
redistribution of disposable intraday reserves among
banks has operated. The result was an increase in
requests for intraday advances in the first few days of
thenew system’soperation.

Inthisinitial period, theextensionof grosssettlement
to all large--valueinterbank paymentsdoesnot appear to
haveaffectedvery--short--terminterbankrates.Onlyat the
launch of the new settlement system was there greater
than normal variability of the overnight rate, owing

in part to very substantial bank payments falling due.
Over the next few days intraday variability gradually
subsided, demonstrating the prompt adjustment of
banks’ treasury departments to the new system and the
adequacy of the provisions for queuing and intraday
liquidity.

Volume of queued payments and recourse to
intraday liquidity by time of day (1)
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(1) Daily averages, 26 January-20 February 1998.

In thecourseof theworkingday, thetimesof greatest
variability in theovernight ratehavebasically coincided
with morning opening and the closure of the gross
settlement procedure. During thesephases, however, the
greater variability is explained by the relatively small
volumeof fundschanging hands.

The share market and professional asset
management

The capitalization of the Italian stock market
stood at 593 trillion lire at the end of 1997, equal
to 30.4 per cent of GDP, compared with 20.6
per cent in 1996. The increase was due almost
entirely to a rise of 58.1 per cent in share prices, the
largest since 1986; only a small proportion was
attributable to share issues and new listings. In

January 1998 share prices surged by a further 12.2
per cent.

The rise in the Italian market was far larger than
that in the leading international exchanges (39.1 per
cent in Germany, 31 per cent in the United States,
29.4 per cent in France, 19.7 per cent in the United
Kingdom and 20.1 per cent in Japan), whereas in the
two previous years the Italian market had grown less
rapidly. The most significant differences between
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Italy and the other countries occurred close to the
time of reductions in Italian official interest rates.

Figure 48

Implied volatility of Treasury bonds and Bunds
listed on LIFFE (1)

(percentage points on an annual basis)
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(1) Standard deviation of the probability distribution of the percentage changes in the
price of 10-year futures, implied by the price of the at-the-money option closest to expiry.
The trend lines were generated using the Hodrick and Prescott method.

Figure 49

Turnover in government securities
on the spot and futures markets
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In October the crisis in Asia caused share prices
in the leading financial markets to weaken and
become more volatile. The Italian stock market
was less affected; after faltering briefly that month,
when the effects of the worsening of the Asian crisis
were compounded by increased uncertainty on
the domestic political scene, share prices rose
more rapidly in Italy than in all the other major
markets.

Despite heightened expectations regarding the
profits of quoted Italian companies, the stock
market’s earnings/price ratio decreased almost

continuously throughout the year, falling from 6 to
4.6 per cent, and decreased further to 4.1 per cent in
January. At its current level, the ratio is comparable
to that in theUnitedStatesand lower than in theother
major countries except Japan (Figure 50). At the
end of January 1998 the differential between the
earnings/price ratio and real long-term interest rates
in Italy was only marginally positive and less than
the figure in the other major countries.

Figure 50

Expected earnings/price ratios and differentials
with real interest rates on the main international

stock exchanges
(percentages and percentage points)
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(1) In France, Germany and Italy, earnings are estimates of expected earnings for

the current year; in Japan, the United Kingdom and the United States, they are drawn from
the most recent published financial statements. - (2) The real interest rate is equal to the
difference between the yield on long-term bonds and actual inflation over the previous 12
months.

In Italy the gain in share prices was most
pronounced in the services and banking sectors,
where the indices rose by 135 and 101 per cent
respectively. The largest increaseswere in theshares
of banks that have either embarked upon or
announced mergers or restructuring.

Share trading increased substantially in 1997
(Figure 51). Average monthly turnover was more
than twice as high as in 1996; it rose from 13 to 28
trillio n lire in the spot market and from 33 to 77
trillio n in the futures market. Trading in options on
the stock exchange index more than trebled, rising
from 46 to 72 per cent of the volume of spot trades.
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Figure 51

Italian stock exchange: spot and futures markets
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Despite the steep rise in share prices, gross share
issues were only slightly higher than in 1996,
increasing from 5.5 to 7.8 trillion lire. The rise in
market capitalization resulting from the listing of 15
new companies amounted to 14.2 trillion, not far
different from the 1996 figure. The delisting of 19
companies during the year caused the number of
listed shares to fall to 301.

Privatizations, which were carried out mainly by
means of public share flotations, generated revenue

of almost 37.5 trillion lire for the Treasury; the
largest were the Telecom offering (19.9 trillion lire)
and the third tranche of ENI shares (12.8 trillion).

On 20 February 1998 the Government gave final
approval to the Consolidated Law on Financial
Markets. The most important changes include the
introduction of rules for a new type of intermediary
(the asset management company) and, in the field of
company law, provisions to strengthen the protection
of minority shareholders, partly by introducing new
rules on take-overs and proxy voting.

Investment funds and portfolio management
services experienced extremely rapid growth in
1997. Investment funds received net subscriptions of
143.3 trillion lire, compared with 58.2 trillion in
1996; a large proportion went into bond funds. The
funds’ net assets under management rose to 368.4
trillio n lire, an increase of 54 per cent. Apart from
government securities, their net purchases consisted
of foreign shares and bonds. In 1997 performance
differed widely according to type of fund; thanks to
theexceptional risein shareprices, equity and mixed
funds yielded 30.3 and 24.8 per cent respectively,
whereas the bond fund index rose by 6.6 per cent.

The net inflow of resources to portfolio
management services was also large: 64.4 billion in
thefirst ninemonthsof theyear, compared with 35.2
trillio n in the same period of 1996. The average
annual performance achieved by the sector is
estimated at around 9 per cent.
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Short-term economic prospects, prices and monetary policy

International developments

Economic activity in the industrial countries
accelerated in 1997. In the area as a whole GDP rose
by 2.8 per cent, compared with 2.5 per cent the
previous year, although there were differences of
performance between countries. Inflation fell from
2.3 per cent in 1996 to 2 per cent, the lowest level
since the end of the sixties.

The US economy grew at a particularly rapid rate
of 3.8 per cent. In the European Union GDP increased
by 2.6 per cent, almost one point more than in 1996.
In Japan, by contrast, the rate of growth fell sharply,
from 3.6 to 1 per cent. The economies of developing
countries continued to grow at an average rate of
around 6 per cent. World trade rose by nearly 9 per
cent, drawing strength from the expansion in the US
market.

In contrast with the situation in the United States
and the United Kingdom, labour market conditions in
continental Europe remained grave.

Fiscal policies in the EU countries continued to be
directed towards consolidating the public finances;
budget deficits were reduced on average from 4.2 per
cent of GDP to 2.4 per cent by means of adjustment
measures that were particularly severe in some
countries and aimed partly at ensuring compliance
with the criteria for participation in EMU.

Raw materials prices - which remained broadly
stable in the early months of the year and declined in
the second half, partly as a result of the Asian crisis
- and wage restraint in all the major industrial
countries made a decisive contribution to the fall in
inflation; the firm stance of monetary policy was also
a factor.

At the beginning of 1997 fears of an upturn in
inflation in the United States led the Federal Reserve
to raise the federal funds rate by 0.25 percentage

points. In the latter part of the year the absence of
price pressures and the Asian crisis diminished the
likelihood of an imminent further tightening of
monetary conditions.

The decline in yields in international financial
markets that began in the middle of 1997 was fostered
by the slowdown in inflation and the ample supply of
funds; in the last part of the year the Asian crisis also
contributed.

The origins of the crisis lie in the impetuous flood
of investment, financed in large part with short-term
foreign capital and not always based on accurate
assessments of risks and returns. The banking
systems of the countries involved have a high level of
exposure to the troubled sectors and very large
borrowings in dollars. At the instigation of the
international community, which provided substantial
financial support to the countries affected by the
crisis, far-reaching reforms have been initiated with
the aim of strengthening their financial institutions
and markets.

The outlook for the international economy is
clouded today by the uncertainty regarding the
recovery prospects of the Japanese economy and the
course of the crisis in the Asian countries.

The IMF forecasts prepared in December show
growth rates for the latter that are still positive, in a
context marked by a relatively moderate acceleration
of inflation. More recent private forecasts are less
optimistic (Table 23).

The factors underlying the growth of these
economies in the longer run remain favourable. In
order to overcome the crisis rapidly, a vigorously
expansionary fiscal policy in Japan will be necessary,
as emerged at the recent G-7 summit in London. In the
absence of additional stimuli, Japanese domestic
demand would contract and economic activity
stagnate in 1998.
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Table 23

Actual and forecast performance of selected
international macroeconomic variables

(percentage changes on previous year)
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(3) Goods and services in volume terms. - (4) Billions of dollars. - (5) As a percentage
of GDP.

The effects of the Asian crisis on the other
industrial countries, which are less closely linked to
the countries in question, appear to be limited.
According to the latest forecasts, the outlook remains
positive for the United States and Europe, which
stand to benefit from the fall in the prices of
merchandise imports and the decline in interest rates.
The IMF expects the US economy to grow by 2.4 per
cent and that of the EU by 2.7 per cent. The imports
of the industrial countries should sustain the growth
in world trade, which is expected to remain
appreciable, albeit less rapid than in 1997.

The contrast between labour market conditions in
the Anglo-Saxon countries and continental Europe
will remain. In particular, there is as yet no sign of a
significant recovery in employment in Germany or
the other leading continental countries.

The current account imbalances between the
main areas will tend to become more pronounced in
1998, with a consequent expansion in international
capital flows. The considerable increase expected
in the US deficit will correspond in part to an
improvement in the external balances of the Asian
countries affected by the crisis. The surpluses of
Japan and the EU will remain basically unchanged.

In Europe, against a background of slightly
stronger growth, monetary policies will continue to
be directed towards consolidating price stability and
achieving the objective of introducing the single
currency at the beginning of 1999. Markets are
expecting the short-term interest rates of the EMU
candidate countries to converge towards 4 per cent, a
lower level than was foreseen last autumn.

Economic developments and fiscal policy in Italy

As occurred on earlier occasions, Italy entered
the present expansionary phase of the cycle later
than the other leading European economies. After
stagnating in 1996, the Italian economy began to grow
again last spring; GDP rose by 1.5 per cent in 1997.
Employment remained basically unchanged; it showed
signs of increasing in the Centre and North from the
summer onwards, while in the South there was a further
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small decrease. The unemployment rate for the country
as a whole rose from 12.1 to 12.3 per cent.

The recovery was sustained by the growth in the
consumption of durable goods, especially that of
motor vehicles, which was boosted by government
incentives. By contrast, the rise in other types of
consumption was limited. Disposable income,
measured at constant prices and taking account of the
erosion of the purchasing power of financial assets by
inflation, increased broadly in line with real GDP; the
positive effect of the decline in inflation was
counterbalanced by the increase in taxation.

Gross fixed investment stagnated: the recovery in
spending on machinery, equipment and transport
equipment was accompanied by a fall in investment
in buildings and construction. There was a substantial
increase in stocks, especially of raw materials.
Exports grew much less than imports, handicapped
by the loss of competitiveness resulting from the
appreciation of the lira in 1996.

The contraction in the trade surplus was partly
offset by the improvement in invisibles. The current
account surplus remained large (3.2 per cent of GDP)
and made it possible to complete the elimination of
Italy’s net external debt.

In 1998 the Italian economy will grow by more
than 2 per cent, sustained by the recovery in gross
fixed investment and a reduction in the spillover of
demand abroad. Spending on machinery, equipment
and transport equipment is expected to rise in
response to the high levels of capacity utilization and
the fall in nominal and real interest rates; investment
in buildings and construction will benefit from the tax
incentives introduced by the Government for the
restructuring of residential property. By contrast, the
rise in consumption will ease slightly: faster growth
in spending on services and non-durable goods will
be coupled with a slowdown in that on durables as the
effects of the incentives diminish. The growth in
exports should be similar to that recorded in 1997; the
slower expansion in foreign demand is likely to be
offset by the waning of the adverse effects of the lira’s
appreciation in 1996, which is also expected to help
slow the growth in imports. In relation to GDP, the

current account surplus is forecast to remain at much
the same level as in 1997.

Employment is not expected to improve
significantly overall, despite a small increase in the
non-farm private sector.

Last year it proved possible to reconcile the
recovery in economic activity with an acceleration in
budgetary consolidation. The fiscal adjustment,
which amounted to around 3 per cent of GDP and was
achieved in part by means of determined action to
control budget outlays and drawings on centralized
Treasury accounts, increased the general government
primary surplus from 4.1 to 6.8 per cent of GDP. This,
together with the substantial fall in interest payments
produced by the decline in interest rates, brought net
borrowing down from 6.7 per cent of GDP in 1996 to
2.7 per cent in 1997, below the threshold of 3 per cent
stipulated for participation in EMU.

The reduction in the budget deficit, together with
substantial privatization proceeds, accentuated the
fall in the ratio of the public debt to GDP, which came
down from 124.9 per cent at the end of 1994 to 124
per cent in 1996 and 121.6 per cent at the end of last
year.

The large reduction in net borrowing was
achieved primarily by increasing taxes and social
security contributions in relation to GDP; the ratio
rose by nearly two percentage points to match the
previous high of around 44 per cent recorded in 1993.
Current expenditure excluding interest payments
remained almost unchanged in relation to GDP;
social security benefits, and especially pensions, rose
further in relative terms. Capital expenditure
decreased by around half a percentage point of GDP
as a consequence of the reduction in investment
grants and other items. In order to give additional
impetus to the adjustment of the public finances,
recourse was made to temporary measures amounting
to around 1 per cent of GDP.

The budget for 1998, which follows the lines set
out in the Economic and Financial Planning
Document for 1998-2000 and the convergence plan
drawn up for the EU, is intended to consolidate the
improvement in general government net borrowing
achieved in 1997. The ratio of taxes and social
security contributions to GDP is expected to fall.
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Last September the Government tabled budget
proposals aimed at increasing the primary surplus on
a current programmes basis by around 25 trillion lire
in 1998. The adjustment approved by Parliament was
of the same overall size and, as indicated in the
Forecasting and Planning Report, should result in a
primary surplus equal to 5.6 per cent of GDP, about
one percentage point less than last year. The
contribution from temporary measures will decline to
around 0.3 per cent of GDP. The further reduction in
interest payments as a result of the gradual narrowing
of the gap between the average cost of the debt and the
current level of yields at issue should ensure that net
borrowing is stabilized. The fall in the ratio of the
public debt to GDP is expected to be larger than last
year.

The reduction Parliament made in the cuts in
social security expenditure compared with the
original proposals was offset by an increase in some
contribution rates. The resulting increase in revenue
was thus 13 trillion lire instead of 11 trillion, and the
contraction in expenditure 12 trillion instead of 14
trillion. The revenue measures include: the revision
of VAT rates, implemented last October; increases in
some contribution rates; the bringing forward of
some tax payments; and a number of administrative
measures (see the box). The expenditure measures
include reductions in transfers to local authorities and
public enterprises and in the spending of government
departments and staff costs, as well as cuts in the
fields of health care and pensions. In order to ensure
that expenditure plans are respected, the limits on
non-state public bodies’ withdrawals from their
centralized Treasury accounts have been renewed.

The effects of the pension measures are estimated
to amount to 3.2 trillion lire in 1998; compared with
the present trend of spending, they should bring
annual savings on the order of 0.2 percentage points
of GDP over the next ten years. Nonetheless, the
official estimates show the cost of pensions rising by
half a percentage point of GDP between 1997 and
2010.

With a view to the start of EMU and fulfilment of
the commitments arising from the Stability and
Growth Pact, the aim of fiscal policy in 1998 is to
consolidate the results achiered and in subsequent

years to advance towards a balanced budget. Progress
in this direction will make it possible to speed up the
reduction in the ratio of debt to GDP, an undertaking
to which the privatization of public enterprises can
make an important contribution.

Future reductions in the budget deficit will have
to be achieved by means of structural measures.

Looking ahead, the return to a balanced budget
will have to be accompanied by a significant
reduction in the size of the budget itself, made all the
more necessary by the increasing integration of
international markets.

The present level of taxation, which is
particularly onerous for taxpayers who meet their
obligations in full, is likely to distort economic
choices significantly in the long run and hinder efforts
to bring the hidden economy into the open.
Enlargement of the tax base, first and foremost by
reducing evasion, erosion and avoidance, may
provide scope for a lowering of tax rates.

Monetary policy and inflation

The progress made in curbing inflation in 1997
permitted a gradual easing of monetary policy, within
the framework of a strategy aimed at ensuring price
stability.

The annual inflation rate, as measured by the
index of consumer prices for worker and employee
households, fell by more than two percentage points
to 1.7 per cent and was below the objective set by the
Government. The convergence criterion established
by the Maastricht Treaty was satisfied. Inflation
expectations improved continuously during the year.

Producer prices accelerated moderately in the
spring of 1997, consumer prices in the summer. The
lag with which inflation rose compared with the other
leading European countries can be attributed to the
later start of the economic recovery in Italy and to the
effects of the lira’s appreciation in 1996. As regards
producer prices, the intentions expressed by
enterprises since November point to an easing of the
pressure, and initial confirmation of this is to be found
in the slowdown in the rise in the index in December.
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The implementing provisions of the 1998 budget

The budget for 1998 approved by Parliament is
expected to increase the general government primary
surplus on a current programmes basis by around 25
trillion lire. The size of the adjustment is unchanged
compared with that of the proposals submitted by the
Government in September (see the box “The budget for
1998” in Economic Bulletin no. 25, 1997). According to
the officlal estimates, the increase in the primary surplus
will reduce interest payments by 1.5 billion lire.

The composition of the measures was nonetheless
modified slightly. The expenditure resulting from the
introduction of employment incentives and support for the
population of the areas hit by earthquakes in 1997 was
offset by additional revenue and an increase in the
projected savings arising from measures concerning
public employment and health services. The reduction of
5 trillion lire in social expenditure included in the original
proposals was translated into measures concerning
pensions and health services amounting to nearly 4.6
trillion, of which around 0.9 trillion in the form of
increases in social security contributions. Consequently,
the additional revenue generated by the budget will be
around 13 trillion lire instead of just over 11 trillion and
the reduction in expenditure will be around 12 trillion
instead of nearly 14 trillion.

The adjustment measures are contained in the
Finance Law (Law 450 of 27 December 1997), the
accompanying legislation (Law 449 of 27 December
1997) and the law ratifying Decree Law 328 of 29
September 1997 containing tax measures (Law 410 of
29 November 1997).

Law 449 of 27 December 1997 contains provisions
which impose restrictions on budget outlays and with--
drawals from the system of centralized Treasury accounts
similar to those introduced for 1997 in Law 30 of 28
February 1997. In line with the procedure adopted last
year, the official estimates of the effects of the budget do
not include any reduction in expenditure as a result of
these provisions.

Revenue

The budget adjustment measures approved by
Parliament are officially estimated to have increased the
amount of additional revenue by around 1.9 trillion lire
compared with the original proposals. In particular, tax

Effects of the budget on the consolidated
general government income statement (1)
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revenue was increased by 0.5 trillion and non--tax
revenue by 1.4 trillion.

The receipts from administrative measures, which
still have to be specified, were increased by 0.5 trillion.

Other measures still to be specified concerning the
retail prices of goods subject to state monopoly are
expected to raise another 0.4 trillion.

The increase in tax revenue will be partly offset by
the reduction in receipts, estimated at around 0.4 trillion
lire, that will occur as the indirect result of the measures
adopted to curb expenditure.

In approving Law 449 of 27 December 1997,
Parliament introduced reliefs which are officially
estimated to have no net effect on receipts.

In particular, provision was made for tax credits to
cover part of the cost of repairing or restructuring
buildings, including agricultural buildings and public
works, in areas where the risk of earthquakes is high.
Provision was also made for the transformation of
business associations into general partnerships, limited
partnerships or limited companies subject to the assign--
ment to members of registered immovable and movable
goods that are not used in the business and the payment
of a tax in lieu of income tax and the regional tax on
productive activities (Irap). The VAT rate on certain
horticultural products was reduced from 16 to 10 per
cent and extra time given for the payment of VAT by
retailers of textiles, clothing and footwear.

Of the 1.4 trillion lire of additional non--tax revenue,
0.45 trillion is to be generated by the further increase
in the health care contribution charged on motor
third--party liability insurance (the rate was increased
from 6.5 to 10.5 per cent rather than 8.5 per cent
as originally proposed) and more than 0.9 trillion by
the increase in the contribution rate for the pension
schemes of artisans and wholesalers and retailers
(from 15 to 15.8 per cent) and of those for the schemes
of quasi--employee free--lance workers, owner--occupier
farmers, sharecroppers and tenant farmers; provision

was also made for an increase in the fixed contribution
payable by self--employed agricultural workers to the
National Industrial Accidents Insurance Institute
(INAIL).

Expenditure

Pensions -- The measures regarding pensions
included in Law 449 of 27 December 1997 mainly
concern: a) the more rapid harmonization of retirement
requirements in the public sector with those in the private
sector; b) the immediate harmonization of the rules of
special pension schemes with those governing the
Employee Pension Fund; c) a more rapid raising of the
retirement age for some categories compared with the
timetable established in the 1995 reform; among others,
the measure does not apply to blue--collar workers or to
persons who started paying contributions at a young
age; d) the postponement of retirement dates for new
length--of--service pensions in 1998; and e) the
suspension, complete in 1998 and partial in the three
following years, of automatic cost--of--living adjustments
for pensions exceeding five times the minimum pension.

The technical report presented by the Government
shows that the savings deriving from these measures are
expected to increase up to 2007 and then decline rapidly
in the following years. Subsequently, for a period of
about twenty years, expenditure on pensions is set to
increase.

Health care -- It has been made obligatory for the
regions to establish objectives for each Local Health
Agency to achieve expenditure savings equal to at least
2.25 per cent of the expenditure reported in their
statements of account for 1996, revalued by the target
rate of inflation for the two years 1997--98.

Staff costs -- The appropriations for the payment of
overtime to central government employees have been
reduced by 12.01 per cent, except for some categories
such as policemen and firemen.
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As regards consumer prices, the seasonally adjusted
and annualized three-month rise in the index for
worker and employee households gradually
increased from an average of just under 1.5 per cent
in the first half of 1997 to 2.8 per cent in February
1998, according to the preliminary results obtained
for the sample of large cities.

During the year the task of curbing the present
pressures on consumer prices should be made easier
by the trend of international prices, a sharp increase
in productivity and a slowdown in per capita earnings
in the private sector.

Economic policies must be directed towards
accelerating the elimination of these pressures.

The prudence with which monetary policy was
eased in 1997 has prevented strains in international
financial markets and domestic political events from
having adverse repercussions on the lira; it fostered a
further decline in long-term interest rates, which fell
below the convergence threshold in February, and
reduced uncertainty regarding their future course;

and it contributed to the sharp slowdown in the
growth of the monetary aggregates in the last four
months of the year after the rapid rise recorded in the
first eight months.

A firm monetary policy stance remains a
condition for building lasting confidence in the
stability of the lira. Annual inflation is still forecast to
be close to 2 per cent in 1998.

The monetary policy being pursued is aimed at
ensuring that short-term interest rates decrease
towards the levels prevailing in economies with a
longer tradition of monetary stability, with a view to
approaching EMU with the exchange rate at a level
consistent with the central parity.

The growth in the monetary and credit aggregates
must remain moderate, in line with the target values
indicated last autumn. The recent acceleration in bank
lending reflects the recovery in production and
investment; the Bank of Italy is monitoring
developments closely to ensure the expansion in
credit remains compatible with the objectives for
inflation.

Based on information available at 27 February.
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Articles

The recent reform of the tax system

The implementation of the delegated tax powers
contained in the provisions accompanying the
Finance Law for 1997 changed important aspects of
the Italian tax system. The main innovations are:
a) the introduction of a new regional tax on business
activities (Irap); b) the simultaneous abolition of a
series of taxes and contributions; c) the revision of
the structure of personal income tax (Irpef); d) the
reorganization of withholding tax on income from
financial assets; and e) the introduction of a new
system for taxing corporate income, termed Dual
Income Tax (DIT).

The purpose of the changes is to rationalize
and simplify the tax system, which will bring
improvements in efficiency and equity. In particular,
they are aimed at increasing the fiscal autonomy of
lower levels of government, making taxation more
neutral as regards its impact on companies’
decisions, giving greater relief to large families and
simplifying the formalities to be completed by
taxpayers. Although no revenue objectives are
mentioned, one requirement of the change is
considered to be that Irap should generate the same
volume of revenue as the taxes it replaces.

According to government estimates, the elim-
ination of National Health Service contributions,
local income tax (Ilor), the tax on companies’ net
worth, the VAT registration tax, the municipal tax on
businesses and the self-employed (Iciap) and certain
other municipal taxes is likely to lead to a loss of
revenue of about 70.6 trillion lire (Table 1). The
expected yield from Irap is estimated at about 52.3
trillion lire. The difference will be offset by the

increase in the yield from Irpef and corporate income
tax (Irpeg) as a result of the abolition of the various
contributions and duties, which were deductible
(10.7 trillion in total), and by the adjustments in Irpef
tax brackets and credits (around 7.6 trillion).

Table 1
Changes in the composition of revenue as a result

of the introduction of Irap

/RVV RI UHYHQXH GXH WR DEROLWLRQ RI GXWLHV � � � � � � � ������
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,QFUHDVH LQ ,USHI UHYHQXH GXH WR LQFUHDVH LQ WD[ EDVH �����

,QFUHDVH LQ ,USHI UHYHQXH GXH WR FKDQJHV LQ WD[
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The remainder of this article analyzes the
economic effects of the changes.

The introduction of Irap

The introduction of Irap implements the main
recommendations made in 1996 by the “Gallo”
Commission set up at the Finance Ministry to draft
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proposals on “fiscal federalism”. The Commission,
recommended an increase in the proportion of
local authority revenue from local government
taxes accompanied by a reduction in that of
revenue-sharing with central government and
proposed the introduction of a new regional tax of
sufficient size to meet the regions’ financial needs.
The expected revenue from the new tax is equal to
about 40 per cent of the regions’ current expenditure.
The regions will also receive the revenue from the
Irpef surtax, which also came into effect this year.

The increase in the regions’ tax-levying powers
will be gradual. Once the system is fully operational,
the regions will be able to increase the standard rate
of Irap set by central government by up to 1
percentage point and to apply different rates for
different categories of taxpayer and branches of
activity. They will also play an active part in tax
assessment and collection. During the transitional
phase, however, central government will have sole
responsibility for setting tax rates, assessing tax
liabilities and collecting revenue. Initially, the uses
to which revenue can be put will be largely fixed: 90
per cent will be earmarked to finance the National
Health Service, which accounts for the bulk of
regional expenditure.

In designing Irap, account was taken of a number
of more general reform proposals that had emerged
during the debate on taxation policy, thus steering the
changes taking place in the tax system towards
a) simplification, b) broadening of the tax base,
c) greater tax neutrality as regards companies’
decisions on sources of finance and on the mix of
production factors, andd) a reduction in the tax
component of labour costs, at the same time
transferring the financing of part of social security
expenditure from contributions to general taxation.

Irap is a tax on business activities; liability arises
solely from the performance of a productive activity,
without affecting the taxation of the personal income
of the person performing it. The tax base is
determined from the value of net output (value
added), net of depreciation; in the case of productive
activities with establishments in more than one
region, the regional division of value added is based

on the payroll. The tax is proportional and the
standard rate has been set at 4.25 per cent.1

As mentioned above, Irap is being introduced at
the same time as a number of taxes on individual
factors of production are being abolished. The
changeover to a single tax simplifies the formalities
to be performed by taxpayers. By levying the tax on
a very broad tax base instead of the narrow bases of
the previous duties it is possible to charge a relatively
low rate, thus reducing the benefit of tax evasion.

The broadening of the tax base goes some way
towards reducing interference from the tax system in
corporate decisions. Under the previous system, one
type of distortion affected the choice of the optimum
mix of production factors. The old duties altered
relative factor costs because they had a different
impact on the cost of each factor. In particular, Ilor
and the tax on companies’ net worth influenced the
cost of capital, whereas health contributions
impinged on labour costs. The new tax, by contrast,
has a uniform effect on the cost of both. Another type
of distortion relates to companies’ financial
decisions: both Ilor and Irpeg contributed to tax
discrimination between the sources of corporate
finance, because they were levied on all income from
equity capital, whereas interest on debt was
excluded. Irap subjects both income from capital and
interest on debt to taxation.

The overall tax burden arising from the previous
taxes depended on the technical characteristics of the
activity being performed, as reflected in the structure
of the firm’s profit and loss account, and on the
chosen method of financing. Irap, by contrast, gives
rise to a tax liability irrespective of the combination
of production factors used and the structure of
liabilities.

The redistribution of the tax burden as a result of
the changeover to the new system will bring relative
advantages for firms whicha) are highly capitalized
(in view of the relative weight of the tax on net worth
in the old system),b) have relatively low interest
expenses (since interest payments are not deductible
for the purposes of Irap, whereas under the previous
system they could be set against income for the
purposes of Ilor),c) have high overall profits in
relation to value added (again on account of the high
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incidence of Ilor under the old system) and d) did not
enjoy relief from health contributions and therefore
suffered higher tax on labour costs.

The impact of the redistribution of the tax burden
has been phased in gradually only where there is a
substantial increase in liability; this has been done by
applying a “safeguard clause” during the first three
years after the introduction of the tax.

For self-employed persons, the redistribution of
the tax burden associated with the introduction of
Irap is reflected in the distribution of net income: for
them, the levy on business activity is linked with
personal taxation. In order to minimize such
redistribution effects, the introduction of the new tax
has been accompanied by changes in Irpef (see the
sectionThe reform of personal income tax).

Irap has been shaped in such a way that it can
be used as an instrument of economic policy. Expen-
diture on apprentices and 70 per cent of expenditure
on staff hired on work training contracts is deductible
from taxable income, while remaining staff expenses
are fully taxable. Moreover, in order to maintain the
effects of certain contribution reliefs and exemptions
from Ilor that applied in depressed areas, there is
provision for certain regional and sectoral
concessions and a special incentive for new business
activities.

The impact of the introduction of Irap on labour costs

The abolition of health contributions reduces
employers’ social security costs. The reduction is
offset, however, by the part of the new tax on value
added that relates to incomes from employment.
According to an estimate from the Ministry of
Finance, the reduction in labour costs for the
economy as a whole should amount to about 1
percentage point once the system is fully operational.
However, there are considerable differences in the
size and sign of the offsetting amounts for different
types of taxpayer, reflecting differences in the actual
incidence of health contributions under the previous
system.

Before the introduction of Irap, unit labour costs
comprised the following elements:

>�@ /DERXU FRVWV 
 : >�� RV� FV��²§�@

where W stands for gross earnings andos social
security charges excluding health contributions
(pension contributions and allocations to severance
pay funds). The termcs(1-§) represents employers’
actual health contributions;cs is the standard rate of
health contributions,§ the reduction in the standard
rate due either to tax relief2 or to the level of
earnings, given the regressive structure of the tax.
After the introduction of Irap, the cost becomes:

>�@ /DERXU FRVWV 
 : ��� RV� ��� ºU�

whereºr represents the rate of Irap. The difference
in costs due to the switch to the new system is
therefore:

>�@ o /DERXU FRVWV 
 : >ºU��� RV�²FV��²§�@

The standard rate - which changes fromcs, equal
to 11.46 per cent,3 to ºr, equal to 4.25 per cent -
reflects only part of the change in labour costs.
Formula [3] shows that the change in labour costs is
also a positive function of§ andos; under the new
arrangements, the latter is taken into account when
calculating the tax base.

The percentage change in labour costs is not
uniform across all sectors of the economy (Table 2).4

It is larger in those that enjoyed little or no relief from
health contributions, such as small building and
distribution firms. The reduction is smaller in the
case of sectors in which such relief was large, such
as manufacturing.2 For manufacturing firms in the
South, which benefited from higher relief than those
in the North, the effective rate of Irap is reduced for
the first two years. Application of the standard rate
to these firms as well would have brought forward
to 1998 the increase in labour costs that they would
suffer in any case from 2000 onwards owing to the
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reduction in contribution relief, as already agreed at
the Community level. This would have increased
labour costs by 0.9 per cent. Finally, the contribution
that the level of earnings makes to the change in
labour costs is evident from analysis of the bank-
ing sector, which enjoyed no contribution relief
whatsoever. For non-managerial employees with
average gross earnings of 70 million lire a year, the
new system guarantees a reduction in unit costs, even
at the higher rate applied for the first year. The sign
of the change is inverted, albeit only in the first year,
in the case of employees in managerial grades, whose
annual average earnings are 160 million lire; for
them, the regressivity of the health contribution
significantly reduced the relative size of their actual
contributions.

Table 2

Changes in unit labour costs due
to the introduction of Irap

(percentage changes)

:RUNHU ZLWKRXW FRQWULEXWLRQ UHOLHI ��� � � � � � � � � � � � � � � �����

0DQXIDFWXULQJ� ���

HPSOR\HH LQ D ILUP LQ WKH 1RUWK � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � �����

HPSOR\HH LQ D ILUP LQ WKH 6RXWK ��� � � � � � � � � � � � � � � �����

%XLOGLQJ LQGXVWU\� ���

HPSOR\HH LQ D ILUP ZLWK IHZHU WKDQ �� HPSOR\HHV � �����

'LVWULEXWLYH WUDGHV� ���

HPSOR\HH LQ D VPDOO ILUP ��� � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � �����

%DQNLQJ�

HPSOR\HH ZLWK HDUQLQJV RI �� PLOOLRQ OLUH ��� � � � � � � �����

HPSOR\HH ZLWK HDUQLQJV RI �� PLOOLRQ OLUH ��� � � � � � � �����

HPSOR\HH ZLWK HDUQLQJV RI ��� PLOOLRQ OLUH ��� � � � � � ���

HPSOR\HH ZLWK HDUQLQJV RI ��� PLOOLRQ OLUH ��� � � � � � �����

��� :RUNHU ZLWK JURVV DQQXDO HDUQLQJV RI QRW PRUH WKDQ �� PLOOLRQ OLUH SD\LQJ
,UDS DW WKH VWDQGDUG UDWH RI ���� SHU FHQW� �� ��� &DOFXODWHG RQ JURVV DQQXDO HDUQLQJV
RI QRW PRUH WKDQ �� PLOOLRQ OLUH� �� ��� &DOFXODWHG DW WKH UHGXFHG ,UDS UDWH RI ���� SHU
FHQW� DW WKH VWDQGDUG UDWH� ODERXU FRVWV ZRXOG ULVH E\ ��� SHU FHQW� �� ��� )LUPV
ZLWK EHWZHHQ � DQG �� ZRUNHUV� �� ��� &DOFXODWHG DW WKH KLJKHU ,UDS UDWH RI ��� SHU
FHQW� �� ��� &DOFXODWHG DW WKH VWDQGDUG ,UDS UDWH�

It should be remembered that if one wished to
analyze the profitability of employing a worker,
rather than unit labour costs, it would be necessary
to use the marginal cost of labour, which in the new

system is also affected by the increase in the tax
burden due to the fact that Irap is not deductible for
purposes of Irpeg. Moreover, to the extent that a
profit margin is associated with the employment of
a worker account should also be taken of the change
in the taxation of profits (see the section on the Dual
Income Tax system).

The reform of personal income tax

The abolition of health contributions, which
were deductible from taxable income for purposes of
Irpef, affects the distribution of individuals’ net
incomes; in the case of self-employed persons, the
distribution is also altered by the introduction of Irap.
The changes in Irpef tend to counterbalance these
redistributive effects and are also aimed at easing the
tax burden for large families. The first need is met
by the revision of tax brackets, rates and tax credits
for employees and self-employed persons, and the
second by the changes in tax credits in respect of
dependent children and relatives.

In Table 3 the changes in net income due to the
introduction of Irap and the simultaneous revision of
Irpef5 are shown separately for employees and
self-employed workers.

Analysis of the case of a worker without
dependent relatives makes it possible to isolate the
effects of the change in tax brackets, rates and credits
for employees and self-employed workers. In the
absence of such changes, employees would see their
net income rise owing to the abolition of the health
contributions for which they were liable (see
hypothesis B in Table 3). The raising of the rate for
the lowest tax brackets is aimed at offsetting this
effect; the revision of the tax credit for employees
forms part of the adjustment, and at the same time
reduces the tax burden on those on medium and low
incomes. The new structure of Irpef guarantees that
the net income of a worker with annual gross
earnings of 40 million lire will increase. The benefit
diminishes as gross earnings rise, as the tax credit for
employees is on a reducing sliding scale (see
hypothesis C in Table 3).
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Table 3

Impact of the introduction of Irap and the changes in Irpef on net income
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��� 0DUULHG ZRUNHU ZLWK WZR GHSHQGHQW FKLOGUHQ�

The effects of abolishing health contributions
and introducing Irap are more complex in the case of
self-employed persons. The abolition of health
contributions increases net income, while the
increase in taxation due to the introduction of the
new tax reduces it. Again taking the case of a worker
without dependent relatives, the net result of the two
effects depends on the level of gross income because
of the regressivity of health contributions (see
hypothesis B in Table 3), which reduced the effective
rate of the health contribution for a worker with a
gross annual income of 70 million lire by comparison
with that for a self-employed worker with one of 40
million. The introduction of the new tax, which is
proportional, increases the tax burden for the worker
on the higher income.

The reform of Irpef now enters the picture,
bringing an increase in the lowest tax rate and
graduating the tax credit for the self-employed
according to tax bracket and limiting them to taxable

incomes of not more than 60 million lire. The
structure of the tax credit increases net income by
comparison with the previous arrangements for gross
incomes of less than about 37 million lire. It should
be remembered, however, that the calculations do not
take account of the effects of abolishing Iciap and the
VAT registration tax. Moreover, they relate to
taxpayers who derive no tax benefit from the
abolition of the other duties as they were not subject
to Ilor and did not pay the tax on companies’ net
worth.

For employees with dependent relatives, the
revision of the related tax credits magnifies the
increase in net income resulting from the changes in
Irpef. In the case of self-employed persons, the
increase in tax credits in respect of dependent
relatives partly offsets the increase in tax due to the
reform. This offsetting effect diminishes as income
rises, however, since tax credits for children are fixed
amounts.
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The reform of the taxation of income from capital

The current reform of the taxation of income
from capital, which will come into effect on 1 July
1998, is part of a process initiated some time ago
with the aim of gradually standardizing the rates of
tax on different types of savings. It tends to increase
the neutrality of taxation of income from capital,
whether derived from financial assets or from
business activities.

To that end, the changes are based on five
fundamental points: a) a reduction in the number of
rates to two: a reduced rate of 12.5 per cent, which
is applicable mainly to income on government
securities, and a standard rate of 27 per cent, which
is levied on interest on bank deposits, for example;
b) a broadening of the tax base by making capital
gains and income from trading in derivatives taxable;
c) the taxation of capital gains on an accruals basis,
rather on a realization basis; d) in the case of savings
entrusted to financial intermediaries for manage-
ment, the introduction of the possibility of opting for
tax to be paid on the net profit earned on the
investor’s portfolio; and e) in the case of assets
entrusted to financial intermediaries for admini-
stration, the introduction of the possibility of opting
for tax to be paid at source by the intermediary at the
time of each transaction. Many of these innovations
give financial intermediaries a greater role as
tax-collection agents.

The taxation model described in pointd) (the
“managed savings” model) is a novelty at the
international level. By taxing the net profit on the
portfolio, it makes it possible to offset any capital
losses on securities either against capital gains on
any type of financial instrument (hence, including
offsetting between shares and bonds) or against
income flows generated by the portfolio (interest
and dividends, etc.). Moreover, this arrangement
involves taxing capital gains on an accruals basis. In
the case of collective investment undertakings it
replaces the previous tax on net worth.

Under the system described in pointe) (the
“administered assets” model), capital gains are taxed
when they are actually realized; however, the

intermediary is required to adjust the tax base by
applying an appropriate correction coefficient (the
“equalizer”, set by ministerial decree), which adjusts
capital gains and losses in order to bring the tax into
line with that which would have been paid on an
accruals basis. Offsetting between gains and losses
takes place only within the investor’s deposit with
the asset manager.

The “normal” tax regime continues to be that
based on the income tax return; the “equalizer” is
applied here too. This regime has been made
obligatory in the event of the sale of “significant”
shareholdings (in other words, the taxpayer cannot
opt for either of the other two methods).

In all cases, the taxpayer may carry forward any
capital losses for a maximum of four tax years.

The Dual Income Tax system

From the 1997 tax year onwards, entrepreneurial
income will be subject to a new tax regime, called
Dual Income Tax, which changes the method of
determining taxes on the entrepreneurial incomes of
individuals and corporate entities (Irpef and Irpeg)
by introducing a reduced rate of tax on a tranche of
such incomes. Banks and insurance companies will
not be subject to the new system until the year 2000.

The DIT regime is designed to reduce the tax
discrimination between different sources of finance
that occurred under the previous system, which
favoured debt capital over equity capital. This
distortion, which is present in the tax systems of
many countries, had become more pronounced in
Italy in the eighties owing to the raising of tax rates,
which increased the tax savings from the full
deductibility of interest expenses. Between 1980 and
1997 the tax rate on corporate income increased from
36.3 to 53.2 per cent. The abolition of Ilor and the
introduction of Irap now brings the rate of tax on
profits down to 41.25 per cent and interest expenses
are subject to Irap at the rate of 4.25 per cent.

Application of the concessionary provisions of
the DIT regime further reduces the discrimination in
favour of debt capital, thus reducing the rate of tax
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on profits below 41.25 per cent. The mechanism
operates by dividing taxable income into two
components: “normal” income, ascribable to new
capital, which is taxed at a reduced rate of 19 per
cent, and “residual” income, which in the case of
corporate entities is taxed at the standard rate of 37
per cent.6 “Normal” income is calculated by
applying an imputed official yield to the capital
accumulated by the enterprise since September
1996. “Residual” income therefore consists of two
components: any profit attributable to the new
capital over and above “normal” income and profit
attributable to existing capital.

Confining the analysis to corporate entities, the
average tax rateºPJ is the result of applying the
reduced rate of 19 per cent to “normal” income
(which represents a share ofq of total profits) and
the ordinary rate of 37 per cent to the “residual”
profit:

>�@ ºPJ 
 ��� ��²T�� ��� T

The rate is nevertheless subject to a minimum of
27 per cent, so that it may assume a value of between
27 and 37 per cent, depending onq. Companies
admitted to stock exchange listing are granted larger
concessions for a period of three years, which take
the form of a reduced rate of 7 per cent and a
minimum average rate of 20 per cent.

Limiting the concession to increases in capital
creates an incentive to strengthen the enterprise’s
capital base. By making eligibility for the concession
conditional on the financial choices made by the
firm, this limitation gives a tax advantage for
investment made by issuing equity rather than debt
capital. This further reduces the discrimination in
favour of debt; as well as lessening the tax advantage
as a result of the mechanical effect of the reduction
in the tax rate, it generates a further tax advantage for
increases in equity capital. However, the setting of a
minimum average rate of 27 per cent, which is
justified by the need for revenue, neutralizes the
incentive effect when the enterprise reaches a
particular liability mix.

The ceiling of 27 per cent is reached whereq
equals 55.5 per cent of total profit. Assuming an
actual yield on capital equal to the imputed rate used
for calculating the “normal” yield (we represent both
by r), this percentage also represents the ratio of new
capital to total capital. By labeling the increase in
capitalCn and the initial capitalCv, it is possible to
calculate the rate of growth in equity capital required
to coincide with the minimum average rate:

´QRUPDOµ LQFRPH 
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By substituting the expressions in the first three
lines into the last, we obtain:
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 T � ��²T�

which, for a value ofq of 55.5 per cent, gives ak of
122.2 per cent. In other words, on the hypotheses
regarding rates of return, the 27 per cent tax rate
would be reached if capital increases more than
doubled the firm’s initial capital.7

As q increases towards 55.5 per cent, the average
tax rate falls gradually from 37 to 27 per cent. In this
case, there is an effective incentive to increase own
funds, as income on the new capital is subject to a
marginal rate of 19 per cent, thus reducing the
average rateºPJ .

If the scale of capital increases is such thatq
exceeds 55.5 per cent, the incentive disappears, since
ºPJ has already reached its lower limit; the marginal
rate on investment, however financed, is 27 per cent.

The incentive implicit in DIT during the
transitional period is likely to have a greater effect on
less highly capitalized firms; they potentially have
greater scope to take advantage of the new
concessions by increasing their equity capital.

Finally, assuming the same initial capital
situation (and hence the same average overall Irpeg
rate) and fresh injections of capital (and
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3consequently “normal” income imputed to such
capital), the effect of the concessions depends on the
profitability of the firm, and in particular on the
difference between the actual yield and the imputed
rate used to calculate the “normal” yield. Higher
actual yields signify higher overall increases in
profits and lead to the application of a higherºPJ . This
gives a relative advantage to less profitable firms: the
average rate falls more rapidly towards the 27 per
cent minimum and the capital increases needed to
reach that level are smaller.7

1 Special transitional arrangements have been made for
agriculture (a reduced rate of 2.5 per cent in 1998, rising
gradually to 4.25 per cent in 2002) and for the banking and
insurance sectors (a higher rate of 5.4 per cent in 1998,
gradually declining to 4.25 per cent in 2001).

2 For manufacturing firms in the Centre and North, the rate of
the abolished contributions was reduced from 11.46 to 6.76
per cent, while for firms in the same sector but situated in the
South it came down to 4.76 per cent; for building firms the
reduced rate was 9.86 per cent and for distribution firms it
varied between 9.1 and 10.56 per cent, depending on the size
of firm. The level of health contribution relief in the South
was to have been brought into line with those applying in the
rest of the country by the year 2000 in accordance with
agreements reached at the Community level.

3 Equal to the sum of the National Health Service contribution
(9.6 per cent), part of the TB contribution (1.66 per cent) and

the contribution for pensioners’ health assistance (0.2 per
cent). It was applied to gross annual earnings of up to 40
million lire. The NHS contribution was regressive, having
been levied at 9.6 per cent on the first 40 million lire, 3.8 per
cent on income between 40 and 150 million, above which no
further contribution was due.

4 The calculations take no account of contributions for
compulsory accident insurance (INAIL contributions), as the
contribution rate depends on the specific risk associated with
the type of work and the company’s accident record. Their
inclusion would not, however, substantially affect the change
in labour costs due to the introduction of the new system as
they do not form part of the Irap tax base. Estimates from the
Ministry of Finance have been used for the rate of allocations
to severance pay funds.

5 Half a percentage point of the new rates consists of the
regional Irpef surtax.

6 In the case of sole traders and partnerships, the “normal”
income imputed from new own capital is also taxed
separately at 19 per cent (the same rate as for the first Irpef
tax bracket), whereas “residual” income is taxed in the same
way as personal income. For determining the rate to be
applied, the tranche of income taxed separately is added back
into total income in order to take account of the progressivity
of Irpef. The standard rate will therefore vary according to the
taxpayer’s total income.

7 If the actual rate of return on capitalr is higher than the
imputed rate, the value ofk will also be higher; in that case
the minimum average rate would become a constraint if
increases in own capital were even larger. The opposite
occurs if the rate of return is lower than the imputed rate.
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The National Financial Changeover Plan:
the transition to the euro in the Italian financial system (*)

1. Introduction1

In November 1997 the Finance Subcommittee -
the part of the Euro Committee2 coordinating
activities for the transition to the euro in the Italian
financial system - approved the second edition of the
National Financial Changeover Plan, which sets out
guidelines for the various participants in the Italian
financial system to ensure an orderly changeover
from the lira to the euro while safeguarding the
competitive position of the Italian financial system.3

The Plan is primarily aimed at operators in the
financial sector and represents Italy’s application of
the guidelines for the transition scenario that were
formulated at the Madrid European Council in 1995
and subsequently elaborated on in two Council
Regulations.4

These guidelines establish a number of features
of the transition that will be the same across the
European Union but leave the individual countries
and economic operators free to decide the other
aspects of the changeover to the euro. The Plan covers
many issues for which decisions must be taken by
national authorities and the Italian business
community5 and identifies some problems, such as
the redenomination of financial instruments, that will
be addressed in the legislative decrees provided for in
the enabling law6 for the introduction of the euro. The
publication of the new version of the Plan marks the
end of the period of analysis and planning and the
beginning of implementation.

2. Essential features

The Madrid scenario provides for a transition
period from 1 January 1999 to 31 December 2001
during which economic operators, on the basis of the
principle of “no compulsion, no prohibition”, will be

free to use both the euro and national denominations
of the euro, represented by the currencies of the
countries participating in Stage Three of Economic
and Monetary Union (EMU).

The Plan incorporates this principle and
summarizes the key aspects of the transition to the
euro in the financial sector into the following five
basic propositions regarding the four main areas of
activity:

Payments. - From 1 January 1999 financial
market participants and the general public will be able
to use the euro for all payment and collection
operations where coins and banknotes are not
required;

Markets. - From 1 January 1999 transactions on
the money and financial markets will take place in
euros.

Financial instruments. - From 1 January 1999 all
government securities will be denominated in euros.
On that date, government securities such as Treasury
bills, Treasury credit certificates, Treasury bonds and
any other transferable government security will be
converted into euros. Non-transferable government
securities, such as Post Office saving certificates, will
be converted into euros on 1 January 2002.

Other financial instruments will be converted
in stages. A programmed redenomination of the
securities will be facilitated by measures to reduce the
cost of conversion to the issuers.

Statistics. - From 1 January 1999 all
intermediaries required to submit reports to the
authorities for supervisory and statistical purposes
may denominate them in euros. Statistics produced
by these authorities will be denominated in euros.

(*) Prepared by the Foreign Department.
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3. Areas of intervention

One or more macro-projects have been identified
for each of the above areas. The division of the areas
into macro-projects is intended to permit the
identification of the actions that need to be taken,
under the direction of one entity, in order to define and
adopt appropriate solutions. A lead organization has
been appointed to coordinate activities for each
macro-project.

The “Payments” area covers the payment system
(the infrastructure for transfers of money) and will be
highly affected by the introduction of the euro.
Because of its pyramidal shape, with the trading of
goods and services between economic agents at the
base, payment services provided by the banking and
postal systems in the middle and the Bank of Italy at
the top for the final settlement of transactions, the area
has been divided into two macro-projects:

1) Bank of Italy - financial intermediaries (lead
organization: Bank of Italy);

2) The banking and postal system - customers (lead
organization: ABI).

The Bank of Italy has the leading role in the
first macro-project, since transactions between
intermediaries change the balances on the accounts
they hold with the Bank of Italy. The second
macro-project regards financial services provided by
intermediaries to customers.

One of the projects included in the first
macro-project, the Italian gross settlement system
(BI-REL),7 has been completed and is already
operational. It began functioning in June 1997 and
commenced full operations in January 1998,
allowing the real-time settlement of the large-value
transactions in the markets and interbank procedures
that previously flowed through the clearing system.

BI-REL enables intermediaries to broaden their
range of products and improve the quality of service
offered to customers, who can now make and receive

real-time payments in lire and, from the beginning
of Stage Three of EMU, in euros. Testing of the
Interlinking system between BI-REL and the
European Monetary Institute and other national gross
settlement systems is currently under way.

The second macro-project in the “Payments” area
is aimed at enabling customers to use payment
services for operations in either lire or euros for
collection and payment services from the beginning
of the transition period. It will therefore be possible
to effect collections and payments in either currency
through current accounts or with credit or payment
instruments other than cash. Debtors will be able to
choose the currency in which they make payments if
the debt can be paid by crediting the creditor’s
account. If the creditor has an account in a currency
other than the payment currency, the intermediary
will credit the equivalent amount after conversion.

This project is based on a specific interbank
agreement that commits all banks to accepting and
processing both paper-based and electronic euro
operations received through the interbank system.
This will provide individual banks with the necessary
certainty to execute payment and collection orders
denominated in euro on behalf of customers, since, as
a participant in the agreement, the final destination
bank will be required to handle the order.

The agreement specifies the exact moment in
the process that any conversions from lire to euros
or vice-versa are to be made: the intermediary
originating the transaction and any intermediate
entity, including “transit banks”, will transmit the
value of the operation in the currency originally
specified by the customer so that any conversion is
carried out only at the time the final beneficiary’s
account is credited. This will prevent multiple
conversion and reconversion of the amount as the
transaction passes from one intermediary to another
so as to avoid generating inaccuracies due to
rounding. The agreement also requires participants to
report any information returned to the payment
sender in the original currency in order to enable
automatic matching with the original orders.

Non-bank intermediaries that operate in the
interbank network may also participate in the
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agreement given their major role in the payment
systems.

The agreement came into force in October 1997
in order to allow sufficient time for completion of
the many measures needed for the changeover before
1 January 1999, including the modification of
interbank procedures.

The “Markets” area regards the trading of
monetary and financial instruments, an activity
whose “production cycle” is divided into two main
parts: negotiation, when the contracting parties agree
to the essential elements of the transaction (price,
quantity, maturity); and settlement, when the
transaction is concluded with the actual exchange of
securities for money. Two macro-projects have been
identified within this area:

1) The foreign exchange market, the money market
(MID), and the wholesale (MTS) and forward
(MIF-MTO) markets in government securities
(lead organization: ABI);

2) The Stock Exchange (lead organization: Borsa
Italiana S.p.A.)

The Madrid Council did not lay down a specific
frame of reference for the introduction of the euro in
this area, i.e., the structures where price formation,
exchange and settlement take place. The decisions
will accordingly be made at the national level.

Unlike the “Payments” area, it was considered
essential for trading in financial instruments to
provide for the use of only one currency and a
simultaneous changeover to the euro by all markets.
The fundamental reasons for this choice lie in the
need to:

- avoid market segmentation, which could under-
mine the competitiveness of the Italian financial
market;

- ensure efficiency and curb trading costs.

Given its close connection with the single
monetary policy, the foreign exchange market will

change over to the euro at the beginning of the
transition period. The Bank of Italy will quote only
the euro against the currencies of EU countries that do
not participate in Stage Three of EMU and non-EU
currencies. As this is a strictly over-the-counter
market, no timetable for action is envisaged.

The interbank deposit market will be
considerably affected by the introduction of the euro,
both technically and strategically. In fact, from 1
January 1999:

- monetary policy will be conducted in euros by
the European System of Central Banks (ESCB);

- European interbank transactions will be settled
in euros within the TARGET system;

- the centralized settlement accounts of commer-
cial banks at the national central banks will also
be denominated in euros.

All banks in the euro area will thus be required to
handle flows in the new unit of account and will have
to compete with other banks, including those in other
countries, for financing in central bank money from
the ESCB.

With the adoption of the euro in transactions on
the interbank deposit market, as things currently
stand the Rome Interbank Borrowed Rate (RIBOR)
will cease to exist. The European Banking Federation
(EBF) has made known its view that retaining the
individual national benchmark rates might generate
confusion among market participants. These
considerations have prompted the EBF to take
EURIBOR as a new, single internal interbank rate
for the entire euro area, supplanting today’s national
rates (RIBOR, PIBOR, FIBOR, etc.).

The EBF has suggested using the reference bank
method for determining the new rate. The banks
selected (by each participating country) would be
required to report daily to the EBF the quote
(indicative or binding) at which they are prepared to
do business.

The EBF has yet to make a definitive decision on
the method of calculation. In any case, further study
of the legal implications of the substitution of
EURIBOR for the national interbank reference rates
is required.
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The introduction of the euro on the secondary
market in government securities (MTS) does not
appear to create any special problems given the
characteristics of the wholesale market and the
flexibility of its screen-based trading systems.
Redenomination will only involve the nominal value
of securities and will not affect the characteristics of
the loans (duration, interest rate, coupon payment
dates, repayment terms and issuing procedures),
which on the basis of the continuity of contracts
principle will remain unaltered. In order to avoid the
problem of odd lots created with the redenomination
of securities, the minimum subscription lot at auction
will be changed from the current 5 million lire to
1,000 euros.

The dematerialization of financial instruments
will have a much greater impact, with their
circulation being ensured by means of changes in
accounting entries carried out by intermediaries. The
project is the culmination of a process aimed at
gradually reducing the volume of physical securities
in circulation and increasing their centralization with
the central securities depositories (Monte Titoli and
the Bank of Italy).

The measure that will introduce this major
innovation into Italian law is currently being
prepared, pursuant to Articles 7 and 10 of the enabling
law.

The implementation of EMU and the adoption of
the single currency will have a multitude of
far-reaching effects on the Italian Stock Exchange. As
regards trading procedures for financial instruments,
the preliminary version of the National Financial
Changeover Plan in June defined and set out plans for
a “big bang” transition, with a simultaneous launch of
the use of the euro for all financial instruments as
from 1 January 1999. The stock market, including the
trading, settlement and clearing system, can therefore
be compared to a “black box”: intermediaries will
operate normally with customers on the outside while
trading and settlement will function in euros on the
inside. Customers orders will be denominated in
euros, while, on the basis of the “no compulsion, no
prohibition” principle, customer relationships with
intermediaries can be denominated in their currency

of choice, presumably the euro for professional
investors and the lira for the general public.

The “Financial instruments” area covers issues
regarding the redenomination of lira-denominated
financial instruments into euros. For reasons similar
to those for the “Markets” area it was also decided to
create two macro-projects:

1) The redenomination of public debt (lead organi-
zation: Ministry of the Treasury);

2) The redenomination of other financial instru-
ments (lead organization: Borsa Italiana S.p.A.).

The redenomination of public debt has been
studied with regard to both transferable and
non-transferable government securities.

The existence of two parallel markets for
transferable government securities, one denominated
in lire, the other in euros, could seriously compromise
the efficiency of both, with repercussions for
the competitiveness of the Italian bond market.
The Ministry of the Treasury has therefore decided
to proceed immediately in redenominating all
transferable government securities in issue,
regardless of their residual maturity. All lira-
denominated transferable government debt will
therefore be redenominated in euros on 1 January
1999. Payments of interest and principal will be
determined with reference to the euro value of the
securities and executed in euros. This means that
financial relationships, both between the Treasury
and the Bank of Italy and between the latter and the
banking system, will be denominated entirely in
euros.

The situation for non-transferable government
securities is as follows:

- conversion into euros will take place on 1 January
2002;

- as from 1 January 1999, investors will be able to
purchase Post Office saving certificates (BPF) in
euros;

- until 1 January 2002 at the latest, old lira-denomi-
nated saving certificates can be sold at Post Office
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branches at the express request of investors until
stocks have run out.

As regards deposits and withdrawals of savings
with the Post Office in forms other than cash, the
general principles for the payment system as a whole
will hold during the transition period: users will be
able to choose between the euro and the lira for both
payments and receipts.

As far as the public debt as a whole is concerned,
given the principle of continuity of contracts, all
lira-denominated government securities in certificate
form will automatically be considered euro-
denominated securities converted at the fixed
conversion rate (as from 1 January 1999 if
transferable and 1 January 2002 if non-transferable)
without requiring them to be reprinted or explicitly
stamped with their new euro value.

The Plan does not establish a fixed timetable for
the redenomination of other financial instruments, as
it was necessary to comply with the principle of “no
compulsion, no prohibition” and take account of the
presence of a vast and diversified group of issuers.
The main problem in this area is that the adoption of
the single currency will require that all financial
accounts, including the nominal values of securities
and all information produced for external users, be
converted into euros.

The “Statistics” area regards the reports that
intermediaries must regularly submit to the
supervisory authorities and the UIC. The
corresponding macro-project,Statistical and
supervisory reports (lead organization: Bank of
Italy), is intended to decide whether data should be
compiled in euros or lire.

The macro-project essentially covers the
procedures that the Bank of Italy, the UIC, Consob
and ISVAP, as institutions receiving statistical and
supervisory reports, will follow in managing the
changeover to reporting in euros.

During the transition period institutions required
to send reports to the supervisory authorities will be
able to select either the lira or the euro as the reporting
currency, subject to the constraints of consistency of

reports transmitted to the different authorities and the
irreversibility of the changeover to the euro.

In accordance with this decision, other problems
raised by the changeover to the single currency for the
collection and management of credit and financial
statistics were addressed within this framework.

1 This article is an extract of the full National Financial
Changeover Plan, published on 10 December 1997. The
information contained here is accurate as of that date.

2 The Euro Committee, chaired by Treasury under-secretary
Roberto Pinza, was established in June 1996 on the order of
the President of the Council of Ministers with the task of
coordinating actions connected with the introduction of the
single currency. Preparatory work for the adoption of the euro
by Italy had already begun prior to the constitution of the Euro
Committee:
- at the Ministry of the Treasury, with a working group for the

adjustment of the public financial structure to the
introduction of the euro;

- at the Bank of Italy, with a Coordination Committee for
Economic and Monetary Union;

- at the Italian Bankers’ Association (ABI), with a plan for
EMU (the so-called EMU Project).

The establishment of the Euro Committee ensures that all
these initiatives are linked in a unified effort. The Committee
set up three subcommittees responsible for the following
areas: “Government”, “Finance” (the monetary and financial
system, including insurance) and “Enterprises” (industrial,
commercial, craft and agricultural enterprises). The Finance
Subcommittee, coordinated by Tommaso Padoa-Schioppa,
chairman of the Companies and Stock Exchange
Commission, began its work in early December 1996. The
organizations participating in the Committee are: ABI, ANIA
(the National Association of Insurance Companies), the Bank
of Italy, the Stock Exchange Council (now Borsa Italiana
S.p.A.), Consob (the Companies and Stock Exchange
Commission), the Post Office, ISVAP (the Supervisory
Authority for the Insurance Industry), the Ministry for
Industry, the Ministry of the Treasury, the UIC (the Italian
Foreign Exchange Office), Assonime (National Association
of Companies Limited by Shares), Cassa Depositi e Prestiti
(Deposits and Loans Fund) and Monte Titoli (the central
securities depository).

3 The first edition of the National Financial Changeover Plan
was presented in the pamphlet “From the lira to the euro”,
published by the Euro Committee in June 1997, which
identified a series of issues regarding the changeover to the
euro in each of the three areas into which the Committee is
divided (see note 1).

4 The first regulation (no. 1103/97 of 17 June 1997, which was
published in the Official Journal of the European
Communities of 19 June 1997 and came into force the
following day), adopted under Article 235 of the Treaty,
contains the provisions regarding the replacement of the ECU
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with the euro in legal documents, the principle of the
continuity of contracts, procedures for conversion between
national currencies and between the latter and the euro, and
the rules on rounding. The second, which will complete the
legal framework for the use of the euro on the basis of Article
109l of the Treaty, will be issued in the spring of 1998 in
concomitance with the selection of the countries that will
participate in Stage Three as from 1 January 1999, the date the
euro will become a currency in its own right and the official
ECU basket will cease to exist.

5 In particular, Article 8 (4) of the regulation adopted under
Article 109l allows Member States to adopt measures during
the transition period to:
- redenominate existing government securities in euros;

- permit the use of the euro for trading, clearing and
settlement of financial instruments;

- permit the use the euro for the ordinary exchange, clearing
and settlement of payments;

- redenominate in euros any public debt issued in the
currency of another Member State and the financial
instruments of private-sector issuers.

6 Law 433 of 17 December 1997 (“Delega al Governo per
l’introduzione dell’Euro”) was published in theGazzetta
Ufficiale della Repubblica italiana no. 295 of 19 December
1997.

7 See the box: “The Bank of Italy’s real time gross settlement
system: launch of the second stage”.
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Survey of the compliance of Italian banks’ information systems
with euro and Year 2000 requirements(*)

1. The international and domestic situation

For banks, the introduction of operations
denominated in euros and the start of the new
millennium will necessitate a substantial effort to
revise and adapt their information systems. In the
case of the euro, all automated procedures will have
to be adjusted to handle the new unit of account (e.g.,
the conversion of amounts in national currencies into
euros or the handling of decimals);1 in the case of the
Year 2000 problem, all information systems that use
only two digits to indicate the year (and are therefore
unable to distinguish one century from another) have
to be identified and corrected.

The importance of these two problems and the
fact that they must be dealt with at virtually the same
time mean that the process of analyzing, modifying
and testing the procedures involved will be
particularly onerous in both economic and
organizational terms.

In addition to addressing the technological
aspects of these issues, the banks’ top management
will have to weigh the operational and legal risks
very carefully, as well as those involving their
reputations. Another factor to be considered is the
possibility that the inadequacy of borrowers’
information systems may cause them operating
problems, thereby exposing lender banks to credit
risk.

The interest of the supervisory authorities in
these issues is prompted by the major effort required
of intermediaries.

As part of a series of initiatives concerning the
Year 2000, the Basle Committee on Banking
Supervision has issued a recommendation drawing
the banks’ attention to the risks involved and the
actions to be taken. So far as the change of date is
concerned, national supervisory authorities are

currently carrying out checks, including inspections,
to verify the proper functioning of information
systems.2

European banks will also have to evaluate the
implications of their decisions regarding operations
in euros. The European Council of Madrid
established that intermediaries will be free to choose
whether or not to offer services in euros to their
customers during the transition period from 1
January 1999 to 31 December 2001.

Italian banks have agreed a partial departure
from that principle, signing an agreement that
commits signatories to accept and process
transactions in euros originating in the interbank
circuit from the start of the transition period.

As part of cooperative efforts between ABI (the
Italian Bankers’ Association) and CIPA (the
Interbank Convention on Automation) - as within
the “Payments” area of the Euro Committee at the
Ministry of the Treasury - directives have been
issued that address both the euro and Year 2000
problems in relation to payment system procedures.3

The modification of interbank procedures to cope
with the euro and the Year 2000 is at an advanced
stage.

2. The Bank of Italy survey

In November 1997 the Banking Supervision
Department sent a questionnaire on the impact of the
euro and the Year 2000 on information systems to all
939 banks operating in Italy. The survey focused
particularly on the banks’ internal procedures, the
adjustment of which is left to their discretion.

(*) Prepared by the Banking Supervision Department.
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The aim of the questionnaire was to discover
how aware top management is of the problems and
the state of progress with related plans, as well as to
apprise operators of the key risks involved.

The survey is part of a broader effort by the
Banking Supervision Department to ascertain the
adequacy of banks’ organizational and technical
structures.

The survey comprised two forms: a more
detailed questionnaire addressed to banks that
manage and develop their own information systems;
and a simplified version for banks that either already
outsource these services or expect to do so in the near
future.

By the end of January this year 884 replies had
been received, 76 per cent of which referred to the
simplified questionnaire.4

The replies reveal that almost all banks plan to
engage in euro-denominated operations on a large
scale from the start of the transition period; top
management took part in planning the strategies for
the euro in 89 per cent of cases and for the Year 2000
in 84 per cent.

The more detailed replies received from banks
with in-house EDP centres show that 11 per cent
approved the related plans of action in the first six
months of last year, more than 40 per cent did so in
the second half of 1997 and a further 16 per cent
expect to do so during 1998.

Nearly one half of these banks - representing 13
per cent of the banking system’s total assets - have
not yet formalized their plans in a single document.
The delay is frequently attributed to uncertainty
regarding Italy’s participation in EMU from its
inception; planning in other cases is reported to have
been suspended or slowed down to await the
outcome of mergers or changes in ownership.

3. Organizational issues

In general, banks with in-house EDP centres plan
to address the problems by appointing a specific
manager for them (for both the euro and the Year

2000 in 59 per cent of cases, for the euro alone in 28
per cent), by engaging the services of consultancies
(52 per cent), or by drawing up an inventory of the
procedures to be adapted (95 per cent).

An equal number of respondents reported
strategies based either on the substantial renewal of
information systems or the modification of existing
procedures. A limited number of banks (6 per cent)
indicated they were planning to outsource, mainly to
other group companies.

In 65 per cent of cases the adjustment of systems
to the euro and the Year 2000 is to be carried out
jointly; for banks planning to manage the
modifications separately, 19 per cent plan to give the
projects equal priority, while 14 per cent plan to
focus on the euro and 2 per cent on the Year 2000.

The planned actions involve applications
software in 100 per cent of cases, central hardware
in 58 per cent, personal computers in 37 per cent,
system software in 55 per cent, networks in 15 per
cent, ATMs and POSs in 73 per cent and auxiliary
equipment such as form and cheque scanners,
sensors, security systems and telephone
switchboards in 55 per cent.

Some banks have no plans to introduce changes
in their branch systems (10 per cent) or control
procedures (35 per cent).

Adjustments for the Year 2000 will affect both
procedures and databases in 73 per cent of cases,
while 27 per cent of banks will modify procedures
only.

Banks that outsource their information
processing reported actions involving control
procedures (78 per cent), personal computers and
departmental systems (78 per cent), ATMs and POSs
(15 per cent for the Year 2000 only and 68 per cent
for the euro also), and auxiliary equipment (75 per
cent).

All the banks declared their strong commitment
to training personnel: more than 90 per cent have
already begun or intend to introduce initiatives to
prepare staff for the operational problems posed by
the transition to the euro and the Year 2000.
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Table 1
Joint euro--Year 2000 projects: timetable of measures

(percentage of banks)

���� ���� ����
���� ����

+� +� +� +� +� +�
���� ����

&XUUHQW DFFRXQWV
VWDUW � � � � � � � �� �� �� �� � �

&XUUHQW DFFRXQWV � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � �
HQG � � � � � � � � � �� �� � �

)XQG UDLVLQJ DQG OHQGLQJ
VWDUW � � � � � � � �� �� �� � �� �

)XQG�UDLVLQJ DQG OHQGLQJ � � � � � � � � � �
HQG � � � � � � � � � �� �� � �� �

)LQDQFH
VWDUW � � � � � � � � �� �� �� �

)LQDQFH � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � �
HQG � � � � � � � � � �� �� � � �

)RUHLJQ
VWDUW � � � � � � � �� �� �� �� �

)RUHLJQ � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � �
HQG � � � � � � � � � �� �� � �

$FFRXQWLQJ
VWDUW � � � � � � � �� �� �� �� � �

$FFRXQWLQJ � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � �
HQG � � � � � � � � �� �� �� � � �

0DQDJHPHQW FRQWURO
VWDUW � � � � � � � �� � �� �� � �� �

0DQDJHPHQW FRQWURO � � � � � � � � � � � � � �
HQG � � � � � � � � � �� �� � �� �

)LQDQFLDO VWDWHPHQWV
VWDUW � � � � � � � � �� �� �� �

)LQDQFLDO VWDWHPHQWV � � � � � � � � � � � � � �
HQG � � � � � � � � �� �� �� �� � �

&UHGLW DQG GHELW FDUGV
VWDUW � � � � � � � � �� �� ��

&UHGLW DQG GHELW FDUGV � � � � � � � � � � � � �
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2WKHU LQWHUEDQN SURFHGXUHV
VWDUW � � � � � � � � �� �� �

2WKHU LQWHUEDQN SURFHGXUHV � � � � � � � �
HQG � � � � � � � � � � �� � � � �

4. Target dates

Analysis of the starting and ending dates for the
euro and Year 2000 projects shows that 1998 is a key
year, during which analysis and renovation of major
procedures will be concentrated and the testing and
implementation of applications will begin.

In most projects priority is being given to
adjusting interbank and management procedures,
while those involving accounting and internal
control procedures have generally been postponed,
albeit not beyond the second half of 1999 (Table 1).

Only a small number of banks (5 per cent) plan
to implement two-stage strategies: renovation of
main applications by the end of 1998 and subsequent
completion of the project at the end of the transition
period.

Banks that are tackling the Year 2000 problem
separately from the euro adjustment have generally

begun their efforts earlier and, in some cases, claim
that their systems are already in compliance (more
than 40 per cent for accounting and management
control applications and 33 per cent for current
account procedures). On the other hand, a third of
banks with separate Year 2000 programmes plan to
complete adjustment by the end of 1999.

5. Estimated costs

A total of 46 per cent of banks have estimated
costs for their euro and Year 2000 projects, while 16
per cent have estimated them for the euro alone and
1 per cent for Year 2000 alone.

The banks that have quantified their costs
account for 75 per cent of the banking system’s total
assets. The overall amount is about 2.7 trillion lire,
equal to an average of 5.5 per cent of those banks’
operating costs (48 trillion lire in 1996 - Table 2).
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Table 2
Adjustment costs

(as a percentage of 1996 operating costs)

%DQNV E\ WRWDO DVVHWV $YHUDJH

OHVV WKDQ
� WULOOLRQ

IURP
����� WULOOLRQ
WR � WULOOLRQ

IURP
����� WULOOLRQ
WR �� WULOOLRQ

RYHU �� WULOOLRQ VLPSOH ZHLJKWHG

0RGLILFDWLRQ RI H[LVWLQJ SURFHGXUHV � � ����� ����� ���� ���� ���� ����

2XWVRXUFLQJ� LQFUHDVHG IHHV RU FRVW RI
VKLIW WR RXWVRXUFLQJ � � � � � � � � � � � � � ���� ���� ���� ���� ���� ����

6XEVWDQWLDO UHQRYDWLRQ � � � � � � � � � � � � ���� ����� ����� ���� ���� ����

$YHUDJH � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � � ���� ���� ���� ���� ���� ����

The cost figure does not include some large
banks with in-house EDP centres, 26 per cent of
which say they have not yet completed their
evaluations, and 41 per cent of banks that outsource
their data processing operations, which have
reported that they either do not yet know what the
increase in costs will be or do not forecast an increase
in fees.

For all banks, the majority of costs have been
allocated to the profit and loss account for the current
financial year and, to a lesser extent, that for 1999
(Table 3).

Banks with in-house EDP centres report that 65
per cent of costs are associated with adjustments for
the euro, 18 per cent with the Year 2000 problem and
the remaining 17 per cent with the implementation
of new functions or improvements.

These banks have divided the costs of
modifications between internal resources (24 per
cent), external resources (26 per cent) and the
acquisition and upgrading of software packages (49
per cent).

Divided by operational phase, 18 per cent of
costs are imputed to analysis, 43 per cent to
renovation and 38 per cent to testing.

Banking procedures absorb the largest portion of
resources (60 per cent), while management and
control procedures account for 21 per cent and
interbank applications for 18 per cent.

Non-EDP spending includes staff training (46
per cent), customer information (22 per cent) and
sundry expenditure on forms and other items (31 per
cent).

Table 3
Distribution of costs by type and year for banks with in--house EDP centres

(percentages)

���� ���� ���� ���� ���� ���� 7RWDO
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6. Risk assessment

The euro and Year 2000 projects have had a
significant impact on the growth of bank automation
in recent years: 30 per cent of banks with in-house
EDP centres report having postponed other planned
projects.

Only 30 per cent of banks express concern about
a shortage of information technology resources: it is
possible that the difficulties that could arise are not
yet fully appreciated.

As regards risk control, 58 per cent of banks with
in-house EDP centres and 63 per cent of those using
outsourcing have assessed the operating risk they
face; 30 per cent of banks have evaluated the legal
risk deriving from possible legal action brought by
customers over failed transactions or brought against
technology suppliers for delays in bringing
procedures and systems into compliance.

Most banks that outsource their data processing
plan to verify procedures even if their suppliers
provide certification of compliance, while 36 per
cent of banks with in-house EDP centres have no
plans to test programs purchased from third-party
suppliers.

Only a small number of banks have assessed the
risk of a transaction not being completed owing to
the failure of external non-bank systems: 9 per cent
have addressed the issue with their largest customers
and 24 per cent with providers of financial services.

Of banks with in-house EDP centres, 75 per cent
have made provision for controls in addition to those

normally carried out, while only a third of all banks
have prepared emergency plans.

The Banking Supervision Department is
following the issues raised by the adjustment
problems closely and will intensify its monitoring of
the process, in part by promoting initiatives in
collaboration with the various actors involved, in
order to prevent the risks associated with any
inadequacies or delays in adjustment programmes.

1 During the transition period until 31 December 2001, banks
will have to adopt the so-called duality principle, processing
amounts in both lire and euros.

2 See, among others, Basle Committee on Banking
Supervision, “The Year 2000: a Challenge for Financial
Institutions and Bank Supervisors”, September 1997;
United States Securities and Exchange Commission,
“Report to the Congress on the Readiness of the US
Securities Industry and Public Companies to meet the
Information Processing Challenge of the Year 2000”, June
1997; Federal Financial Institution Examination Council,
“Safety and Soundness Guidance Concerning the Year 2000
Business Risk”, December 1997; IOSCO, “Statement of the
IOSCO Technical Committee on Year 2000”, June 1997;
Board of Governors of the Federal Reserve System,
“Guidance Regarding the Federal Reserve’s Year 2000
Supervision Program and Possible Supervisory Follow-up
Actions”, November 1997.

3 CIPA, “Rapporto conclusivo del Gruppo di lavoro sul
cambio data anno 2000”, November 1996; ABI, “EuroABI
Blue Book - Strumenti per la moneta unica”, Bancaria
Editrice, latest update December 1997; Ministry of the
Treasury, the Budget and Economic Planning-Euro
Committee/Finance Sub-Committee, “Schema nazionale di
piazza”, 2nd ed., November 1997.

4 No replies have been received from banks in the process of
merging, some branches of foreign banks, and some banks
which advised they were unable to add any useful
information to that already supplied by their parent
companies. The missing banks account for 2.5 per cent of
total banking assets.
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Speeches

Address by the Governor, Antonio Fazio,

to the Association of Italian Savings Banks on the occasion of the 73rd World Savings Day,
celebrated in the presence of the President of the Republic

Rome, 31 October 1997

The revolution in information technology and
telecommunications, the possibility of transmitting
information and statistical data and transferring
funds from one point of the globe to another instantly
and at very low costs, and the complete liberalization
of movements have led to the formation of a single,
worldwide currency and financial market.

The opening-up of finance is a natural
complement of trade liberalization; it encourages
investment in the economies whose growth prospects
are enhanced by their abundance of resources,
especially labour. Freedom of capital movements
also fosters a better allocation of the savings of
countries with higher incomes and more plentiful
financial resources. Many economies have advanced
from backwardness to occupy a significant position
in world finance and trade within the span of a
decade.

The growth of economic activity and industrial
output in Europe has been modest, particularly in
the nineties. Continental Europe’s loss of com-
petitiveness has been a factor. The ageing of the
population is a brake on innovation and dims the
prospects of growth; demand for certain mass
consumer goods is stagnant; high living standards
translate into high production costs.

Organizational and institutional rigidities
diminish our firms’ ability to respond to international

demand that is evolving rapidly in terms of both
quality and quantity.

In the nineties the economies of continental
Europe have grown on average by 2 per cent a year,
a lower rate than that achieved by the United States.
Total employment has fallen in Europe by around 1
million, primarily as a result of widespread job
destruction in industry. In the United States
employment has increased by more than 12 million,
entirely in the services sector; some of the new jobs
are precarious and poorly paid. Industry has
succeeded in limiting the reduction in jobs.

The most striking and worrying aspect of the
labour market in continental Europe is the trend in
long-term unemployment, which has been higher
than in the United States since the mid-eighties. The
overall unemployment rate now stands at 12 per cent
in Europe, compared with 5 per cent in the United
States. Although the European economy does not
appear able to grow fast enough to ensure full
employment, the balance of payments shows only a
modest current account surplus; in the absence of
structural changes in markets, a return to higher rates
of growth will entail a rapid deterioration in the
external accounts.

The growth and control of financial activity

In the nineties the growth in international
financial transactions has far outpaced that in
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industrial production and trade, despite these having
expanded rapidly.

The enormous volume of financial activity has at
times turned from being a factor of wealth creation
into a factor of economic destabilization. This has
occurred where economies presented imbalances,
weaknesses in the macroeconomic fundamentals; in
some cases sudden large swings in exchange rates
have had adverse effects on the equilibrium of firms
and financial intermediaries, the currency’s pur-
chasing power, the prices of securities.

The events of the past few years, the close
interdependence of currency crises, the value of
money and the stability of financial and banking
systems underscore the importance of the functional
link between monetary policy and banking super-
vision.

While one major European country has entrusted
banking supervision to an institution other than the
central bank, the leading industrial country in Asia,
affected by major difficulties in the credit sector, has
taken the opposite course and given the central bank
stronger powers of supervision and intervention in
the banking system.

The new configuration of the international
financial markets, the enormous growth in foreign
exchange and securities trading, and the
intensification of competition have had major
consequences for the operations of national banking
systems. The squeeze on profit margins has
accentuated the weaknesses of banks already marked
by inadequate methods of risk measurement,
excessive costs and lack of strategic vision.

According to the International Monetary Fund,
in the last fifteen years around 130 countries have
had to cope with the consequences of bank crises,
some of them severe and extensive.

The authorities have responded primarily by
encouraging the acquisition of the troubled banks by
more solid and efficient institutions. Recourse has
been made to public funds where the stability of the
financial system and the level of economic activity
were threatened.

The public funds disbursed in the United States
to deal with the crisis of the savings and loan
institutions amounted to $161 billion, almost 3 per
cent of gross domestic product. In Norway and
Sweden the cost of intervention amounted to
respectively 2.2 and 4.2 per cent of GDP, and in
Finland to 9.3 per cent. In France the burden the state
and public shareholders will have to shoulder to deal
with the crises of major credit institutions is expected
to be around 1.5 per cent of GDP, or 40 trillion lire.
In Spain and the United Kingdom the costs have been
borne by the shareholders and the banking system,
without significant outlays of public money.

In Italy, the overall cost to the public finances of
banking crises in the nineties amounts to around 6
trillion lire, or 0.3 per cent of current GDP. The
banking system has contributed to the resolution of
crises through the Interbank Deposit Protection
Fund. The scale of the expense incurred by the
banking system suggests it is time to reconsider the
mechanisms governing the Fund’s operations.

The cyclical downturn and the structural
slowdown in growth have been a major factor in the
crises of the large southern banks by contributing to
the stagnation of economic activity in the region in
the last five years. The difficulties have been tackled
with vigorous restructuring plans geared primarily to
reducing operating costs, with changes in top
management and the entry of new shareholders.

The disbursement of public funds has been made
conditional on the adoption of corrective measures,
which are a prerequisite for subsequent sale. The
effects of the interventions have been seen in the first
half of this year with reductions - pronounced in
some cases - in personnel costs and numbers of staff;
gross income has shown signs of recovering.

At the national level, far-reaching changes are
taking place in the size of banks and their ownership
structures.

Since the start of the nineties the number of
banks has fallen by 237, to 939. The process of
concentration, which at first mainly concerned small
distressed banks, is spreading swiftly, especially in
the more highly developed regions, to profitable
medium-sized institutions.
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The Bank of Italy is closely monitoring the
structural evolution of the credit system. An increase
in the size of banks will allow them to carry out the
investment necessary to develop advanced banking
services. Rigidity in the use of the factors of
production and insufficient clarity as to objectives
sometimes impede the integration of different
corporate realities and cultures.

A notable contribution to the reorganization of
the system can and must come from privatization.
The completion of the initiatives under way will
reduce the share of bank assets held by the public
sector to less than 40 per cent, compared with more
than two thirds at the end of the eighties.

In the first six months of 1997 Italian banks made
net profits of 1 trillion lire, a decline of 1.6 trillion
compared with the first half of 1996. Total revenues
from traditional banking intermediation fell further
since lending rates came down by nearly one
percentage point more than deposit rates.

The effects of the decline in revenues from bank
intermediation were compounded by the continued
riskiness of assets. Allocations to provisions and
value adjustments, mainly for loans, totaled 8.9
trillion lire, an increase of 1.6 trillion compared with
the first six months of 1996. A large proportion of the
adjustments were made by just a few banks as part
of restructuring programmes.

Total operating costs increased despite the fact
that staff costs were broadly unchanged, as the
number of employees declined by 2.3 per cent while
unit costs rose by 2.0 per cent.

In the first half of 1997 the ratio of staff costs to
gross income was 44 per cent, about 7 points higher
than the average in the leading European countries
between 1993 and 1995.

The banking system can hardly sustain a
situation in which costs are increasing faster than
income.

The negotiations between labour and employers,
launched with the mediation of the Government,
have the urgent task of achieving the concrete results

needed to ensure the sound and lasting development
of the banking industry.

Every delay reduces the ability of Italian banks
to meet the challenge of international competition,
worsens the outlook for employment in the sector
and generates high costs for the entire economy.

The readjustment of the public finances

A stable, competitive and efficient banking
system is essential for the proper allocation of saving
to productive investments.

A lasting correction of the public finances is
needed to increase the share of savings channeled
into investment, both by firms to expand output and
by general government.

The downward trend of the ratio between gross
fixed investment and national income has become
more pronounced in the nineties. To varying degrees,
the decline reflects reductions in all the components
of capital formation: government investment,
housing purchases and spending on machinery,
equipment and transport equipment.

The large balance-of-payments surpluses
recorded in recent years have created the conditions
for investment to increase more rapidly without
jeopardizing Italy’s external balance.

Italy should achieve a balanced budget on
current account this year. In 1996 the public sector
deficit on current account amounted to more than 3
per cent of GDP.

The primary surplus will rise to 6.6 per cent of
GDP this year, an increase of 2.6 percentage points
compared with 1996. The increase reflects a rise in
the ratio to GDP of taxes and social security
contributions of around 2 percentage points and a
reduction of about half a point in that of primary
expenditure. Interest payments are expected to fall in
relation to GDP. General government net borrowing
will decline from 6.8 to 3 per cent of GDP. The public
debt will decline in relation to GDP for the third year
in succession.

Containing the budget deficit has been facilitated
by the ceilings placed on the drawings that non-state
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public bodies may make from their centralized
Treasury accounts and central government spending
commitments. In the short term these measures have
reduced purchases of goods and services and capital
spending. In the long term regulating cash flows
produces a permanent reduction in government
spending only if it induces greater efficiency in the
use of resources. If the tendency of expenditure to
expand is to be curbed permanently, there is no
alternative to structural measures that reorganize the
tasks of the various levels of government, increase
the efficiency of government operations and revise
the laws determining the services the public sector
provides to the public.

The target set for 1998 is for general government
net borrowing to be equal to 2.8 per cent of GDP.

Budgetary policy must be designed to render
permanent the results achieved in reducing the
deficit. If this occurs, the size of the primary surplus
means that we can expect a significant decline in the
ratio between public debt and GDP in the coming
years.

In a broader perspective, it is necessary to
address the issue of the size to which the budget has
grown in Italy. In the nineties, faced with an already
large public debt, the deficit has been contained
above all by increasing revenues; current
expenditure net of interest payments has remained
unchanged as a proportion of GDP. Total general
government spending is equal to 51 per cent of GDP
in Italy. Among the major European countries only
France has a higher value of this ratio; in Germany
it is 48 per cent, in the United Kingdom 40 per cent.

Demographic changes and the needs and
expectations of citizens have pushed up spending on
pensions and health care. In the absence of an
adjustment, it will rise in relation to GDP in the
coming years. Reforms are needed to safeguard the
fundamental objectives of the public social security
system: to protect the vulnerable and those excluded
from the productive economy and to ensure that
future generations will be able to enjoy the benefits
of the system.

A reduction in the high level of expenditure and
measures to improve its quality and composition will
foster rather than hinder the growth of the economy
over the medium term. It is necessary to curb the
expansionary trend of expenditure and the burden of
taxes and social security contributions, thereby
removing some of the barriers that limit Italy’s
competitiveness and economic development.

The lower competitiveness of continental Europe
is at least in part a consequence of organizational and
institutional rigidities, the high cost of labour and the
high level of taxes and social security contributions.

The Italian tax system is marked by higher rates
than are in force in other countries; they are not
matched by a higher level of revenue. The tax burden
is greatest for those taxpayers who meet their
obligations in full. A reduction in tax evasion is an
important objective. It would allow the burden to be
distributed more uniformly; looking ahead, it might
allow rates to be lowered. The results achieved over
the years in the fight against tax evasion have not
been entirely satisfactory. In recent years instruments
have been put in place to improve the criteria used
for the inductive assessment of income. The budget
for 1998 contains measures designed to enhance the
efficiency of the governmental bodies responsible
for checking and collecting taxes.

Financial flows and monetary policy

The first nine months of 1997 saw the financial
assets of households and enterprises increase by
around 7 per cent on an annual basis; the expansion
in the credit granted to enterprises and the public
sector was around 3 per cent, basically in line with
the forecasts and the growth in GDP. Italy’s net
external debt was eliminated.

The most liquid component of domestic financial
assets, consisting primarily of short-term bank
deposits, grew very rapidly, expanding at a rate of
more than 10 per cent and overshooting the planned
monetary growth. Managed savings also increased at
a very fast pace and were mostly oriented towards
long-term forms of investment.

Italian residents’ purchases of foreign assets
almost completely offset the surplus on the current
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account of the balance of payments and the inflow
of foreign capital.

Foreign investors’ purchases of Italian securities
were far larger than the net issues made by the public
sector. Against a background of favourable
expectations for the Italian economy, fueled in part
by the prospect of its participation in the Economic
and Monetary Union, these purchases allowed
domestic yields to converge towards those prevailing
in the countries with a longer history of price stability
and a lower level of public debt.

Most of the flow of households’ financial
savings has been channeled towards the international
markets, both directly and through specialized
intermediaries. Italians’ investments abroad are
likely to increase further in the coming years. The
outlook for the economy and the financial system
must enhance Italy’s attractiveness as a home for
savings of both domestic and foreign origin.

The developments I have just described are being
carefully analyzed for their implications for Italy’s
financial structure and the growth of its economy and
for their possible influence on the conduct of
monetary policy.

Internal and external stability of the currency is
the fundamental condition for the defence of saving,
its rapid accumulation, its profitable use in
broadening the productive base of the economy.

Monetary stability creates the conviction in
workers, employers and financial intermediaries that
increases in income cannot be achieved through
inflationary gains, which are inevitably at the
expense of other economic agents, but can only come
from increases in economic activity.

From the middle of 1996 onwards, the abatement
of inflation has permitted a steady reduction in
short-term interests rates. In the early part of this year
the decline in expected and actual inflation led the
central bank to attenuate the restrictiveness of the
monetary stance and thus encourage the financing of
the nascent recovery in production.

The firm management of liquidity has been
accompanied by a basically stable exchange rate and
a further fall in medium and long-term yields,
notwithstanding political and economic events, both
domestic and international, that could have had a
serious impact on these variables.

A number of factors tending to exert upward
pressure on prices and costs have emerged during the
year. Since March the domestic producer prices of
manufactures have accelerated, albeit slightly. The
upward pressure that the increase in indirect taxation
in the budget will exert on consumer prices is, in
principle, of a temporary nature; it must be dissipated
in the next few months.

The pressures must be rapidly reduced by
ensuring that all the aspects of economic policy are
consistent, especially budgetary and incomes policy.
We trust that the budget will be approved without any
impairment of its macroeconomic impact and that
structural measures will be adopted able to generate
increasingly large savings in social expenditure in
the future.

In such conditions we believe it will be possible
to proceed with the policy of reflation, thereby
fostering the convergence of Italy’s short-term
interest rates towards the level that expectations of
monetary union are engendering in the leading
European countries.
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Italy and Europe in a world of global finance

Address by the Governor, Antonio Fazio, to the Conference organized
by AIOTE, ASSOBAT, ATIC, FOREX, AIAF

Naples, 24 January 1998

The expansion of trade and the globalization of
markets have maintained the rate of growth of the
world economy at a high level in the last ten years.
The pace has been particularly rapid in the countries
where labour is most abundant and least costly and
in the industrial countries whose economies are
marked by a high degree of flexibility and rising
productivity.

The liberalization of trade in goods and services,
the improvement in communications and the
reduction in transport costs increase the efficiency of
the allocation of resources in the world. The gains
from trade, the new wealth created are unequally
divided among the countries involved; they also
result in a redistribution of productive capacity and
an increase in specialization and concentration.

The globalization of finance allows saving to be
allocated and managed more efficiently at world
level; it has made a significant contribution to
sustaining productive investment in the fastest
growing economies.

In the six leading industrial countries the volume
of financial assets rose between 1982 and 1995 from
$30 trillion to $124 trillion and from four to six times
their annual GDP at current prices. In the industrial
countries the huge rise in public debt contributed to
the increase in the supply of financial instruments.
Stock markets have grown very rapidly in recent
years, especially in the emerging countries. The
activity of non-bank intermediaries operating on a
global scale and investing primarily in shares and
bonds and other widely traded assets has developed,
rapidly reaching a very substantial volume.

Financial intermediaries, including banks, tend
to behave according to operating models that are

based on the same theoretical paradigms; sometimes,
however, by reacting uniformly to important new
information or to changes in expectations concerning
individual economies, they shift funds very rapidly
from one economy to another; they can take
positions with very-short time horizons in foreign
exchange or securities of a size that heavily
influences countries with less solid financial
structures.

1. The Asian crisis

Foreign investment in the emerging markets by
banks and institutional and private investors rose
from $50 billion in 1990 to $240 billion in 1996.

In mid-1997 the foreign debts of eight emerging
Asian economies, including Hong Kong, Singapore
and China, amounted to $900 billion or about 40 per
cent of the area’s GDP; some two thirds of the total
was due to mature within one year.

The crisis, which has affected five countries in
particular - Thailand, Indonesia, Malaysia, the
Philippines and South Korea - is basically the result
of the persistence of large external current account
deficits ranging from 3 to 6 per cent of GDP and the
consequent rapid accumulation of foreign debt.

These countries’ budgets are generally close to
balance and their public debt is limited. The
disequilibria are attributable to an excess of private
and public sector investment in relation to the albeit
high rate of saving. The returns on investment
projects have not always been adequate in terms
of profitability and exports, partly owing to
inefficiencies in the allocation of credit. Com-
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petitiveness was eroded by the 40 per cent
devaluation of the Chinese currency in 1994.

Firms’ growing dependence on foreign loans,
denominated mostly in dollars, the preponderantly
short-term nature of the debt and shortcomings in
the supervision of financial intermediaries made
financial systems more fragile. The uncertain
performance of the Japanese economy and financial
system exerted a negative influence.

The crisis started and spread when market
participants came to recognize the difficulty of
sustaining exchange rates in the face of the sharp and
continuing appreciation of the dollar and
expectations of increases in interest rates in the
United States. The possibility emerged of heavy
losses by firms; growth prospects were scaled back,
with further adverse effects on stock markets.

It is surprising, in this crisis as well, how fast the
climate of opinion changed among investors; it
suggests a formation of expectations based on the
performance of the macro-economic variables only
in the short run and on the attitudes of other market
participants. The extrapolative nature of expec-
tations compounds fluctuations in exchange rates
and securities prices.

Once again there was a failure to make a
thorough analysis of the underlying conditions of
each economy. To be sure, the shortness of the
average maturity of the debt indicated uncertainty
among investors regarding long-term growth
prospects; nonetheless, until mid-1997 the flow of
capital to the area remained substantial.

Notwithstanding the interventions organized by
the IMF, the crisis deepened in December and the
early days of this year. The falls in share prices and
exchange rates against the dollar in the five countries
mentioned since early 1997 have reached respec-
tively 40 and 50 per cent on average; expressed in
dollars, share prices have fallen to less than one third
of the initial level. The markets, and especially the
stock markets, of Singapore, Taiwan and Hong Kong
have been caught up in the crisis.

Events in the markets and the poorer prospects
for the economies of the countries hit by the crisis
have adversely affected the already delicate balance

of Japan’s capital market and the quality of its
banking system’s assets.

The Chinese economy has not been drawn into
the crisis, owing to its initially strong competitive
position, relatively underdeveloped financial system
and the preference given to direct inward investment
over portfolio investment.

The volume of financing mobilized by the IMF,
other international organizations and the nations
working to cope with the crisis is without precedent.
The World Bank and the Asian Development Bank
have been called upon to contribute to objectives
beyond the scope of their respective institutional
mandates. Total disbursements of around $110
billion have either been made or are envisaged.

Banks will have to help in containing the effects
of the crisis by rolling over existing loans.

The intensity of the crisis and the fear of systemic
repercussions have produced a disarray in the
measures and decisions adopted that suggests the
present arrangements for international cooperation
are inadequate in the face of the challenges posed by
the globalization of markets.

2. International monetary developments

The backdrop to the Asian crisis is the persistent
problem of the uncertain performance of the
Japanese economy and the excessive burden placed
on monetary policy.

This situation is an inheritance from the Mexican
crisis in the early months of 1995, which led initially
to an abnormal appreciation of the yen and to fears
of a prolonged decline of the dollar.

The lowering of interest rates in Japan to near
zero led in the second half of 1995 to a fall on the
order of 20 per cent in the effective exchange rate
of the yen. The economy did not benefit sufficiently
in terms of growth, while the imbalance associated
with Japan’s large external credit position was
aggravated. The weakness of the exchange rate
tended to depress share prices, thereby contributing
to the contraction in domestic bank credit.

Fiscal policy, even after the recent an-
nouncement of a small reduction in taxation,
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continues to be directed towards the undeniably
desirable objective of containing the public debt in
the long term. A further reduction in the budget
deficit is expected in 1998; there does not appear
to be sufficient concern about the deflationary
implications of this course in the short term.

The measures now before the Japanese
Parliament provide for a limited stimulus to domestic
demand based on tax reductions that should amount
to around half a percentage point of GDP. The
package also includes a plan for shoring up and
rescuing the financial and banking system involving
very substantial resources, some $240 billion or 6 per
cent of GDP.

The long period of expansionary monetary
policy in Japan, especially from the spring of 1995
onwards, has substantially increased the supply of
yen and lowered the cost of yen financing. Japanese
banks have considerably increased their supply of
credit to international markets; their external
liabilities have fallen substantially and they have
become large net creditors.

The expansion in the credit provided by the
Japanese banking system has occurred in a period
which has been marked by a very large US current
account deficit, at present on the order of $180
billion a year, coupled with a persistently high level
of direct investment abroad by American firms. The
relatively slack economic conditions in most of the
industrial countries made it easier to finance the
external deficits of the countries affected by the
crisis.

In a context of low inflation, both actual and
expected, the supply of money at very low interest
rates has been reflected in long-term yields in Japan
and the other leading markets. The yields on
long-term Japanese securities fell to 2.1 per cent in
1997. Japanese overseas portfolio investment
amounted to more than $80 billion in 1994 and 1995,
twice the level of the preceding years; it rose further
in 1996 and the early part of 1997; around one fifth
of the outflow goes directly to the US market.

Foreign investment in US securities amounted to
more than $300 billion in 1996, an increase of 50 per
cent on 1994 and 1995; compared with three years

earlier it more than doubled. Annual disinvestment
is on the order of $100 billion. The yield on ten-year
US securities fell from 6.4 per cent in 1996 to 5.8 per
cent at the end of 1997.

The European financial system also received
much larger portfolio investment inflows in 1996
and 1997 than in the preceding years. More than
$200 billion flowed into Germany in 1996,
compared with $125 billion in 1995 and $76 billion
in 1994. In 1997 the yields on medium-term
securities fell faster in Germany than in the United
States, reaching 5.3 per cent.

In some respects the abundance of liquidity in the
international market appears to be a replay of the
situation in the early nineties, up to the beginning of
1994, following the prolonged US monetary
expansion. The Federal Reserve held short-term
rates close to 3 per cent for nearly two years. In these
circumstances the yields on medium and long-term
securities in the leading markets declined steadily
and substantially until the last few months of 1993.
Those on ten-year US Treasury bonds fell from 7 per
cent at the beginning of 1992 to just over 5 per cent
in October 1993; the yields on German securities fell
from 8 per cent to below 6 per cent at the end of 1993.
The yields on ten-year Italian Treasury paper fell
from over 14 per cent in the autumn of 1992 to below
9 per cent in the early months of 1994, after reaching
15 per cent during the EMS crisis.

From February 1994 onwards, in connection
with the shift in the stance of US monetary policy,
interest rates rose rapidly everywhere; securities
prices fell to their level of two years earlier.

After the Mexican crisis, medium-term interest
rates declined gradually again in all the main markets
from the spring of 1995 onwards. Monetary policy
was tightened moderately during 1997 in all the
industrial countries except Italy and Spain. The
upward pressures on interest rates are now being
neutralized by the need to facilitate the solution of
the Asian crisis and the expectations of slower
growth in the United States.

The funds that have been withdrawn from the
Asian economies have flowed to the financial
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markets of the industrial countries, above all that of
the United States, providing support for share and
bond prices and the exchange rate of the dollar.

The yen has been constantly weak, but in general
outside Asia the pattern of exchange rates has
remained orderly.

On several occasions during the nineties the
Japanese government announced plans for fiscal
expansion. Although they were substantial, the
composition of the measures, their temporary nature
and incomplete implementation meant that they
produced effects of limited size and duration. The
Japanese economy appears to be dominated by
negative expectations for the medium and long term
connected with the prospective ageing of the
population. The large fall in property and share
prices at the beginning of the nineties created
difficulties for the banking system, which have now
been aggravated by the crisis of South Korea and the
countries of South-East Asia, which have close
commercial, financial and entrepreneurial ties with
Japan.

The way to overcome the impasse - given the
size of the Japanese economy and its actual and
potential strength in terms of productive capacity and
saving - appears to be to provide an effective
stimulus to domestic demand. Monetary policy, with
interest rates close to zero, appears to have shot its
bolt.

The plan now under discussion, if it is approved
by Parliament in its entirety, appears to be on a
sufficiently large scale as regards the rehabilitation
of the financial system. By contrast, the stimulus for
economic activity appears still to be small. More
incisive budgetary measures, possibly with short
time horizons, could improve the outlook for growth
in Japan without having adverse long-term effects on
its public finances.

The levels reached by share prices in the
economies affected by the crisis, in conjunction with
the stabilization plans drawn up for some of them
with the support of the IMF, mean that there are
likely to be profitable investment opportunities.

In the present phase the international economy
is exposed to the risk of systemic instability,
with consequent widespread deflationary effects.
International portfolio investment flows have been
of unprecedented size in the last few years; it is
necessary at least to monitor them and to some extent
to govern them.

A recovery in domestic demand and an
improvement in the prospects for growth in Japan
would also underpin the yen; they would bring direct
benefits for the Asian countries and indirect benefits
for the world economy. There is an increasingly
urgent need for a new comprehensive approach to
these problems conforming with the configuration of
global markets and today’s international financial
system.

3. Europe in the global market

Europe’s markets are increasingly integrated
with the international market in finance.

The international opening of the Italian and
French financial systems has proceeded apace in
the nineties. Germany had already been playing
an important role in international markets; at the
same time the share of finance coming from abroad
has steadily grown and the large net external credit
position built up above all in the eighties is
tending to diminish. The international openness of
the United Kingdom remains pronounced, reflecting
the presence of the world’s leading financial centre.

The recent monetary developments have had a
significant effect on all the markets of continental
Europe. The last three years have seen substantial
flows of portfolio investment into Germany, France
and Italy as well as smaller countries. The fall in
long-term yields, which occurred simultaneously
everywhere, has reflected the stability of prices and
the reduction in government deficits within Europe;
more immediately it is the consequence of the large
inflows of funds that have been a feature of all the
European markets.

Policies must be designed to maintain in the
European Union financial investments that tend to be
of a temporary nature. The small inflow of direct
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investment into some continental European
countries, coupled with growth in EU outward direct
investment, is a cause for concern. There is a need
to develop conditions of competitiveness and
profitability in productive systems that will attract
the funds of international investors on a permanent
basis.

The competitiveness of the financial industry in
continental Europe is relatively low. Costs are high;
the quality of the services provided is still
inadequate. Small markets and the chronic weakness
of some currencies have been a brake on the
development of a more modern financial industry
able to compete in the global market.

In 1996 the current account of the European
Union’s balance of payments showed a surplus of
$86 billion or 1 per cent of the area’s GDP. From
1990 onwards the external accounts of the EU
countries fluctuated between deficit and surplus
against a background of rapid growth of the world
economy and moderate growth of domestic demand
within the area.

The limited increase in output, the steady decline
in industrial employment and the rise in
unemployment are indicators of insufficient
competitiveness with respect to the rest of the world.
The markets for goods and above all the market for
labour are more rigid in continental Europe; unit
labour costs in industry are comparable with those of
the United States and Japan, but much higher than
those of newly industrialized countries in Asia, Latin
America and eastern Europe. The tax burden, and
especially that relative to employee workers, is high.

Population ageing will profoundly alter the
balance between the economically active and
inactive members of society. The low level of
economic growth depresses the propensity to invest.

The prospect of economic and monetary union
has forced European countries to take determined
action to put their public finances back on a sound
footing. To a large extent the effort required to adjust
budget deficits has been made. A high degree of
monetary stability has been restored. In several
cases, however, the tax burden has increased further.

Monetary stability is the primary objective of the
unification; it serves to create conditions conducive
to investment and growth.

The parameters for government deficits and
public debts are playing a key role in achieving
monetary stability in the area; they were nonetheless
conceived in a context in which the implications of
the globalization of commerce and finance were still
not sufficiently clear; it is also necessary to try and
reduce the burden on the economy of some items of
the public finances and the ratio of taxes and social
security contributions to GDP.

To seek to enhance the Union’s competitiveness
through the exchange rate would be in contrast with
the objective of monetary stability. Competitiveness
is in the first place a reflection of the share of
resources absorbed - directly in the form of wages,
indirectly via some items of public expenditure - by
labour. It must therefore be enhanced through a cost
of labour, a flexibility in its use and a level of direct
and indirect taxation that are compatible with today’s
greater international openness of the markets for
goods, services and especially finance.

Increasing the size and diversification of the
capital market can make a decisive contribution to
monetary stability and ultimately to the prosperity of
the economy.

Europe as a whole is a net creditor with respect
to the rest of the world. The creation of a single
financial market that is no longer segmented by
different currencies, in a context of price stability and
greater competitiveness, will offer considerable
scope for growth in the issue and trading of corporate
bonds and shares, and for the development of related
capital market activities, benefiting enterprises and
economic activity and supporting their extension to
world markets.

Looking ahead, the international monetary
system will increasingly be divided into three large
blocs: those of the dollar, the yen and the European
currency. The currencies of smaller countries will
tend to be grouped around, and refer to, the three of
greatest importance.

The strength of each currency will depend on the
credibility of the monetary policies adopted. In the
background there will be a tendency for the
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productivity and competitiveness of the real
economy to take on renewed importance. It is
necessary to foresee a recomposition of the area’s
value added in the medium term at the expense of
more traditional industries and to the benefit of more
advanced services, especially financial services.

Important opportunities are opening up for
Italian and European operators that they must
succeed in grasping by updating strategies and
professional skills and by correctly assessing the
related risks through the application of more
advanced and complete models.

4. Italy

Italy recorded another surplus on its external
current account in 1997, on the order of 60 trillion
lire or just over 3 per cent of GDP.

Towards the end of the year the country’s net
external position returned to near balance. Some 470
trillion lire of net government liabilities vis-à-vis
non-residents (mostly short and medium-term lira
paper purchased on the Italian market, but with about
one fifth consisting of foreign currency bonds issued
abroad) were matched by net assets of more than 350
trillion held by the non-bank private sector, about
100 trillion held by the Bank of Italy and smaller
amounts held by banks and other financial operators.

The Bank of Italy’s gold reserves amount to
2,500 tonnes; in addition the central bank’s external
position improved from 51 trillion lire at the end of
1995 to 96 trillion at the end of last year.

Households and firms have converted Italy’s
substantial current account surpluses into external
financial assets. They first repaid foreign currency
debts taken on in earlier years and then increased
their holdings abroad. Their overall position in
foreign currency improved from near balance in
1993 to a surplus of more than 200 trillion lire last
September.

Capital outflows in the form of portfolio
investment increased from a monthly average of 4.5
trillion lire in 1996 to one of about 9 trillion last

year. This reflects a propensity for portfolio
diversification aimed at achieving a better
combination of risk and return, a process that is
structural and that is bound to become more
pronounced over the next few years. Increasingly,
these outflows are being channeled through Italian
and foreign intermediaries specialized in asset
management.

Despite the large volume of capital outflows in
1997, the net supply of foreign currency in exchange
for lire remained very substantially positive,
enabling the Bank of Italy to achieve the build-up in
its foreign exchange reserves referred to earlier at
stable exchange rates.

The supply of foreign currency derived not only
from the trade surplus but also from a large volume
of inward portfolio investment by institutional
investors, banks and private operators. In response to
more favourable domestic conditions and abundant
international liquidity, the foreign investors
continued to make very large purchases in 1997: 118
trillion lire, in line with the previous year. At the
same time, the improved climate of confidence was
reflected in a sharp reduction in the share of
purchases foreign investors financed in lire in order
to hedge the exchange risk.

Net purchases of Italian government securities
by non-residents exceeded issues by a wide margin.
The economy’s regained credibility, the prospects for
the consolidation of the public finances, low inflation
and the upward trend in bond prices encouraged
investment and accentuated the decline in yields on
medium and long-term securities, which are now
comparable to those in the markets with the most
stable currencies.

Italian savers directed the bulk of their
investment to the various forms of managed savings;
through this channel they increased their purchases
of foreign assets and Italian shares. Problems may
arise in this connection with respect to the risks that
households and firms may sometimes run with this
new configuration of their portfolios. The declining
yields on Italian government paper and the lower
liquidity of these alternative instruments also
strengthened the demand for money, and in particular
for current account deposits.
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The climate of confidence that has prevailed in
the markets has also been reflected in the surge in
share prices, which has continued even after the
outbreak of the Asian crisis. Financial conditions
facilitated major privatizations of public sector
banks, coupled with their recapitalization, along
lines we had frequently suggested.

Economic activity remained weak in the first half
of 1997, bearing out the forecasts we made at the end
of 1996 and early last year. In 1997 the growth in
GDP, which had been a disappointing 0.7 per cent in
1996, would have been just over 1 per cent.
Incentives for the purchase of consumer durables
stimulated economic activity despite the further
fiscal tightening and permitted annual growth
estimated at about 1.5 per cent.

Investment in plant and machinery has shown
signs of picking up, partly in response to favourable
conditions in Europe; by contrast, the construction
sector continues to stagnate.

The situation with regard to employment is not
improving, however; in fact, in the more depressed
regions it is deteriorating further. Growth in
consumer spending is still hesitant, owing to the
uncertain prospects for employment and the slow
increase in households’ income.

Monetary policy has continued to be firmly
directed to stabilizing inflation.

Consumer price inflation fell below 1.5 per cent
on a seasonally adjusted annual basis in the second
half of 1996 and remained at that level until the
summer of 1997. In the fourth quarter of last year it
rose to around 2 per cent, reflecting the upturn in
producer prices that had occurred in the second
quarter.

The expectations regarding inflation have
improved continuously and now indicate a rate of 2
per cent for 1998 and 1999.

The lowering of official interest rates from the
middle of 1996 onwards was calibrated in relation to
actual and expected inflation and the outlook for the
adjustment of the public finances, the condition for

a lasting return to stability, with constant attention to
the changes in residents’ portfolios and the inflows
of foreign capital.

We have kept the exchange rate consistent with
the lira’s central parity, with no need for support
intervention in the moments of tension of
international origin or related to domestic political
developments.

The reduction in the official rates, the discount
rate and the rate on advances, decided at the end of
last year is helping to sustain conditions that, thanks
in part to the good performance of exports, are likely
to foster investment. The growth in GDP in 1998
could exceed 2 per cent.

Italy is still faced with difficulties that will have
to be overcome, thereby laying the foundations for
improvements tomorrow; there is a need for
behaviour and policies that will ensure the saving
available is used to strengthen productive investment
at home. Over the last five years direct investment by
Italian firms expanded substantially; the inflow
remained virtually unchanged; the balance showed a
deficit of 30 trillion lire.

The quest for higher profits in a climate of
renewed confidence in stability and economic
growth can be directed towards expanding the scale
of production and investment, with a view to creating
employment.

Wage moderation must be maintained, thereby
permitting a reduction in unit labour costs; the albeit
limited pressure on prices - particularly producer
prices - must not be allowed to increase.

Last year saw substantial progress towards the
consolidation of the public finances. On the basis of
the latest data, general government net borrowing
should be less than 3 per cent of GDP. A start has
been made on reforms aimed at improving the
working of the public administration and
rationalizing the tax system. Cuts have been made in
some expenditure items and transfers to non-state
public bodies reduced.

What is needed now is action of a structural
nature to consolidate the results achieved. Public
services must be made more efficient and provide
effective support for productive activity.
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There is a manifest need for flexible formulas in
the use of labour that will enhance its productivity.
Unit labour costs must be brought down substantially
in the less developed regions, where both youth
unemployment and the underground economy are
present on a large and growing scale and where the
labour force participation rate, particularly among
women, is very low. It is indispensable to eliminate
the rigidities in the economic relations between
employers and employees, which prevent wages and
salaries and other contractual conditions from
adjusting to the level of productivity and the demand
for labour. Excessively high labour costs lead to
forms of hidden employment; they prevent most
young people from embarking on a career in the
regular economy and, together with high tax rates,
give rise to evasion of abnormal proportions.

A lack of effective demand is increasingly
evident. A low level of investment is common to all
the European economies; it lies at the root of the
decline in employment in certain sectors and the rise
in unemployment. It is serious in the more depressed
regions, particularly in southern Italy; together with
high labour costs, the fall in private and public sector
investment is adversely affecting the economic and
productive fabric. Appropriate policies are required
to restore higher rates of investment. Lower unit
labour costs and increased competitiveness provide
fertile ground for a recovery in investment.

I have spoken at length elsewhere of the potential
and actual availability of private saving in Italy. I
have endeavoured to show that a higher level of
economic activity and faster growth, combined with

monetary and wage stability, can accelerate progress
towards the lasting adjustment of the public finances.

The price stability that we have regained with a
monetary policy that at times has had to be extremely
rigorous, must be bolstered by a competitive and
expanding real economy.

By pursuing a stable policy from the summer
of 1994 onwards we brought the rate of inflation
back into line with that of the leading industrial
countries. Wage moderation, the drastic reduction
in the Treasury borrowing requirement in 1997 and
the weakness of prices in international markets
have helped considerably in the curbing of inflation;
as a consequence, long-term interest rates have
come down. These results, obtained through an
unwavering commitment, have made a major
contribution to the convergence of Italy’s economy
towards those of our European partners with a more
firmly established tradition of stability.

The months from now until the decisions
connected with the launch of Monetary Union, but
also the second part of this year, will prove especially
delicate for the entire system of European exchange
rates. In these circumstances monetary policy, while
it will continue to guarantee moderate medium-term
inflation expectations, is now focused more on the
stability of the exchange rate.

If economic agents’ behaviour is consistent, Italy
will be able to maintain the international position it
has so arduously regained, to the benefit of present
and future generations.
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The Bank of Italy and the ESCB. Legal convergence

Statement by the Governor, Antonio Fazio, to the Treasury,
Budget and Planning Committee of the Chamber of Deputies

Rome, 12 February 1998

The results the Italian economy has achieved in
the past five years are attributable to the combined
operation of fiscal and monetary policy and to wage
moderation.

In late 1992 and early 1993 the restrictive stance
of monetary policy prevented expectations of rising
prices, fueled by the decline in the external value of
the lira and the abrupt change in the exchange rate
regime, from translating into actual inflation. A
substantial contribution to this result came from low
wage growth and budgetary measures that impinged
on the structure of the main components of
government spending.

Conditions in the economy became difficult
again during 1994: the state sector borrowing
requirement was overshooting the targets and
demand was growing rapidly, with the result that
inflationary pressures developed. In December 1994
and the first few months of 1995 domestic political
factors and the repercussions of the Mexican crisis
on the foreign exchange and financial markets
aggravated the situation. Official rates were raised
three times: in August 1994, at the first manifestation
of price tensions; in February 1995, in conjunction
with supplementary fiscal measures; and in May of
the same year, when doubts arose about the curbing
of inflation.

The monetary tightening, the fiscal measures of
early 1995 and the stabilization of the exchange rate
had a positive influence on inflation expectations and
long-term interest rates.

Monetary policy maintained a restrictive stance
throughout 1995 and in the first half of 1996, with
the aim of subduing inflation expectations and
bringing the rate of increase in prices into line with

that prevailing in the other leading industrial
countries.

In July 1996 a start was made on lowering the
official rates. The reduction was prudent and
calibrated above all in relation to the decline in
expected and actual inflation. This approach resulted
in a constant inflow of funds from abroad for
purchases of government securities; by offsetting the
large outflows of Italian capital generated by the
need for portfolio diversification, these inflows
contributed to the stability of the exchange rate of the
lira.

The progress achieved made it possible for the
lira to rejoin the exchange rate mechanism of the
EMS in November 1996.

The caution employed in relaxing monetary
conditions meant that Italy’s financial and foreign
exchange markets were not affected more than
marginally in 1997 by the tensions that emerged at
the international level in connection with the crisis
in East Asia and the vicissitudes of some important
European countries or by those attributable to
domestic political developments.

Today the Bank of Italy’s reserves comprise
more than 2,500 tonnes of gold and foreign assets,
net of repurchase agreements, worth 82 trillion lire,
compared with 6 trillion in 1992. Underlying the
lira’s solidity is the return to balance between Italy’s
external assets and liabilities.

At the end of 1992 Italy had external claims of
600 trillion lire and external liabilities amounting to
770 trillion. The net debt of 170 trillion was equal to
11 per cent of GDP. Thanks to the succession of
surpluses recorded on the current account of the
balance of payments, at the end of 1997 Italy’s
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overall net external position was once more broadly
in balance.

Last September some 470 trillion lire of
government foreign debt, consisting mostly of
government securities held by non-residents, were
matched by net external assets of more than 350
trillion held by the non-bank private sector, about
100 trillion held by the Bank of Italy and smaller
amounts held by banks and other financial operators.

The Bank of Italy and the European System of
Central Banks

It has been agreed within the Community that the
decisions concerning the start of monetary union —
in particular, those involving the countries that will
adopt the single currency from the start — will be
taken in the early part of the month of May.

With the introduction of the single currency, the
task of formulating monetary policy will be
transferred to the European System of Central Banks,
comprising the central banks of all the participating
countries and the European Central Bank.

The Treaty establishing the European
Community, as amended at Maastricht, provides a
broad outline of the internal organization of the
ESCB. The preparatory work carried out by the
European Monetary Institute since the signing of the
Treaty has focused on these aspects.

The national central banks will be entrusted with
the task of implementing within each country the
monetary policy decided at the Community level.

The central banks of the participating countries
will continue to be responsible for all the functions
entrusted to them under national laws; in Italy these
include banking supervision, the supervision of
markets, the safeguarding of competition in the
credit market and, jointly with the European Central
Bank, oversight of the payments system.

The systemic crises in foreign markets have
strengthened the view that banking supervision

complements monetary policy in determining
conditions of stability in financial and credit markets.

The primary objective of the common monetary
policy is price stability. The mandate, clear and
unequivocal, given to the European System of
Central Banks is based on two tenets held by the
drafters of the Treaty: that the stability of the value
of money is a public good which does not hinder, but
rather fosters, sustainable growth of the real
economy; and that maintaining stability depends
crucially on the operation of monetary policy.

The European System of Central Banks will
enjoy complete autonomy; it will regularly provide
information on its activities and report on them to the
other Community institutions. In particular, the
European Central Bank will be required, pursuant to
Article 109b of the Treaty and Article 15 of the
Statute of the European System of Central Banks, to
publish periodic reports on the activities of the
ESCB, with a description of the current and future
stance of monetary policy. The European Parliament
will be able to debate these matters and invite the
President and the other members of the Executive
Board of the European Central Bank to be heard by
its competent committees.

In particular, the need for a “single” monetary
policy will have to be reconciled with the principle
of “subsidiarity”, which has also been embodied in
the Statute of the ESCB and is intended to permit the
highest possible degree of decentralization in
operational terms.

More specifically, provision is made for a
division of tasks along the following lines:

- the decision-making powers in monetary policy
matters, especially with regard to interest rates
and compulsory reserves, will be centralized in
the European Central Bank. The ECB will
exercise these powers through the Governing
Council, comprising the Governors of the
national central banks and the Executive Board,
composed of the President, the Vice-President
and four other members. The Executive Board
will be responsible for implementing the
decisions of the Governing Council on a
continuous basis;
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- the operational implementation of monetary
policy will be entrusted to the national central
banks.

Each national central bank will thus have two
tasks: it will contribute, through its Governor, to the
decisions of the Governing Council; and it will
implement these decisions in its own country.

Operations in the money and foreign exchange
markets will normally be carried out by the national
central banks.

Within this framework, the Bank of Italy will
continue to carry out all the operational functions
that it currently performs. The procedures for
conducting monetary control operations will be
different in part from those used today; the draft
legislative decree currently under discussion in
Parliament is designed to permit the necessary
changes.

Legal convergence

The Treaty requires each member state to make
its national legislation, and especially the provisions
concerning its central bank, compatible with the
Treaty and the Statute of the European System of
Central Banks. In particular, the Treaty requires each
member state to ensure that its central bank is
independent from the government and all other
political bodies; the necessary reforms must be
enacted before the introduction of the single
currency.

Within the general framework laid down in the
Treaty, the European Monetary Institute and the
Commission have done valuable work in analyzing
and interpreting the relevant provisions and
providing clear indications of the criteria to be
followed in adapting national legislation to
Community law, not least in view of the need for the
latter’s uniform application throughout the European
Union.

The key requirements of central bank
independence with a view to a country’s adoption of
the single currency are:

- the task of pursuing price stability as the primary
objective;

- complete autonomy in the management of the
monetary instruments, interest rates and
monetary and credit aggregates, for the purpose
of defending the internal and external value of the
currency.

Some of the provisions of the draft legislative
decree are aimed at strengthening the Bank of Italy’s
independence, the essentials of which are in fact
already provided for in Italian legislation.

At a higher level there is the proposal of the Joint
Parliamentary Committee on constitutional reform
for the Bank of Italy to be given constitutional status
by affirming the central bank’s independence and
autonomy in the performance of its monetary and
supervisory functions in the Constitution.

The integration of the national central banks in
the European System of Central Banks is to be
achieved by linking the implementation at national
level of measures concerning official interest rates,
compulsory reserves and open-market operations
with the decisions adopted by the European Central
Bank.

It is important to stress that, in conformity with
the Statute of the European System of Central Banks,
the participation of the Bank of Italy in the System
will not affect the performance of the other tasks that
it is assigned under national legislation, especially
those related to banking supervision.

The draft legislative decree contains the
provisions needed to ensure the compatibility of
Italian legislation with the Treaty and the Statute
of the European System of Central Banks. As well
as being submitted to the competent Italian Par-
liamentary committees, it has been submitted, as
required, to the European Monetary Institute for its
opinion. The provisions guaranteeing the integration
of the Bank of Italy in the ESCB will mostly come
into force at the time the single currency is adopted.

The Statute of the Bank of Italy will be modified
in accordance with the legislative decree under
discussion. The Bank’s Board of Directors has
already approved the proposed amendments, which
will be put to the Extraordinary General Meeting of
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Shareholders to be held on 19 March; they will be
rendered compatible with the final text of the
legislative decree.

The amendments to the Bank’s Statutes will then
follow the procedure laid down for their approval by
the President of the Republic.

* * *

In Italy the monetary policy approach that has
been followed in the last few years, and will be
maintained in the coming years, is aimed at
convincing market participants, workers and
businessmen that increases in income can only be
achieved by expanding economic activity.

The action taken on the monetary front, of
necessity extremely rigorous at times, has made a
major contribution to the convergence of Italy’s
economy towards those of European countries with
a more firmly established tradition of stability.

The decisions that will be taken by the European
Central Bank will have the maintenance of price
stability as their objective.

Labour market, incomes and fiscal policies will
increasingly be the only ones available to promote
the competitiveness and profitability of Italy’s
enterprises, as well as growth in production and
employment. They will have to give renewed
impetus to productive investment. The ample
availability of savings, of which a large part is
invested abroad at present, makes this possible.

The revival of economic activity in Europe as a
whole cannot be based on manoeuvres to enhance
competitiveness through the exchange rate of the
common currency; such action would be in conflict
with the primary objective of monetary stability. This
will have to be underpinned by a strong productive
system, to be achieved by curbing budgets and taxes,
boosting investment and making more flexible use of
the factors of production. These are the indispensable
conditions for achieving faster growth and creating
new employment.
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The consolidated law on financial intermediation

Statement by the Deputy Director General, Pierluigi Ciocca,
to the Finance Committee of the Chamber of Deputies

Rome, 27 January 1998

The Bank of Italy is of the view that the bill
proposed by the Committee represents a significant
advance in the regulation of financial intermediaries
and markets in Italy. The proposed Financial
Services Law joins the 1993 Banking Law in
forming a modern legal framework for these two
areas, which are of key importance for the Bank of
Italy. The measures will enable the Italian banking
and financial industry to compete on an equal footing
with those of other countries. Both laws are founded
on the same principles: banking and finance as
entrepreneurial activities, international openness,
competition, self-regulation and supervision that is
not excessively burdensome and which focuses on
efficiency and stability as well as disclosure,
transparency and proper conduct; principles that the
Bank of Italy, with its different historical
background, has emphasized and practised over the
last ten years. The new framework delineates a
regulated competitive market, the key to growth for
banks and financial firms that are able to earn a profit
by offering high quality services while minimizing
costs. At the same time, the measures provide greater
direct and indirect protection for savings, in
accordance with the provisions of Article 47 of the
Italian Constitution.

In the area of company law, the Committee has
had to work within two constraints. The first is
contained in the mandate the Government received
from Parliament, which refers to Italian companies
that “issue securities in regulated markets” in Italy or
another EU country. The second is the fact that while
preparatory work had been in progress for more than
a decade in banking and finance, there was a very
wide gap between reality and any desirable model in
the corporate world; so wide was the gap that it

appeared advisable to proceed gradually, avoiding
sterile attempts to pursue narrow economic policy
objectives through a partial reform of company law.

The measures proposed in the latter area thus
need to be assessed pragmatically. Overall, they are
appropriate, marking a significant step forward in the
protection of “savings and minority shareholders”, as
specified in the enabling law. They are in line with
trends in the international financial community,
which a special survey conducted by the Bank of
Italy in London and New York helped to identify.
They reflect an underlying approach with which the
Bank agrees and which makes the reform of
company law proposed by the Committee coherent,
albeit necessarily incomplete. There will certainly be
other opportunities to address the general questions
concerning company law. Such action should be
based on the principle that competition and the
contestability of ownership, management autonomy
and the protection of shareholders and creditors are
objectives that should be pursued jointly and which,
ultimately, are not in conflict with each other. The
enabling law focuses on the third of these aims,
especially the direct protection of minority
shareholders with specific legal instruments. This
precise indication by Parliament was obviously
followed by the Committee. Greater protection of
minority interests is consistent with distributive
justice. It also broadens the market, increases
competition and the contestability of ownership, and
lowers the cost of capital. However, the key to
protecting creditors and minority shareholders is the
firm’s profitability, which is entrusted to managers
enjoying autonomy in a system that is efficient partly
because it includes regulated and competitive
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financial markets and is underpinned by good
company law.

It is therefore the Committee’s intention that the
three parts of the bill - financial markets, financial
intermediaries and company law - should constitute
a whole. In the case of company law, even where the
letter and spirit of the mandate have led to rules
providing much greater protection of minority
interests than is currently available, it is necessary to
consider the supplementary or mitigating effects,
serving to increase contestability and entrepreneurial
autonomy, of other provisions not only in the field of
company law but also concerning financial
intermediaries and markets.

The remainder of this statement is devoted to a
summary outline of the salient points of the bill. The
descriptive document submitted to the Committee
provides a more detailed analysis of the proposed
changes.

Market regulation

In the area of financial markets the draft bill
sanctions and completes the highly innovative
measures introduced with Legislative Decree
415/1996, which implemented the Community
directive on investment services in Italy.

Competition between markets, heightened by
financial globalization and European integration,
calls for greater entrepreneurship in the provision of
innovative financial services at competitive prices.
The Stock Exchange and the securities markets have
been transformed from public institutions into
companies limited by shares charged with managing
the markets and equipped with self-regulatory
powers.

A sharp distinction has been drawn between the
management of privatized markets, entrusted to
market participants, and the supervision for which
the authorities are responsible. The management
companies of the Stock Exchange and the other
markets have been given a role in the regulatory
process. They enjoy powers of self-regulation in the
areas instrumental to the pursuit of their corporate

purpose and may perform supervisory functions,
either within the scope of their own authority or
because authorized by Consob.

Self-regulation regards the admission of
financial instruments and intermediaries to the
markets and their exclusion and suspension, trading
rules and the disclosure of information on trading.
The manner of exercising these powers is established
in the market rules, which the management
companies submit for approval to the authorities.
The public supervisory bodies verify the consistency
of self-regulation with general supervisory
principles, which are aimed at preserving the
integrity of the markets and safeguarding investors.

Part of this framework is already in place.
Consob has approved the rules submitted by Borsa
Italiana S.p.A. for the management of the markets for
equities, bonds (MOT), derivatives based on the
Mib30 index and options on individual securities. As
regards government securities, the Ministry of the
Treasury - which has issued a framework decree on
the operation of the market - will approve the
management rules that MTS S.p.A. and MIF S.p.A.
are drafting for wholesale and derivatives trading.
The coordination between the management
companies (Borsa Italiana, MTS and MIF) and the
reorganization of the markets are being defined. It is
now up to market participants to choose the most
appropriate, least costly, most functional and
competitive arrangements.

Supervision of the regulated markets is the
responsibility of Consob, which may take over the
functions of the management companies in cases of
extreme need and as a matter of urgency (Article 88).

Partly in preparation for the establishment of a
single central bank for Europe, the Bank of Italy has
been formally made responsible for supervising
markets that are important for monetary policy:
markets in which the Bank has always taken a close
interest and in which the term structure of interest
rates is determined. These currently comprise the
screen-based market in government securities (MTS;
Article 98) and the interbank deposit market (MID;
Article 112). In view of the key role of the wholesale
markets for government securities in the public
finances, the Treasury Ministry has been assigned
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the related powers of authorization, regulation and
approval of management rules.

The Bank’s new supervisory powers will be
aimed at ensuring orderly market conditions, the
liquidity of trading, equal access for all
intermediaries and the efficient dissemination of
information for the proper transmission of monetary
policy impulses. In carrying out these activities, the
Bank will seek to minimize the cost of regulation for
itself and above all for intermediaries.

In addition to the day-to-day operation of
markets, the centralized management of financial
instruments and government securities will also be
liberalized. The function is currently performed by
Monte Titoli S.p.A. and the CAT system of
centralized government securities accounts run by
the Bank of Italy, which have custody respectively of
286 trillion lire of shares and bonds and 1,900 trillion
lire of government securities (nominal values at
31 December 1997). Liberalization will involve the
elimination of the monopoly on the centralized
management of private securities currently assigned
by law to Monte Titoli S.p.A. The Bank of Italy’s
share of the company will be disposed of gradually.
The Treasury Ministry is also empowered to regulate
the centralized management of government
securities, including the persons involved and the
arrangements for carrying on the activity.

The Bank of Italy and Consob are responsible for
supervising the management companies for the
centralized management of financial instruments,
with the aim of “ensuring transparency, orderly
provision of services and the protection of
investors”. The creation of a number of competing
management companies is not an inevitable
outcome, however. A structural link may be formed
between the two existing central securities
depositories (Monte Titoli and CAT), partly in
relation to connections between European central
depositories, which would counsel the creation of a
“single national access point” for the settlement of
cross-border transactions. For government
securities, the transfer of the procedures for
managing the centralized accounts should be
implemented over a long enough span to avoid
wasting the investments already made and reducing

the ability of the system to provide an efficient
service, which is important for the financing of the
Treasury. It is no coincidence that other European
central banks (in Belgium, the United Kingdom,
Greece and Spain) act as central securities
depositories for government securities.

The definition of the structure of future
centralized securities depositories should take
account of the forthcoming regulations on the
dematerialization of financial instruments, which
will be compulsory for listed securities and optional
for others. The regulations will be issued within the
framework of the delegated legislation provided for
in the law governing the introduction of the euro
(Law 433/1997). In countries where
dematerialization has been introduced by law
provision has also been made for a single centralized
depository.

The regulation of intermediaries

The need for a review of the legislation is felt
particularly strongly in the managed savings
industry. This is expanding rapidly but is threatened
by potentially tough foreign competition. More than
half of the 1300-odd investment funds and sectors of
open-ended investment companies (SICAVs)
operating in Italy at the end of 1997 were controlled
by non-residents.

The share of Italian households’ financial assets
under management grew from 10 per cent in 1990 to
33 per cent last year, when it amounted to 1,000
trillion lire, of which just over one third consisted of
individual portfolios. The proportion is nonetheless
lower than the average of 41 per cent for the G-7
countries.

The expansion in managed savings is basically
driven by a twofold process that has long been under
way elsewhere and which has developed in Italy in
the last ten years. On the one hand a growing share
of the flow of domestic saving (more than one third)
is generated by employees and pensioners and their
households. On the other hand a growing share of
this component of saving is being invested in
financial assets - deposits yesterday, securities today
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and tomorrow - rather than in real estate. The
financial wealth of these households today accounts
for about 70 per cent of the total financial wealth of
Italian households (3,500 trillion lire). Between 1987
and 1995 households’ financial wealth rose on
average from 37 to 67 million lire per employee
household and from 47 to 142 million lire per
pensioner household (see Banca d’Italia,Relazione
annuale, 1997, Table D6, p. 196). The comparatively
small size of individual asset holdings and the cost
of administering them directly, coupled with the
enormous scale of the aggregate total, make it
increasingly advantageous for worker-rentiers to
entrust their funds to professional investors.

The professional skills required to manage assets
on a collective or an individual basis are much the
same. Nonetheless, under present legislation the two
activities cannot be carried out by the same person,
but must be handled by separate entities:

- investment firms, banks and trust companies for
the management of individual portfolios;

- collective investment schemes (open- and
closed-end investment funds and SICAVs) for the
management of assets on a collective basis.

The range of products is limited, moreover, by
legislation that establishes in detail the various
aspects of portfolio management and the types of
collective investment schemes admitted, so that the
introduction of new types requires special laws.

The bill proposed by the Committee solves both
these problems.

The segmentation of activities is overcome by
creating a single manager (Article 34). Asset
management companies are to be granted the right to
provide, jointly and on an exclusive basis, individual
portfolio management services and collective
management services (investment funds and pension
funds). Investment firms, banks and trust companies
will continue to be able to provide only individual
portfolio management services. The barring of asset
management companies from engaging in other
types of investment services limits the risk of
conflicts of interest between managers and
customers.

The new approach brings the Italian system
closer to those of other countries, where similar
solutions were adopted some years ago: it also
anticipates the planned Community directive on the
collective management of assets under discussion by
the European Union.

The centralization of asset management
functions is also to be permitted for the management
of investment funds on their own. By abolishing the
existing provisions, under which a fund can be
managed only by the company that established it,
intermediaries will be free to entrust the promotion
and management of funds to separate companies
according to their organizational requirements.

The unification of asset management functions is
reflected in the authorization of asset management
companies; there is to be a single licence covering
the management company instead of the
authorization of individual funds. The technical
nature of the related controls is confirmed by the
transfer of responsibility for granting authorizations
from the Ministry of the Treasury to the Bank of Italy
after consulting Consob.

The distinction between management on an
individual and a collective basis is retained. The
element of trust inherent in both takes on special
importance in the latter. In the case of management
on a truly individual basis, it is up to investors to
define the contents of the management contract and
to participate in the choice of the types of securities
to be invested in. It follows that the control of this
type of activity has to consist primarily in rules to
ensure the provision of information to customers, the
proper conduct of business and the transparency of
transactions - rules that Consob is institutionally
empowered to establish and enforce. In the case of
management on a collective basis, instead, it is the
manager who plays the pre-eminent role; investors
can only accept the manager’s proposals or withdraw
by redeeming or selling their units. It follows that
prudential supervision becomes more important in
the protection of investors.

The bringing of both types of managed savings
under a single umbrella will make it possible to
stamp out the widespread practice of individual
management that is only formally personalized and
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to enhance the distinctive features of the two types
of service. The reduction in costs made possible by
economies of scale will lower the threshold for truly
individual management, while the ability to provide
both types of service jointly will allow
intermediaries to direct investors towards the one
that best meets their requirements. The broader
powers of supervision attributed to the authorities
will help to ensure that the distinction is maintained.

By entrusting the regulation of the collective
management of assets to secondary rather than
primary legislation - following the course adopted in
the 1993 Banking Law and Legislative
Decree 415/1996 (the Eurosim decree) - the existing
provisions establishing the different types of
investment fund are to be replaced by others that
delegate the definition of all the aspects associated
with functioning of such undertakings to the
administrative authorities. The related regulatory
powers are divided between the Ministry of the
Treasury (Article 38), Consob and the Bank of Italy
(Article 10).

The Treasury Ministry will be responsible for
defining the operating guidelines and key features of
the different types of product offered by open- and
closed-end investment fund management companies
and SICAVs.

Consob will be responsible for establishing the
conduct rules of and information requirements for
asset management companies and SICAVs, in
accordance with the principles of proper conduct and
transparency.

The Bank of Italy is given the task of regulating
the aspects concerning the management of collective
investment schemes’ portfolios, which is currently
governed mainly by primary legislation. The Bank’s
other responsibilities with regard to the prudential
supervision and the administrative and accounting
procedures of collective investment vehicles and
management companies are confirmed. This
approach appeared desirable in consideration of:

- the need to reassure investors that the risks
assumed by a fund are consistent with the nature
of the investment selected;

- the close relationship between the prudential
regulations applying to a fund and the stability of
the intermediary: even though the investment risk
is borne by the investor, a management
company’s failure to comply with operating
limits makes it liable for the harm caused to
investors by transactions inconsistent with the
declared investment policy;

- the fact that the majority of Italian management
companies belong to banking groups (35 of the 54
operating at the end of 1997). Episodes of
mismanagement in the administration of funds
thus risk affecting the reputation and, in extreme
cases, the stability of Italian banking groups,
which are currently going through a delicate stage
of transition with their profit margins squeezed by
fierce competition and high costs.

The separation of supervisory responsibilities
according to their aims applies to all intermediaries:
risk limitation and financial stability are entrusted to
the Bank of Italy, transparency and proper conduct
to Consob (Article 3).

The growing importance of banking groups in
financial business and the related need for stronger
prudential controls have led to the draft decree
providing for the consolidated supervision of
financial groups that include investment firms or
asset management companies.

Corporate governance

The new provisions of company law
undoubtedly mark an advance as regards the
protection of minority interests through the
introduction of forms of direct protection. The
amendments primarily concern: the reduction in the
shareholding requirements established by the Civil
Code for the calling of general meetings, the lodging
of complaints with the board of auditors and the
reporting of alleged irregularities to the tribunal; the
granting of the right to a qualified minority of
shareholders to bring derivative actions to enforce
the liability of directors; the appointment by minority
shareholders of one or more members of the board
of auditors; the application to extraordinary general
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meetings of new quorums designed to protect
“active” minorities.

The proposed amendments also aim at increasing
the effectiveness of the control exercised by the
board of auditors on the running of the company,
without its interfering in the merit of individual
operating decisions and without introducing
institutions such as the supervisory committee of
German law. The powers of the board of auditors to
obtain information are strengthened, as is the
cooperation between the board and the external
auditors. The inclusion of members of the board of
auditors chosen by the minority shareholders -
without prejudice to the autonomy and impartiality
of the board - contributes to the dialectic within
companies. The relationship between companies’
operations and their accounting records requires the
members of the board of auditors to exercise close
control on the adequacy and reliability of
administrative and accounting procedures, while the
testing of the accounts is entrusted to the external
auditors, supervised by Consob, thereby eliminating
the duplications that currently exist.

The amendments concerning the crime of insider
trading - renamed abuse of inside information -
increase the severity of the penalties and clarify the
behaviour that constitutes a violation of the law. The
principal offence involves persons “making use” of
inside information in carrying out transactions
involving financial instruments; there has to be a
causal link between the possession of the inside
information and the carrying out of the transaction.

The innovations concerning cross-
shareholdings, solicitations to invest, proxy votes
and shareholder agreements move decidedly in the
direction of promoting competition and the
efficiency of the securities market and the productive
system, and of increasing the contestability of
ownership.

The Committee opts for maintaining the existing
limits on cross-shareholdings. The threshold of 2 per
cent both for the notification of significant
shareholdings and for cross-shareholdings between
listed companies is confirmed as the general rule. It
is nonetheless proposed that, subject to authorization

by the general meetings of both companies, the limit
on cross-shareholdings be raised to 5 per cent.
Although this would make it less difficult to arrive
at industrial agreements by means of cross-
shareholdings, the limits remain more stringent than
in other countries (10 per cent in France, 25 per cent
in Germany). Priority is given to increasing the
contestability of control. The solution takes account
of the important role still played in Italy by the
holders of even small blocks of shares through
shareholder agreements and other forms of concerted
action.

The preference with regard to solicitations to
invest is to increase the information provided to the
market. The most significant innovations consist in
the lengthening of the duration of the information
requirements for issuers (from the time of the
solicitation, fixed in the prospectus, to the entire life
of the securities distributed among the public) and
the subjecting of unlisted companies with widely
distributed shares to the rules on public disclosure
and to the powers of Consob in matters of reporting
and on-site controls.

The new rules also provide for the elimination of
the existing exemption of offers of bonds issued by
banks where listing is not envisaged. The financial
instruments issued by banks for the purpose of
raising redeemable funds would thus be subjected to
the rules on solicitation, albeit in an attenuated form
to be established by Consob after consulting the
Bank of Italy. The existing exemption is based on a
provision of Community law which refers to the
existence of forms of public control aimed at the
protection of savings. Other countries - Germany,
Belgium, the Netherlands and Spain - have invoked,
albeit in different ways, the right of exemption
granted by Community law. The particular nature of
banking suggests that it is necessary to proceed with
great caution in assimilating the information
requirements applicable to banks with those
applicable to other companies. The Consob
regulation will need to be selective in determining
the requirements concerning the provision of
information on a continuous basis to the subscribers
of bonds and other financial instruments issued by
banks.
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The proposed legislation on proxy votes is
largely based on solutions put forward in earlier bills.
It is commendable for the involvement of minority
shareholders in the important affairs of the company,
for the transparency of the procedures for gaining
support, and for the possibility offered by the proxy
instrument of replacing managements.

In addition to removing the statutory provisions
that had placed quantitative and qualitative
restrictions on the use of proxies in the general
meeting, the proposed legislation sets out a
transparent and flexible procedure for the solicitation
and collection of proxies. It provides for solicitation
to be organized by one or more shareholders with a
qualified interest in the company (1 per cent) and for
associations of small shareholders satisfying certain
requirements to collect proxies from their members
by means of a simplified procedure and express their
uniform or diversified preferences in the general
meeting. The task of controlling transparency and
correctness in matters concerning proxies -
particularly in the solicitation and collection phases
- is to be entrusted to Consob.

The personalized nature of the cooperative sector
is eroded by its being subjected to the provisions on
proxies designed for private and public limited
companies. The Committee nonetheless preferred to
apply the rules in a general way to all the companies
listed in Italian and Community regulated markets,
including cooperative banks. For such banks, which
play an important role in the Italian banking system,
it would be possible simply to broaden the scope of
the existing civil law provisions governing the
representation of shareholders in the general
meetings of cooperative companies.

Consideration is also given in connection with
the regulation of proxies to the interests of
shareholders who do not intend to participate in the
affairs of the company, even by means of proxies,
and therefore prefer a higher and more certain return
on securities. The text proposed by the Committee
appropriately leaves ample margins of autonomy in
drawing up companies’ bylaws to the definition of
the favourable conditions to be applied to savings
shares in order to compensate for the lack of voting
rights.

The proposed legislation on shareholder
agreements is designed to increase the transparency
of the control of companies and facilitate the
replacement of controllers. It contains precise rules
on the public disclosure of such agreements (on pain
of nullity), establishes a maximum duration of three
years and provides for the right of withdrawal in the
event of one of the parties accepting a takeover bid.

The institution that more than any other risks
involving a conflict between the two fundamental
aims - the protection of minority shareholders and
the contestability of ownership - is naturally the
takeover bid. The risk appears more serious when the
legislation proposed by the Committee for takeover
bids is considered in isolation. If one leaves out of
the picture the powerful impact that other rules and
institutions in the draft decree have on transparency,
the efficiency of the financial markets and
competition, and hence on the contestability of
ownership, the solution with regard to takeover bids
is likely to appear to reduce such contestability by
providing “excessive” protection for minority
shareholders.

In 1992 the Italian Parliament passed legislation
that, drawing on the experience of most of the other
European countries, introduced the mandatory
partial takeover bid at the full price for the transfer
of the control of a listed company. The rules
immediately revealed serious weaknesses: the
complexity and hence the costliness of acquisitions;
major shortcomings, such as the failure to consider
concerted acquisitions; the excessive detail and
limited flexibility, which permitted frequent elusion;
the absence of coordination with the controls on the
ownership of certain categories of firm, including
banks; and the lack of powers to issue regulations
implementing the primary legislation, with the result
that the solution of delicate questions such as the
admissibility of raising bids, could be given only at
the level of individual cases. The linkage in the
existing law between the obligation to make a
takeover bid and the acquisition of control results in
the verification of the thresholds of significant
shareholdings being costly and sometimes
unreliable. The current partial nature of takeover
bids provides inadequate protection for shareholders
who do not have confidence in the new controllers.
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On the other hand, the obligation to pay minority
shareholders the full price increases the cost of
transferring control.

The text drawn up by the Committee provides for
a desirable and drastic simplification that results in
a high degree of certainty. The cases in which a
takeover bid is mandatory have been reduced and the
procedures for making takeover bids have been
removed from the scope of primary legislation and
made subject in large part to regulations to be issued
by Consob.

Under the proposed new rules, the total nature of
takeover bids serves to protect minority
shareholders, while the efficiency of the market for
corporate control is pursued through the
determination of a price that, with account also being
taken of market prices, is lower than that provided
for under the existing rules.

In terms of fairness, it does not go without saying
that minority shareholders have a right to share in full
the premium for the acquisition of the controlling
interest. The price paid for control is likely to include
the discounted additional profits that the buyer
expects better management to generate. This
explains why the institution of the mandatory
takeover bid does not exist in some advanced
financial systems, such as that of the United States.

The introduction of a threshold resolves the
problems associated with the difficulty of
determining the existence of control on a
case-by-case basis. It is necessarily a blunt
instrument since it is to be applied in a dual system
marked by a preponderance of companies with
highly concentrated ownership structures and a very
small number of large public companies. The
Committee proposes fixing the threshold at 30 per
cent of the capital (as in the United Kingdom and
compared with 33 per cent in France). However, in
view of the situation with regard to public
companies, it authorizes Consob to reduce the limit
to 15 per cent. These solutions are undoubtedly
reasonable but at the same time they are
questionable. Fixing a mandatory higher threshold
would increase the contestability of control by
widening the margins for acquiring shareholdings

without having to make a takeover bid; fixing a lower
threshold would have the opposite effect.
Analogously, the contestability of control would be
increased by a further, possible, reduction in the price
compared with that envisaged in the draft decree.

The obligation to make a takeover bid does not
apply to persons who acquire a significant
shareholding as a result of a voluntary public offer
to acquire the entire capital. If the exemption were
extended to voluntary partial bids, the efficiency of
the market for corporate control would benefit, at the
expense, however, of the protection of investors and
the certainty and simplicity of the law.

The other important innovations in this field
include the application of the rules to shareholders
who make concerted acquisitions, the introduction of
the right of the controller to acquire the remaining
capital mandatorily when it amounts to less than
2 per cent (known as squeeze-out), the admissibility
of auctions where there are competing bidders, and
the possibility for the general meeting to authorize
defensive tactics in the event of hostile bids.

Conclusions

In conclusion, the outcome of the Committee’s
work is positive.

The modernization of the rules governing
markets and intermediaries inherent in the proposed
new financial services legislation increases the
potential competitiveness, efficiency and
transparency of the Italian financial system.

The changes in the field of company law,
formulated in accordance with a criterion of
gradualness that takes account of the present
configuration of companies, strengthen the
protection of minority shareholders and of savings,
both through specific legal institutions and by
fostering the market and competition. The inclusion
of the amendments in the text of a consolidated law
does not mean that the solutions are final or preclude
the possibility of other reforms involving other
aspects of company law.
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Appendix

Statistical tables

The world economy
Table a1 — Gross domestic product, GDPdeflator and current account balance

”  a2 — Industrial production
”  a3 — Consumer prices
”  a4 — Producer prices of manufactures
”  a5 — Short-term interest rates
”  a6 — Long-term interest rates and share price indices
”  a7 — Interest rates on international markets and USdollar premium/discount
”  a8 — Lira exchange rates and the price of gold
”  a9 — Nominal effective exchange rates
”  a10 — Real effective exchange rates
”  a11 — Real effective intra-EU exchange rates
”  a12 — External position of the Italian banking system

The Italian economy
Table a13 — Sources and uses of income

”  a14 — Industrial production and business opinion indicators
”  a15 — Labour market statistics
”  a16 — Index of consumer prices for worker and employee households
”  a17 — Index of producer prices of manufactures sold in the domestic market
”  a18 — Exports of manufactures: average unit values in lire
”  a19 — Imports of manufactures: average unit values in lire
”  a20 — Balance of payments
”  a21 — External position of BI-UIC

Money, credit and interest rates
Table a22 — State sector borrowing requirement

”  a23 — Financing of the state sector borrowing requirement
”  a24 — General government debt
”  a25 — Monetary base (flows) and financing of the Treasury
”  a26 — Monetary base and BI operations: averages of daily data
”  a27 — Monetary base (stocks)
”  a28 — BI-UIC operations in government securities
”  a29 — Treasury bill auctions
”  a30 — Bank of Italy repurchaseagreements
”  a31 — Bank of Italy foreign currency swaps
”  a32 — Bank of Italy outright operations in Treasury bills: multiple priceauctions
”  a33 — Official rates
”  a34 — Interest rates
”  a35 — Bank interest rates: domestic fund-raising in lire
”  a36 — Bank interest rates: lira loans to resident customers
”  a37 — Principal assets and liabilities of banks
”  a38 — Banks: loan and securities portfolios
”  a39 — Banks: deposits and bonds
”  a40 — Supervisory capital and capital adequacy
”  a41 — Italian investment funds: securities portfolios and net assets
”  a42 — Italian securities investment funds
”  a43 — Portfolio management services
”  a44 — Net issues of securities
”  a45 — Issue conditions of government securities
”  a46 — Securities market: yield to maturity and total return indices
”  a47 — The money supply
”  a48 — Liquid assets
”  a49 — Financial assets
”  a50 — Credit
”  a51 — M2 and its counterparts
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Notes to the statistical tables

Table a1

Sources: OECD, Istat and national statistics.

The annual figures for the current account balance may
not coincide with the sum of the seasonally adjusted
quarterly figures.

Table a2

Sources: Istat and national statistics.

For Italy, see the notes to Table a14.

Table a3

Sources: Istat and national statistics.

For Italy, the cost--of--living index; see the notes to Table
a16.

For the United Kingdom, consumer prices excluding
mortgage interest.

Table a4

Sources: OECD, calculations based on ENI and Istat
data and national statistics.

Includes energy sources and products. For the United
States, producer prices of industrial goods; for Germany,
the figures refer to the country’swestern regions; for Italy,
the series refers to producer prices of manufactures,
extended to includeenergy sourcesand products.

Table a5

Sources: National statistics.

Official reference rates. For France, intervention rate;
for the United Kingdom, base rate; for Canada, official
bank rate; for all theother countries, discount rate.

Money market rates. For the United States, rate on
3--month CDs; for Japan, 3--month call rate
(uncollateralized); for Germany, 3--month bank lending
rate; for France, Italy and the United Kingdom, 3--month
interbank rate; for Canada, rate on 3--month prime
corporatepaper.

Table a6

Sources: National statistics.

Bond yields (secondary market, gross). For the United
States, 10--year Treasury notes and bonds; for Germany,
9--10year publicsector bonds; for Japan,France, theUnited
Kingdom and Canada, 10--year public sector bonds; for
Italy, yield on 10--year benchmark BTPs listed on the
screen--based market.

Share indices (1988=100). For the United States,
StandardandPoor’scompositeindex; for Japan, Topix; for
Germany,FAZ Aktien; for France,CAC40; for Italy,MIB;
for the United Kingdom, FT All --Share; for Canada,
composite index of the Toronto stock exchange (closing
prices).

Table a7

Sources: National statistics.

The US dollar forward premiums and discounts are
calculated as the differences between the interest rates
shown in theupper part of the table.

Table a8

Source: IMF for thepricesof gold.

Period averages except for gold prices, which are
end--of--period values.

Table a9

Thenominal effectiveexchangeratesarecalculated for
each country with referenceto thecurrenciesof 24 trading
partners. For the methodology, see the article “Nuovi
indicatori di tassodi cambioeffettivo nominaleereale”, in
Bancad’Italia, Bollettino Economico, no. 30, 1998.

Table a10

Sources: Based on IMF and OECD data and national
statistics.

The real effective exchange rates are calculated on the
basisof theproducer pricesof manufacturesof 25countries
(for Germany, the country’s western regions). For the
methodology, see the article “Nuovi indicatori di tasso di
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cambio effettivo nominale e reale” , in Banca d’Italia,
Bollettino Economico, no. 30, 1998.

Table a11

Sources: Based on IMF and OECD data and national
statistics.

For themethodology,seethearticle“Nuovi indicatori di
tasso di cambio effettivo nominale e reale”, in Banca
d’Italia, Bollettino Economico, no. 30, 1998.

Table a12

TheItalianbankingsystemistakenheretocomprisethe
operational units of Italian banks and special credit
institutions (branches in Italy and abroad) and the Italian
branches of foreign banks. The “External position”
comprises all claims on non--resident operators except
loansgranted by branchesabroad to local operators in the
currency of thehost country.

Thecountry grouping is that adopted by the BIS.

Table a13

Source: Istat.

Seasonally adjusted. “Other domestic uses” include
government consumption and changes in stocks.

Table a14

Sources: Based on Istat and Isco data.

The indices of industrial production are adjusted for
variations in the number of working days. The seasonal
adjustment of the general index of production is distinct
fromthat of theindicesof productionby economicuse; the
aggregate index may therefore differ from the weighted
averageof thedisaggregated indices. Raw dataareshown
for stocksof finished goods.

Table a15

Source: Istat.

The figures, which are not seasonally adjusted, present
major discontinuities, so that they are not immediately
comparable over time. From the first quarter of 1991
onwards Istat took account of registry data on the
composition of the population by age--group and sex in
determining the coefficients used to relate the sample
results to the total population. Since October 1992 the
coefficientshavebeen aligned with theresultsof the1991
census, updated on the basis of registry data. In 1992 the

second quarter survey was conducted in May instead of
April , whileadifferent questionnaire, implying adifferent
sectoral composition of employment, hasbeen used since
thefourthquarter survey (October 1992). At thesametime
amorerestrictivedefinitionof jobseekerswasadopted(for
October 1992 thetableshowsboth theresultsbased on the
old definition but the new questionnaire and the new
series).

Table a16

Source: Istat.
The table reflects the introduction of the new base

(1995=100), which replaces that previously used by Istat
(1992=100).

As of February 1992 the consumer price index for
worker and employee households excludes tobacco
products (Law 81/1992). Since then the percentage
changes between the indices including and excluding
tobacco products have been calculated using Istat
reconciliation coefficients (1.0034 for food products and
1.0009 for theoverall index).

Table a17

Source: Istat.
The table reflects the introduction of the new base

(1995=100), which replaces that previously used by Istat
(1990=100).

Table a18

Source: Istat.
Average unit values of exported manufactures in lire.

Each good isallocated entirely to thecategory in thetable
corresponding to the predominant economic use of that
good.

Table a19

Source: Istat.
Average unit values of imported manufactures in lire.

Each good isallocated entirely to thecategory in thetable
corresponding to the predominant economic use of that
good.

Table a20

The item “Change in official reserves” is net of
exchange rate adjustments and the revaluation of gold; a
minussign indicatesan increase in net assets.

Table a21

Thedollar balancesmaynot coincidewiththesumof the
component itemsowing to rounding.
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Table a22

The table shows the state sector borrowing requirement
on the basis of the definition of the sector that comprises the
budget and Treasury operations, the Deposits and Loans
Fund, the Southern Italy Development Agency
(suppressed in April 1993), the National Road Agency
(ANAS) and the former State Forests. To the extent that the
different natures of the two balances and the availability of
the necessary information permit, the changes in
accounting rules agreed with Eurostat in 1997 for general
government net borrowing in the national accounts have
been applied in calculating the state sector borrowing
requirement (see the notes to Table 23).

The Treasury borrowing requirement comprises the
budget deficit and the balance of Treasury operations. The
budget deficit excludes accounting items that are offset
under Treasury operations, loan disbursements and
repayments and settlements of debts involving state sector
bodies or which merely result in accounting transactions
between the budget and Treasury operations. On the other
hand, changes in the special VAT accounts are included,
together, as of 1994, with VAT refunds channeled through
taxpayers’ tax accounts. As of 1996, budget revenues
excludetheshareof thereceiptsof theexciseduty onpetrol
allocated to the ordinary statute regions. The interest on
postal savings certificates is included under Treasury
operationsanddeterminedonacashbasis, insteadof onan
accrualsbasisasin thepast. Theitems“Settlementsof past
debts” and “Privatization receipts” permit the
reconciliation of the total funding requirement and the
definition of the borrowing requirement currently used to
determine theobjectives for fiscal policy. Thestatesector
borrowing requirement is obtained by summing the
Treasury borrowingrequirement, thenet market borrowing
of ANAS, theformer StateForestsandother bodies,shown
in the table as “Borrowing requirement of ANAS and the
State Forests”, and the “Borrowing requirement of other
bodies borne by the government” (in practice, the
borrowing of the State Railways, excluding the part for
which the costs are not borne by the government). The
figures for the last year are provisional.

Table a23

The table shows the financing of the state sector
borrowing requirement (for the definition of the state
sector, see the notes to Table a22). “Foreign loans”
comprise only those raised abroad directly by the Italian
government and statesector bodies(including thoseraised
by the State Railways with the costs borne by the
government); they do not include loans contracted
indirectly viabanks, which are included under “Other”, or

BOTs and other government securities acquired by
non--residents, which are included in the respective
categoriesof domestic debt. The item also includesCTEs
stamped as being for circulation abroad. The subitem
“Current accounts” includestheTreasury’soverdraft with
the Bank of Italy, the Treasury payments account and a
suspenseaccount (thetwo latter accountswereestablished
under Law 483/1993) and the sinking fund for the
redemption of government securities set up under Law
432/1993, as amended by Decree Law 6/1996. The
Treasury’s current account with the Bank of Italy was
closed on 31 December 1993 and theoverdraft at that date
transferred to the suspense account. The latter was closed
in November 1994 following theconsolidation of thedebt
by way of the assignment to the Bank of Italy of 76,206
billion lire of BTPs issued under a Ministerial Decree of
15.11.1994. Thesesecuritiesare included under “Medium
and long--term securities”. Pursuant to the ruling by
Eurostat, a) postal savings certificates are included under
“PO deposits” at their facevalueat issue (previously they
were accounted for at their redemption value) and b)
“Medium and long--term securities”, “Foreign loans” and
“Other” include the corresponding financial instruments
related to operations entered into by the State Railways
with thecostsborneby thegovernment. Thefiguresfor the
last year are provisional.

Table a24

The table shows general government debt and its
composition (the figure for the state sector is shown as a
memorandum item). The debt (end--of--period data) is
stated at face value and that denominated in foreign
currency istranslated at year--end exchangerates. Theitems
“Medium and long--term securities excluding BI--UIC”,
“Treasury bills in lire and ecus excluding BI--UIC” and
“BorrowingfromBI--UIC” only includesecuritiesacquired
outright.CTEsthat arenot stampedasbeingfor circulation
abroad and BTEs are included in domestic debt. Medium
and long--term securities include bonds issued by Crediop
on behalf of the Treasury and the former autonomous
government agencies. The amount of these bonds is
deducted from the lending of banks to these bodies.
Mediumand long--termsecuritiesandTreasury billsdonot
includethoseheld by social security institutionsand other
bodies included in general government. PO deposits
comprise current accounts, net of “service” accounts and
Treasury paymentstomunicipalitiesandprovincesthat are
heldwith thePO. Postal savingscertificatesareincludedat
their facevalueat issue. Asof 1989, lending by bankshas
been based on automated prudential returns. Previously,
automatedprudential returnswereusedfor the“banks” and
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Central Credit Register data for the “special credit
institutions”. “Debt issued abroad” includes only loans
raised directly abroad and CTEsthat arestamped asbeing
for circulation abroad. Pursuant to the ruling by Eurostat,
foreign loans are translated into lire on the basis of the
currency in which the debt was originally contracted,
regardless of subsequent swap transactions. In the same
way as for the state sector borrowing requirement, the
general government debt figures for “Medium and
long--term securities”, “Lending by banks” and “Debt
issued abroad” include the corresponding financial
instruments related to operationsentered into by theState
Railways with the costs borne by the government. The
figures for the last year are provisional.

Table a25

Theitem “Foreign sector” correspondsto thechangein
the net external position of BI--UIC, net of exchange rate
adjustments. From January 1994 onwards the item
“Treasury accounts” coincideswith themovementson the
Treasury payments account; as of December 1994 it also
includeschangesin thesinking fund for theredemption of
government securities.

“Other BI--UIC operations with the Treasury” include
net redemptionsof government securitiesheld by BI--UIC,
the early redemption of government securities held by
BI--UIC, coins in circulation, coins held by the Bank of
Italy, postal securitiesto beredeemed, claimsin respect of
compulsory stockpiling bills, sundry serviceson behalf of
thestateandother BI--UICfinancing, net of banknotesheld
by theTreasury.

The items “Open market” and “Refinancing” exclude
thetransactionscarriedout inconnectionwiththeadvances
grantedunder theMinisterial Decreeof 27.9.1974andLaw
588/1996.

“Depositswith theBank of Italy” comprisecompulsory
reserves, collateral for banker’s drafts and free deposits,
including those of banks not subject to the compulsory
reserve requirement. Thesubitem “Compulsory reserves”
refers to the average reserve requirement in the
maintenanceperiod (from the15th of themonth indicated
to the14th of thenext). “Other items” comprisevault cash
and undrawn ordinary advance facilities.

The state sector borrowing requirement includes
settlementsof past debtsandprivatizationproceeds.A new
definition of thegrossstatesector borrowing requirement
was adopted in Economic Bulletin no. 24, February 1997
(see theChapter “ThePublic Finances”).

“Net salesof securitiesontheprimary market” comprise
total net subscriptionsexcluding thoseof BI--UIC (aminus
sign indicatesnet purchases). Theitem “Other” comprises
PO deposits, foreign loans, surety deposits with the
Deposits and Loans Fund, and bank loans to the former
autonomous government agencies included in the state
sector; thesecuritiesretiredby theTreasury areincluded in
this item with a positivesign.

Table a26

Average of the daily data in the maintenance period
(from the 15th of the month indicated to the 14th of the
next). Thefiguresfor “Vault cash” arepartly estimated on
thebasisof banks’ 10--day returns.

“Depositswith theBank of Italy” comprisecompulsory
reserves, collateral for banker’s drafts and free deposits,
including those of banks not subject to the compulsory
reserve requirement.

The twelve--month percentage changes in “Bank
reserves” and “Monetary base” areadjusted for changesin
the compulsory reserve ratio (For a description of the
procedureadopted, see thesection “Notemetodologiche”
in theAppendix to the Relazione annuale per il 1996).

“Repurchase agreements”, stated in nominal terms,
comprise those with primary dealers on the screen--based
secondary market for government securities.

Table a27

The figures for the stock of monetary base
corresponding to the “Foreign sector” are calculated
without considering exchange rate adjustments. This
aggregate accordingly coincides with the net external
position of BI--UIC, calculated on the basis of
end--of--period prices and exchange rates. For the sake of
accounting consistency, theabove--mentioned adjustments
are also excluded from “Other sectors”. Foreign currency
swapsare translated using end--of--month exchange rates.

The figures for “Government securities” show the
amounts acquired outright by the Bank of Italy; they
include thesecurities issued by theTreasury in December
1993 toestablish theTreasury paymentsaccount and those
issued in November 1994 under Law 483/1993 to
consolidate the Bank of Italy’s claim in respect of the
overdraft on the Treasury’s former current account. The
year--endfiguresincludeunrealizedcapital gainsandlosses
on securities. The balance of the Treasury payments
account isshown with anegativesign to indicate that it is
aBank of Italy liabilit y towardstheTreasury.The“Sinking
fund for the redemption of government securities” was
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established at the Bank of Italy under Law 432/1993. As of
1994, privatization receipts, which were initially recorded
in the Treasury payments account, have been recorded in
this account. As of 1995 the Treasury has drawn on the fund
to buy back government securities. Decree Law 598/1996,
ratified as Law 662/1996, provides that the fund may also
be used to acquire shares held by companies wholly owned
by the Treasury. In addition to coins in circulation, the item
“Other” includes claims in respect of compulsory
stockpiling bills, coins held by the Bank of Italy, and PO
securities to beredeemed. It also includessundry services
on behalf of the state and other BI--UIC financing, net of
banknotesheld by theTreasury.

As of April 1997, the item “Refinancing” includes the
special advances granted under Decree Law 497/1996,
ratified asLaw 588/1996.

For the“Uses” items“Depositswith theBank of Italy”
and “Other”, see thenotes to Tablea25.

Table a28

Thefiguresfor redemptionsincludeTreasury buybacks
of securities drawing on the sinking fund for the
redemption of government securities.

“Temporary operations” comprise finance granted to
primary dealerson thescreen--based secondary market for
government securities.

Table a29

Multiplepriceauctions. Pricesand yieldsareexpressed
inpercentages,amountsinbillionsof lire.Yieldsareshown
before and after withholding tax levied at 12.5 per cent.
Thosefor 3and6--monthTreasury billsarecompound. The
“Total” yields are averages weighted on the basis of the
quantities sold. Following the introduction of the
possibility of reopening Treasury bill auctions in several
tranches, as of 22 September 1997 the net yields are
calculatedby applying the12.5per cent withholding tax to
the amount of interest determined with reference to the
averageallotment rate of the first tranche.

Since January 1998 three--month bill s have not been
issued at themid--month auction.

Table a30

Multiplepriceauctions. Yieldsarestatedaspercentages
and amounts in billions of lire. The marginal yield is the
minimum allotment rate for purchases and the maximum
allotment rate for sales.

Table a31

Multiple price auctions based on the spread (forward
points) between the spot and forward exchange rates.

Theforwardpointsareadded to thespot ratetoarriveat
theforward rate. Yieldsarestated aspercentages, amounts
in millionsof German marksor USdollars; spot ratesand
forward points arestated in lire. The yields arecalculated
with referenceto thespread between thespot and forward
rates and to the Libor rate on the currency of the
transaction.

Table a32

Yieldsare stated aspercentages, amounts in billionsof
lire. Purchases are shown with a plus sign, sales with a
minussign. Themarginal yield is the minimum allotment
rate for purchases and the maximum allotment rate for
sales.

Table a34

The discount rate and the rate on fixed--term advances
areend--of--period figures.

The rates on foreign currency swaps and repurchase
agreements are simple averages of the operations
concluded in theperiod.

Treasury bill yields are monthly averages of the
allotment rates at auction, weighted according to the
quantities sold to the market. They are shown before
withholding tax levied at 12.5 per cent and thosefor 3 and
6--month bill sarecompound.

Tables a35 and a36

The figures are based on the new 10--day survey
introduced in January 1995. The sample consists of the
banks participating in the survey at each reference date.
Thepre--1995 figuresarepartially estimatedon thebasisof
theprevious10--day survey results.

Table a37

The annual data refer to themonth of December.

The figures for “Loans from BI--UIC” are based on the
accounts of the Bank of Italy. Those for “Bank reserves”
arealso partly based on thesamesourceand compriselira
liquidity (excluding depositswith thePO and theDeposits
and Loans Fund), compulsory reserves, collateral for
banker’s drafts and the deposits with the Bank of Italy of
banksaccepting medium and long--term funds.

“Securities” arestatedat book value. Owing to theneed
for uniformity with the system of prudential returns
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introduced in 1995, the data on loans for banks raising
medium and long--term funds have been recalculated up to
December 1994 to include overdue instalments and the
principal amounts of other instalments due and to exclude
the component of bad debts consisting of principal amounts
of loans still to mature; overdue instalments and the
principal amounts of loans still to mature have been
respectively deducted from and added to the item “Bad
debts and overdue and protested bills” . “Capital and
reserves” compriseownfunds, loanlossprovisionsandthe
subordinated liabilities of domestic and foreign branches;
from 1997 onwards the intraquarterly figures are
estimated. “Interbank accounts” include the liquid
balances on correspondent accounts. Interest--bearing
external assetsand liabilitiesrefer toaggregatesthat donot
coincide exactly with those included in the foreign
exchangestatistics.

For further information, see the section “Note
metodologiche” in theAppendix to theRelazione annuale
per il 1996.

Table a38

Theannual data refer to themonth of December.

“Loans” do not include those granted by branches
abroad.

“Other” securities refer to banks’ holdings of lira and
foreign currency bonds issued by residents.

Table a39

Theannual data refer to themonth of December.

The subitem “Short--term certificatesof deposit” refers
to lira--denominated CDs with a maturity at issue of less
than 18 months.

Prior to 1995 residents’ foreign currency deposits and
depositsof non--residentsdonot includethoseof theformer
special credit institutions.

In determining the data on average deposits prior to
1995, the average value of the deposits of the former
special credit institutionshasbeenestimatedasthemeanof
end--of--period data.

Table a40

Source: Supervisory returns.

Thedatarefer tosupervisory capital and to thesolvency
ratio calculated on asolo basis.

Supervisory capital is determined as the algebraic sum
of aseriesof positiveand negative items, whoseinclusion
in core or supplementary capital is admitted, with or
without restrictions,accordingtotheitem.Thetotal of core
and supplementary capital is then reduced by the amount
of unconsolidated equity interests in banks and financial
institutions exceeding 10 per cent of the capital of the
investeecompany.

Paid--in capital, reserves and provisions for general
bankingrisks— net of any ownsharesor capital partsheld,
intangible assets and loss for the year — are the elements
of core capital, which is included in the calculation of
supervisory capital without restriction. Revaluation
reserves, loan loss provisions and subordinated liabilities
— lessany revaluationdeficitsin respect of securitiesheld
asfinancial fixedassetsandother negativeitems— arethe
elementsof supplementary capital,whichisincludedinthe
calculation of supervisory capital up to theamount of core
capital.

Theregulationsgoverning thesolvency ratio requireall
banks,except for thebranchesof bankslocatedinother EU
or G--10 countries, to satisfy a minimum capital
requirement based on theratio of their supervisory capital
to the total of their weighted on-- and off--balance--sheet
assets, determined using weights that reflect the potential
riskinessof thedifferent categoriesof asset.

Thecalculation of theexcessamountsand shortfallsof
supervisory capital (“Excess capital” and “Capital
shortfalls”) is based on the assumption of a minimum
capital requirement of 8 per cent for all banks, including
those belonging to banking groups, for which the
supervisory regulationsprovidefor arequirement of 7 per
cent provided that the group asa whole satisfies the 8 per
cent requirement.

Asof 1995 thesolvency ratio figurestakeaccount of the
prudential requirements for market risks.

Table a41

“Foreign currency securities” include government
securities denominated in foreign currencies and Eurolira
bonds. “Other financial assets” include CDs, banker’s
acceptances and commercial paper. The difference
between “Total securitiesportfolio” and “Total net assets”
consists of other net assets (mainly liquidity). Rounding
may causediscrepancies in totals.

Table a42

“Foreign currency securities” include government
securities denominated in foreign currencies and Eurolira



$33(1',;(&2120,& %8//(7,1 � 1R� ��� )(%58$5<

bonds. “Other financial assets” include CDs, banker’s
acceptances and commercial paper. Rounding may cause
discrepancies in totals.

Table a43

“Italian bonds” include CDs with a maturity of 18
months or more. “Foreign bonds” include foreign
government securities. “Net fund--raising” iscalculated as
thesumof monthly flows.Theamountsshownfor “Banks”
refer only to the portfolio management services that they
providedirectly.

Table a44

Investors’ portfolios are not affected by repo sales or
repo purchases.

Theissuesmadeby thepublic sector in December 1993
include the 30.67 trillio n lire of BTPs and CCTs taken up
by the Bank of Italy in order to establish the Treasury
payments account. The issues made in November 1994
includethe76,205.8 billion lireof BTPsissued under Law
483/1993 to consolidate the overdraft on the Treasury’s
former current account with the Bank of Italy. “Listed
shares” refer to issuesof sharesby companieslisted on the
Italian stock exchange, gross of double counting.
Rounding may cause discrepancies in totals.

Table a45

Theyield at issueon CCTsis theexpected yield before
and after tax in themonthsthefirst couponmatures, on the
assumption that ratesare unchanged over theperiod.

The amount taken up includes the amounts subscribed
of issues restricted to the specialists operating on the
screen--based government securitiesmarket.

As of 1 January the new International Securities
Identification Number (ISIN) coding system has been in
force. Thenew codehas twelveelementsand uses theold
UIC codes. For example, the ISIN code for the 30--year
BTPwith UIC code36665 isIT000036665x, where“x” is
thenumerical control code.

Table a46

The expected yields of CCTs assume no change in
interest rates. Thoseof CTEsrefer toan investment inecus
andarethereforenot comparablewith theexpected returns
onlirainvestments.Theexpectedyieldsof CTOsarebased
on the assumption that the securities are not redeemed
early.

Thenet expected yieldsareaveragesof daily datain the
reference period calculated for securities listed on the
Italian stock exchange. The BTP sample comprises listed
securitieswith a residual maturity of more than oneyear.

The total return indicesarebased as follows:

31 December 1980 for CCTs

26 January 1983 for CTEs

30 December 1983 for BTPs

27 June 1989 for CTOs

31 December 1984 for investment fund units.

Theindicesrefer to securities listed on theItalian stock
exchange and are averages of daily data in the reference
period.

Table a47

For the definition of non--state--sector money, see the
“Glossario” in theAppendix to theRelazione annuale per
il 1996.

“Sight deposits -- Banks” comprise demand deposits in
lire and foreign currency.

The “Other items” in M1 comprise banker’s drafts
issuedby theBank of Italy andother credit institutionsand
current account depositswith theTreasury.

“Savingsdeposits” comprisesavingsand timedeposits
in lire and foreign currency.

The average figures are calculated as the monthly
averages of daily data, except for PO deposits and some
minor items, which are calculated as two--term moving
averagesof end--of--month data.

“M2” doesnot includebank CDswith amaturity of 18
months or more (see the section “Glossario” in the
Appendix to the Relazione annuale per il 1996).

“Extended M2” includes residents’ deposits in lire and
foreign currencies with the foreign branches of Italian
banks.

Table a48

For the definition of non--state--sector liquid assets, see
the “Glossario” in theAppendix to theRelazione annuale
per il 1996.

“Securities acquired under repos” include foreign
currency securities.

Asof Economic Bulletin no. 24 (February 1997), postal
savingscertificatesareaccounted for at their facevalueat
issue (previously they were included at their redemption
value; see the chapter “Public Finances” in Economic
Bulletin no. 24).
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BOTs and BTEs are stated at face value. Net repo
purchases are excluded.

Table a49

The table refers to the financial assets of the non--state
sector, net of shares. The foreign financial assets of the
non--state sector are available from December 1988.

All the stocks are calculated at face value, except for the
units of investment funds, which are shown at market
prices.

“Government securities” compriseCCTs, BTPs, CTZs,
CTEs, CTSs, ordinary certificates, CTOs and CTRs, as
well ascertificatesissuedby social security institutionsand
the Deposits and Loans Fund, 5% annuities and school
building loans. The item refers to securities acquired
outright; it excludes thesecuritiesbought by thenon--state
sector under reposbut includes thosesold.

“Crediop and autonomous government agency bonds”
comprise bonds issued by Crediop on behalf of the
Treasury andby autonomousgovernment agenciesand the
like. The item excludes thebondsbought by thenon--state
sector under reposbut includes thosesold.

“Other bonds” include bonds issued by public and
private sector enterprises and Italian banks and local
authorities. The item excludes the bonds bought by the
non--statesector under reposbut includes thosesold.

“Other financial assets” comprise the bank current
accounts of stockpiling agencies, the claims on banks of
social security institutions, insurance companies, local
authorities and individuals; bank current accounts of
agricultural consortia, enterprises’ surety deposits,
atypical securitiesand Republic of Italy issuesheld by the
non--statesector.

“Total financial assets” includedepositswiththeforeign
branches of Italian banks, foreign securities and loans to
non--residents.

Table a50

As of Economic Bulletin no. 24 (February 1997), the
part of the debt of the State Railways that gives rise to
payments of principal and interest by the government is
included in the item “State sector debt” (see the chapter
“Public Finances” in Economic Bulletin no. 24).
Consequently, it isexcluded from theitem “Financeto the
non--statesector”. Theitems“Statesector debt” and “Total
credit” are also affected by the change in the accounting
treatment of postal savings certificates (see the notes to
Tablea48).

“Short--term bank loans” and “Medium and long--term
bank loans” comprise loans in lire and foreign currency,
overdue instalments and the principal amounts of other
instalmentsdue; they do not includethecomponent of bad
debts consisting of principal amounts of loans still to
mature.

“Foreign loans” comprise foreign loans and bonds
issued by the non--state sector held abroad. “State sector
debt” is stated at face value.

Table a51

Thetablerefersto end--of--period M2. For thedefinition
of non--state--sector money, see the “Glossario” in the
Appendix to the Relazione annuale per il 1996.

“Official reserves” and the “Net foreign position of
banks” arestated net of exchange rateadjustments.

“Loans to the non--state sector” comprise the claims of
banksand theBank of Italy on thenon--statesector.

“Loansto thestatesector” comprisetheclaimsof banks
and theBank of Italy on thestatesector.

“Other items” comprise fund--raising repos, the
financing provided by banksand theBank of Italy to other
banks, the “Other sectors” of the monetary base, banks’
shareholders’ equity,andCDswithamaturity of 18months
or more.
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Statistical aggregates

Monetary aggregates

M1: currency in circulation, residents’ current
accounts with banks in li re and foreign currency,
current accounts with the post office, current
accountswithother bodies, banker’sdraftsissued
by the Bank of Italy and by banks.

M2: M1 + residents’ savingsand timedepositswith
banks, certificates of deposit with a maturity of
lessthan18monthsandsavingsaccountswith the
post office.

“Extended” M2: M2 + residents’ deposits with
foreign branchesof Italian banks.

Liquid assets: M2 + Treasury bills in li re and in
ecus, banker’s acceptances, post office savings
certificates, certificatesof deposit with a maturity
of 18 months or more and banks’ securities
repurchase agreementswith customers.

Monetary base:
- notes and coin held by the non-state sector and

banks;
- depositsof thenon-statesector andbankswith the

Bank of Italy, including compulsory reserves;
- banks’ unusedoverdraft facilitieswith theBankof

Italy.

General government1

- central government
- local government
- social security institutions.

State sector
- budget and Treasury operations
- Depositsand LoansFund
- Southern Italy Development Agency (until April

1993)
- ANASand the former state forests.

Deposits and Loans Fund

A public body under the Treasury, its resources
consist of funds placed with the post office and its
lending isprimarily to local authorities.

Non-state sector
- households
- non-financial corporate and quasi-corporate

public and privateenterprises
- financial institutions(excluding investment funds

and banks)
- insuranceenterprises
- non-state public bodies
- state railways, monopolies and telephone

company.

Non-state public bodies
- local authorities (regions, provinces and

municipalities)
- social security institutions
- some minor central government entities.

Private sector
- households, including sole proprietorships
- non-financial corporate and quasi-corporate

public and privateenterprises
- banks
- insuranceenterprises.

Total domestic credit
- bank lending in li re and foreign currency
- domestic bondsof firms and local authorities
- state sector borrowing requirement net of

borrowing abroad.

Total credit
Total domestic credit and foreign finance to the
non-state sector and thestatesector.

1 The reference aggregate for the excessive deficit procedure
provided for in the Treaty on Monetary Union.
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Statistical aggregates cont.
(Labour market)

Labour force

Employed persons (excluding conscripts) plus job
seekers (unemployed workers, first job seekers and
other job seekers who were actively looking for a job
in the previous four weeks).

First job seekers

Persons who have never worked or have previously
worked only in self-employment and have voluntarily
not worked for over a year and who are currently
looking for a job.

Other job seekers

Persons who declare they are of non-working status
(housewives, students and pensioners, etc.) but also
declare that they are seeking employment. This
category also includes unemployed persons and first
job seekers who plan to start a business but have not
yet the means to do so.

Unemployed workers

Persons who have previously been in employment
and who are seeking a job, have a job starting
subsequently or plan to start a business and have the
means to do so.

Under-employed persons

Persons working less than 26 hours in the survey
week owing to lack of demand for labour.

Unemployment

Unemployed workers + First job seekers + Other job
seekers.

Unemployment rate

Ratio of unemployment to the labour force.

Wage Supplementation Fund

A fund administered by INPS to supplement the wages
of workers in industry who have been temporarily
laid off or put on short time. INPS (with contributions
from firms) pays such workers up to about 80 per cent
of their gross standard hourly rate within a limit that
is currently about 60 per cent of average per capita
earnings. “Ordinary” benefits cover short-term
layoffs (up to three months) due to cyclical factors;
“extraordinary” benefits (up to two years) cover
restructuring procedures. In no case is the worker’s
formal employment relationship terminated.
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List of abbreviations

ABI — Associazione bancaria italiana
Italian Bankers’ Association

BI--UIC — Banca d’Italia -- Ufficio italiano dei cambi
Bank of Italy -- Italian Foreign Exchange Office

BOT — Buoni ordinari del Tesoro
Treasury bills

BTE — Buoni del Tesoro in ECU
Treasury bills in ecus

BTP — Buoni del Tesoro poliennali
Treasury bonds

CCT — Certificati di credito del Tesoro
Treasury credit certificates

CICR — Comitato interministeriale per il credito e il risparmio
Interministerial Committee for Credit and Savings (Credit Committee)

CIP — Comitato interministeriale prezzi
Interministerial Committee on Prices

CIPE — Comitato interministeriale per la programmazione economica
Interministerial Committee for Economic Planning

Confindustria — Confederazione generale dell’industria italiana
Confederation of Italian Industry

Consob — Commissione nazionale per le società e la borsa
Companies and Stock Exchange Commission

CTE — Certificati del Tesoro in ECU
Treasury certificates in ecus

CTO — Certificati del Tesoro con opzione
Treasury option certificates

CTZ — Certificati del Tesoro zero--coupon
2--year zero coupon Treasury certificates

EFIM — Ente partecipazioni e finanziamento industria manifatturiera
Shareholding and Financing Agency for Manufacturing Industry

Iciap — Imposta comunale per l’esercizio di imprese e di arti e professioni
Municipal tax on businesses and the self--employed

Ilor — Imposta locale sui redditi
Local income tax

INAIL — Istituto nazionale per l’assicurazione contro gli infortuni sul lavoro
National Industrial Accidents Insurance Institute

INPS — Istituto nazionale per la previdenza sociale
National Social Security Institute

Irpef — Imposta sul reddito delle persone fisiche
Personal income tax

Irpeg — Imposta sul reddito delle persone giuridiche
Corporate income tax

Isco — Istituto nazionale per lo studio della congiuntura
National Institute for the Study of the Economic Situation

ISPE — Istituto di studi per la programmazione economica
Research Institute for Economic Planning

Istat — Istituto nazionale di statistica
National Institute of Statistics

MIF — Mercato italiano dei futures
Italian Futures Market

MTS — Mercato telematico dei titoli di Stato
Screen--based market in government securities

SACE — Sezione per l’assicurazione dei crediti all’esportazione
Export Credit Insurance Agency

UIC — Ufficio italiano dei cambi
Italian Foreign Exchange Office
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